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Mormonism by the Light of Spiritualism.
—Origin and Early Progress of the 
Faith. ____

BY HERMAN SNOW.

In ita primitive stage the term Mormon­
ism does not seem to have rightly belonged 
to this religion. Indeed, all through its 
subsequent history, the term was not gen­
erally accepted by the people themselves; 
it was rather the designation used by the 
outside world. The " Latter Day Saints” 
was the self-assumed title of this people, 
the main basis of their faith not being up­
on the Book of Mormon, but upon an as- 

- sorted renewal of open communication with 
the angelic world, and of an exercise of the 
miraculous gifts of early Christian times. 
What the general public called the “ Mor­
mon Bible” has ever occupied a subordi­
nate position to these great claims of a re­
newal of the supernatural, and of a con­
tinued succession of prophets and seers of 
the latter days.

Joseph Smith, the first of this line of 
“Prophets, Seers, and Revelators,” was 
born in Sharon, Vt., in the year 1805 When 
he was about ten years of age, the family 
removed to Palmyra, and afterwards to 
Manchester, N. Y. Soon after, being now 
in the fifteenth year of his age, while the 
neighborhood was convulsed with a relig­
ious revival, young Smith being greatly 
exercised with doubts and difficulties upon 
the subject, and having prayed earnestly, 
in response to the injunction, “ If any of 
you lack wisdom let mm ask of God,” sees 
a vision, which it will be better to give in 
his own simple, and manifestly sincere 
language:

“ I at length came to the determination 
to 'ask of God,' concluding that if he gave 
wisdom to them that lacked wisdom, and 
would give liberally and not upbraid, I 
might venture. So, in accordance with this 
my determination to ask of God. I retired 
to the woods to make the attempt. It was 
on the morning of a beautiful clear day, 

■ early in the spring of 1820.1 It was the first 
time in my life that 1 had made such an 
attempt, for amidst all my anxieties I had 
never as yet made the attempt to pray 
vocally.

“ After 1 had retired into the place where 
I had previously designed to. go, having 
looked around me and finding myself alone, 
I kneeled down and began to offer up the 
desires of my heart to God. I had scarcely 
done so, when immediately I was seized up­
on by some power which entirely over­
come me, and had such astonishing influence 
over me as to bind my tongue so that! 
could not speak. Thick darkness gathered 
around me, and it seemed to me for a time 
as if I were doomed to sudden destruction. 
But exerting all my powers to call upon 
God to deliver me out ofthe power of this 
enemy which had seized upon me, and at 
the very moment when I was ready to sink 
into despair and abandon myself to destruc­
tion, not to an imaginary rain, but to the 
power of some actual being from the un­
seen world, who had such a marvellous 
power as I had never before felt in any be­
ing. Just at this moment of great alarm, I 
saw a pillar of light exactly over my head, 
above the brightness of the sun, which de­
scended gradually until it fell upon me. It 
no sooner appeared than I found myself de­
livered from the enemy which held me 
bound. When the light rested upon me, I 
saw two personages, whose brightness and 
glory defy all description, standing above 
me in the air. One of them spake unto me, 
calling me by name, and said pointing to 
the other) 'This is my beloved Son, hear 
him.**

"My object in going to inquire of the

Lord was to know which of all the sects 
was right, that I might know which to 
join. No sooner therefore did I get pos­
session of myself, so as to be able to speak, 
than I asked the personages who stood 
above me in the light, which of all the sects 
was right (for at this time it had never en­
tered into my heart that all were wrong), 
and which I should join. I was answered 
that I must join none of them, for they 
were all wrong, and the personage who ad­
dressed me said, “that all their creeds were 
an abomination in his sight; that those 
professors were all corrupt, they draw near 
to me with their lips, but their hearts are 
far from me; they teach for doctrine the 
commandments of men. having a form of 
godliness, but they deny the power thereof.”

This vision he Anally relates to one of the 
revival preachers, who treats his story with 
contempt, and from this time forward he Is 
compelled to endure tbe scorn and persecu­
tion of the various religionists, and of the 
world generally.

Thus the time passed for about three 
years, until the 21st of September, 1823, 
when he is favored with another vision, 
resulting in a revelation of the existence 
and whereabouts of the famous gold plates 
of the Book of Mormon. Smith's own ac­
count of this vision is as follows:

“ While I was thus in the act oft'calling 
upon God, I discovered a light appearing in 
the room, which continued to increase until 
the room was lighter than at noonday, when 
immediately a personage appeared at. mv 
bedside, standing in the air. for his feet did 
not touch the floor. He had on a loose robe 
of most exquisite whiteness. It was a 
whiteness beyond anything earthly I had 
ever seen; nor do 1 believe that any earthly 
thing could be made to appear so exceed­
ingly white and brilliant; his hands were 
naked, and his arms also, a little above the 
wrist; so, also, were his feet- naked, as were 
his legs, a little above the ankles. His head 
and neck were also bare. I could discover 
that he had no other clothing on but this 
robe, as it was open, so that 1 could see in­
to his bosom.

“ Not only was his robe exceedingly white, 
but his whole person was glorious beyond 
description, and his countenance truly like 
lightning. The room was exceedingly light, 
but not so very bright as immediately 
around his person. When I first looked up­
on him I was afraid, but the fear soon left 
me. He called me by name and said unto 
me, that he was a messenger sent from the 
presence of God to me, and that his name 
was Nephi. That God had a work for me 
to do, and that my name should be had for. 
good and evil among all nations, kindreds, 
and tongues; or that it should be both good 
and evil spoken of among all people. He 
said there was a book deposited, written 
upon gold -plates, giving an account of the 
former inhabitants of this continent, and 
the source from whence they sprang. He 
also said that the fullness of the everlast­
ing gospel was contained in it, as delivered 
by the Savior to the ancient inhabitants. 
Also, that there were two stones in silver 
bows (and these stones, fastened to a breast­
plate. constituted what is called the Urim 
and Thummim) deposited with the plates, 
and the possession and use of these stones 
was what constituted Seers in ancient or 
former times, and that God had prepared 
them for the purpose of translating the 
book....

“Again, he told me that when Igot those 
plates of which he had spoken (for the time 
that they should be obtained was not yet 
fulfilled) I should not show them to any 
person, neither the breastplate with the 
Urim and Thummim, only to those to whom 
I should be commanded to show them; if I 
did, I should be destroyed. While he was 
conversing with me about the plates, the 
vision was opened to my mind that I could 
see the place where the plates were depos­
ited, and that so clearly and distinctly, that 
I knew the place again when I visited it,

“After this communication, I saw the 
light in the room begin to gather immedi­
ately around the person of Wmwhohad 
been speaking to me, and it continued to do 
so until the room was again left dark, ex­
cept just around him, when I instantly saw, 
as it were, a conduit open right up into 
heaven, and he ascended up till he entirely 
disappeared, and the room was left as it had 
been before this heavenly light had made 
its appearance.

“ This vision is repeated until a third 
time, when the Seer is continued, the angel 
telling him that Satan would try to tempt 
me (in consequence of the indigent circum­
stances of my father’s family) to get the 
plates for the purpose of getting rich. This 
he forbid me, saying, that I must have no 
other object in view in getting the plates 
but to glorify God, and must not be influ­
enced by any other motive but that of 
building his kingdom, otherwise I could 
not get them. After this third visit, he 
again ascended up into heaven asbefore, 
and I was again left to ponder on the 
strangeness of what I had just experienced, 
when almost immediately after the heav­
enly messenger had ascended from me the 
third time, the cock crew, and I found that 
day! was approaching, so that our inter­
views must have occupied the whole of 
that night.” The directions thus given by 
clairvoyant vision and otherwise had been 
so plain that the buried plates were easily 
discovered. It was not allowed, however, 
that they should be removed until after the 
lapse of four years, during which young 
Smith was required to visit them yearly 
to receive further information from the 
angel.

THE PROPHET RECEIVES THE GOLDEN 
PLATES.

On the 22nd of September, 1827, the speci­
fied time of delay being completed, the 
plate sand the mystical accompaniments are 
given into his hands with strict charges 
concerning their safety and his own fearful 
responsibility. The appearance and general 
character of these refolds are thus des­
cribed in the language of a Mormon 
apostle:

“They were engraved in Egyptian char­
acters on plates having the appearance of 
gold, and measuring about seven or eight 
inches in length and breadth, not quite so 
thick as ordinary tin. All were held 
together by three rings, and formed a 
volume of about six inches in thickness, one 
portion of which was sealed. The char­
acters or letters on the unsealed part were 
very diminutive, but i perfectly engraved. 
By the gift and power of God Mr. Smith 
translated them into the English language; 
but as he could not write well, he received 
the aid of a person who wrote down the 
translation which he gave by word of 
mouth. This important work is called the 
Book of Mormon, from the name of an an­
cient prophet who, by Divine command­
ment, had been engaged in its compilation. 
We there Anu the account of two distinct 
races who inhabited the American con­
tinent. The Arst came from the tower of 
Babel; but after Afteen or sixteen centuries 
their iniquity became so great that they 
were entirely destroyed, even as the Lord 
had threatened them by the mouth of the 
holy prophets, the last of whom left their 
history engraved on plates of gold. These 
were found by the second race, who were 
a remnant of Joseph led forth from Jerusa­
lem "during the Arst year of the reign of 
Zedekiah, king of. Judah. Their history is 
brought down to the year 4-20 of the 
Christian era, when, by commandment of 
God, it was hid in the earth till revealed, as. 
before stated.”
TRIBULATIONS OF THE PROPHET IN KEEP­

ING THE PLATES.
According to the standard Mormon ac­

counts—which it should be borne in mind I 
am constantly following in this sketch of 
their early history—many severe trials 
attended the newly developed prophet in 
keeping possession of the plates, and getting 
the matter of them translated and printed. 
According to these accounts, the Devil 
must have been exceedingly busy just then 
in his efforts to thwart the designs of God 
in giving, this new story of the “Everlast­
ing Gospel” to the world, Inquisitive, and 
not very scrupulous neighbors invent vari- 
ous devices to get a sight of the “Gold 
Bible” as they call it; and on several occa­
sions the prophet is waylaid and violently 
attacked when he is supposed to have the 
plates with him. And when at length the 
translation has been partially completed, 
an event takes place which strikes con­
sternation into the hearts of Smith and his 
friends. A certain Martin Harris who had 
been acting as amanuensis, until some­
thing over 100 pages of the work were com­
pleted, and in whom until now the greatest 
conAdence seems to have been placed, having 
gained the reluctant consent of the prophet, 
carried the manuscript home with him to 
show it to his wife and a specified number 
of special friends. But instead of exercis­
ing the promised care, he makes quite a free 
use of the precious document, and. at length 
it wholly disappears from his keeping, A 
dilemma, indeed, is this; for it is evident 
that the manuscript is not lost, but only 
abstracted and carried off by some agent of 
the evil one. No new translation can be 
made without “the power of God,” and 
Smith is extremely doubtful whether this 
will be granted him a second time, and if 
it be some instrument of the evil one who 
holds the missing manuscript, it would be 
doubtless so altered as fatally to differ from 
a newly-made one, and so a damaging dis­
credit be thrown upon tbe whole affair ; at 
least it is so declared by revelation through 
the Prophet himself.

Of this actual result of this affair, we are 
not informed; all that I was able to learn 
from the work from which these particu­
lars have been gathered, is that Martin 
Harris becomes disgraced for his share of 

• the proceedings, being repeatedly called “a 
wicked man” by the revealing Spirit; and 
that Smith himself after having been 
severely chastised by the angelic power, is 
enabled to go on and accomplish his trans­
lation, employing Oliver Cowdery instead 
of Martin Harris as amanuensis.

A PROFESSOR'S OPINION OF THE HIERO­
GLYPHS.

The following statement is taken from 
Smith’s own narrative, the language, how­
ever, being that of the messenger em­
ployed: ’

“1 went to the city of New York, and 
presented the characters which had been 
translated, with the translation thereof, to 
Professor Anthon, a, gentleman celebrated 
for his literary attainments. Professor 
Anthon stated that the translation was cor­
rect, more so than any he had before seen 
translated from the Egyptian. I then 
showed him those which were not yet trans­
lated, and he said that they were Egyptian, 
Chaldaic, Assy rise, and Arabic, and he said 
that thpy were the true characters. He 
gave me a certificate, certifying to the 
people oL Pjumyra that they were true 
characters.nnd that the translation of such 
of them as had been translated was also 
correct. I took the certificate and put it 
into my pocket, and waa just leaving the 
house, when Mr. Anthon called me back.

he has conferred all needful power and 
authority, especially to baptize and to im­
part the Holy Ghost by the laying on of 
hands. “So great faith have I never seen 
among all the Jews, wherefore I could not 
show unto them so great miracles because 
of their unbelief. Verily I say unto you 
there are none of them who have seen so 
great things as ye have seen, neither have 
they heard so great things as ye have 
heard.”
THE LOST KEYS OFTHE KINGDOM RESTORED

It was while yet engaged in the transla­
tion, that the Prophet, together with his 
amanuensis, having learned the true 
method of Baptism from some passages of 
their work, became strongly desirous of 
submitting themselves to that rite. But a 
puzzling dilemma here presented itself; 
there was no one no won earth authorized 
to administer the rite, as all alike were 
gone' astray, being deniers of a present 
revelation, a doctrine upon which alone a 
true religion could be founded. From this 
dilemma, while looking to God for light, 
they are again delivered by an angel who 
proves to be John the Baptist, and who, 
laying his hands upon them, ordains them 
with these words: “Upon you my fellow- 
servants, in the name of the Messiah, I 
confer the priesthood of Aaron, which 
holds the keys of the ministering of angels 
and of the gospel of repentance; and of 
Baptism by immersion for the remission of 
sins; and this shall never be taken from 
the earth until the sons of Levi do offer 
again unto the . Lord an offering in right- 
eousceas.” “Accordingly” adds Smith, 
whose account I am now following, “we 
went and were baptized; I baptized him 

. (Cowdery) first, and afterwards he baptized 
me; after which I laid my hands upon his 
head and ordained him to the Aaronie 
priesthood, and afterwards he laid his 
hands on me and ordained me to the priest­
hood, for so we were commanded.”
A CHVECH ORGANIZED; ITS EARLY TRIBU­

LATIONS.
The organization of the Mormon church 

took place, April 6th, 1830, in Fayette, Sen­
eca, Co., N. Y., followed immediately by 
the ordination of elders, these consisting at 
first mostly of the prophet’s brothers, all of 
whom were thus ordained, although the 
youngest was but 14 years old. As prose­
lytes increased, settlements were formed, 
first at Kirtland, Ohio, in 1831. also in Jack- 
son Co., Mo., at about the same time. In 
both these places a considerable degree of 
prosperity seems to have been attained,and 
temples were built for public worship. At 
a period somewhat later, a settlement was 
formed in Caldwell Co., also in some other 
parts of Missouri. But from all these 
places this hapless people were driven by 
the spirit of persecution stirred up, as they 
aver, by the sectarian preachers whose 
flocks had been disturbed by the advent of 
this new gospel in their midst. Such per­
secutions generally culminated in a mani­
festation of mob law, attended—especially 
in Missouri—by some of the most shameful 
exhibitions of brutality and bloodshed the 
country has ever witnessed. Finally, these 
Mormon settiers, who had purchased their 
lands from the United States government, 
and paid for the same, were driven from 
Missouri and took refuge in Illinois.

It was in the spring of 1839, that this 
people established themselves upon the 
east bank of the Mississippi river and be­
gan building up the chartered city of Nau­
voo. But the mob spirit would not let them 
rest even here; it was not long before it 
broke out with renewed violence, their old 
enemies from Missouri combining and co­
operating with kindred spirits, manv of 
whom were then to be found on the west­
ern borders of Illinois. The violence was 
now mainly directed against the prophet 
himself; the result was that he together 
with his brother Hiram, whilst confined in 
the Carthage jail—on a charge of treason I 
think it was—were brutally' murdered in 
prison. Of the two “Apostles” confined in 
the same cell one was severely wounded, 
having received four balls in his body, and 
the other escaped unharmed. This was on 
the 27th of June, 1841 But even here,as in 
other c ses, maddened violence aad ^brutal 
murder did not tend to destroy, but to 
strengthen a persecuted faith, adding to it 
the sacred seal of martyrdom. Such perse­
cution did, however, succeed In driving the 
Mormons into a distant fertile valley, there 
to increase in numbers and power until 
they should become a perplexing problem 
of our national life.

THE MORMON HEGIRA.
It was in Feb., 1846, that Brigham Young, 

the newly elected head of his church, to­
gether with his twelve apostles and several 
thousands more of the persecuted exites, 
left Nauvoo on their journey westward,not 
knowing where their next home would be. 
Their general course, however, was toward 
the Rocky mountains aud the interior of 
Calfornia, concerning which but little was 
then known. It was a leading purpose with 
them to get beyond the jurisdiction of the 
United States into Mexico, that they might 
be better able to maintain an independent 
position. In this, however, they ultimately 
failed, owing to a new settlement of boas- 
daries at the close of the Mexican war.

As it was in the winter when they left, 
and having nothing but their tents and 
wagon-covers tor shelter, there was much 
exposure, attended with severe suffering, 
even unto death among the people. But 
they still persevered, steadily pushing on-

J Co«#iaMMStitkrW. .

and asked me how the young man found 
out that there were gold plates in the place 
where he found them. I answered that an 
angel of God had revealed it unto him.

“He then said unto me, let me see that 
certificate, I accordingly took it out of my 
pocket and gave it to him, when he took it 
and tore it to pieces, saying that there wa? 
no such thing now as ministering of angels, 
and that if I would bring the plates to him, 
he would translate them. I informed him 
that part of the plates were sealed, and 
that Twascforbidden to bring them, he re- 
glied T cannot read a sealed book.’ I left 

im and went to Dr. Mitchell who sanc­
tioned what Professor Anthon had said re­
specting both the characters and the 
translation.”

The volume was at length published in 
the year 1830, with two certificates inserted, 
to the effect that the signershad seen the 
plates of gold, which were showed them by 
an angel from heaven; and that they 
“knew’’ that the engraved characters were 
translated “by the power of God.’’

The first of these certificates is signed by 
Oliver Cowdery, David Whitmer and 

•Martin Harris. All three of these indivi­
duals eventually became .disaffected and 
were regarded as enemies of the cause; to 
the second one eight signatures are attach­
ed—-three Smiths and four Whitmers, with 
one other; thus it appears that of the 
eleven attesting witnesses, eight belonged 
to the two families of Smith and Whitmer. 
There is no claim that the certificates were 
given under the legal form of an oath.

As to what eventually became of the 
gold plates, it is claimed that the angel 
received them back, after the translation; 
and it is stated by Smith himself, in 1S8S; 
that the angel still had them.

I make no comments; I leave these to 
the intelligence of the reader.

THE BOOK OF MORMON.
I do not propose, in this connection, to 

go into a full criticism of this strange pro­
duction; to do this would be but' a tedious 
and profitless work, besides occupying large­
ly of space that can be better improved. I 
shall therefore but briefly state some of my 
own impressions after reading the book.

To my mind it is clear, from internal 
evidence, that no inconsiderable portion of 
this book must have had its origin in an 
age not very remote from our own. Its 
general claims have already been stated; in 
its subject-matter and prevailing style, 
there is manifested a studied effort to 
iipitateas closely as possible the Old Tes­
tament Bible history. Here, we have re­
produced in all their minute and repulsive 
details, the wickedness and wars of an un- 
worthy people of God constantly tending 
toward increased degeneracy, until their 
final, extinction. The imitation is so close 
and slavish that some of the worst and 
most doubtful phraseology of King James* 
translators of our Bible is followed to the 
letter; and not only so, but iterated, and 
reiterated, until good sense and good taste 
being alike outraged, a feeling of disgust 
takes possession of the mind.

But this book is not all an imitation of 
the Bible; in some parts of it the stereo­
typed language of modern orthodox creeds 
is found in quite free use. Indeed, if the 
claims of this book are allowed, then must 
it be admitted that the chosen people of 
God of this Western hemisphere have a 
decided advantage over their Oriental 
brethren; for here we learn in plain lan­
guage all about “the plan of salvation” 
which must have been known in all its de­
tailseven at so early a date as when these 
wandering tribes were separated from the 
original Jewish stock. .

In the course of the narrative, Christ 
himself is made to appear upon this West­
ern scene of action. To him the aborigines 
of the land are the lost sheep of the House 
of Israel whom he visits immediately after 
his death and resurrection at the East. 
Three days of preternatural darkness, the 
rending of rocks and upheaval of moun­
tains, the destruction of cities, and other 
terrible events intended as a punishment 
ofthe wicked, precede his coming. His 
faithful ones hegatheres around him. tell­
ing them in plain language that he is the 
“God of Israel,” and encouraging them to 
worship him as such. He speaks to them 
quite familiarly of what he has been doing 
in the land of Judea, and clearly intimates 
that to these “lost sheep” he wiilbe speci­
ally gracious and plain, that there may “be 
no disputations among them.” Now fol­
lows a; rehearsal of the Sermon on the 
Mount with variations and additions by 
which it is made wonderfully to harmonize 
with the doctrines of the Mormon Church. 
For instance, although in the New Testa­
ment version of this discourse not one 
word is said about Baptism, Jiere the 
Teacher lays great stress upon it and the 
exact method of its performance, telling 
his disciples that they must go down into 
the water and “immerse” the subject. He 
also works miracles on an enlarged scale, 
Sthering vast crowds of the sick and in- 

m and healing them together with a 
single effort of his God-like power. In 
short, there is in this part of the Mormon 
book, a repulsive mingling ot the New 
Testament gospels with unimportant and 
trivial sayings aud doings, bearing almost 
invariably upon the peculiar tenets of 
Latter Day Saints..

With a single brief example of the 
familiar, gossiping style of this new version 
of the 'Supposed teachings of the Christ of 
Christendom, I will pass on to other mat­
ters. It shall be from his closing address 
to hl# Western twelve apostles upon whom
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Pre-natal Influences as Affecting Char­
acter.

BmCT8 FBOM SECTORS DELIVERED IN “THE
■WOMAN’S MCTClia COURSE,” PROVIDENCE, M. 
I., BY ELIZABETH CHURCHILL.

Mrs. Churchill prefaced her lecture by speak­
ing ofthe present century as most remarkable 
for its discoveries in all directions, and its ap­
plication of them to the improvement and 
comfort of life; hut unless character also im­
proves, outward advantages will be of little 
value. Unless people steadily tend upward, 
growing more truthful, chaste and noble, their 
talking through telephones and their rapid 
transit will avail but little in the long run. 
Great advance has been made in knowledge 
of our bodies, and we seem to ba on the bor­
ders of psychological knowledge of which it 
is bewildering to think. If tho knowledge of 
physiology in all its branches, and of hered­
ity, could be applied to the production of 
wiser and better people, it would be a fitting 
culmination of this glorious century. This 
can be done if women can be induced to lay 
aside those scruples which are plainly trace­
able to their having always regarded them­
selves as subordinates, of importance to the 
world only as they were connected with men. 
Volumes of exhortation to women upon the 
duties of motherhood have been written, but 
few of them begin at the beginning. . The im­
portant question is not how to train sickly 
and evil-disposed children to a tolerable state 
of health and tolerable morality, but how to 
secure the birth of children with healthy bod­
ies, sound minds, sweet tempers and noble na- 
tures. How can one who knows the strength 
of the undercurrents about us: the sorrow and 
despair caused by evil-souled children; the 
influence which one noble or ignoble charac­
ter may have on a wide circle; who also 
knows that the laws controlling character are 
instituted by a holy God—how can she shrink 
from their investigation? We used to be 
taught that children came into life like sheets 
of white paper, ready to receive whatever im­
press mothers wished or were able to make. 
That is all wrong. The proof that the mental 
Sower and moral tendencies of children are 

etermined before birth is overwhelming.
Until this knowledge is accepted and women 
conscientiously act upon it, they will go on 
lopping of! the branches of evil, instead of 
uprooting it; dipping away at the broad cur­
rent of vice instead of stopping its sources. 
How shall women learn without teachers, and 
who will teach if the work is viewed as an of­
fense against good taste? The present reti­
cence of women concerning improvement of 
race tends to increase licentiousness. What- 
ever subject men find', women discussing in 
the light of duty, soon assumes to them a se­
rious aspect. • ■ -

Writers on heredity have been strangely re­
luctant to credit women with other share in
shaping the nature of children than that of 
nourishment. Whether the electrical currents, 
traversing the blood, convey to the germ im­
pressions from the mother, or there is a more 
mysterious process by which her moral and 
spiritual nature may stamp themselves, we 
know not; what we do know is that the in- 
flueEce of a weak mother, or a wicked one, 
often completely nullifies nobler qualities im­
parted by the father; as her straggle for self- 
control and goodness, under adverse condi­
tions, often becomes the child’s birthright, 
where the father is weak or base. The black
sheep in pious families could always be ac­
counted tor if the state of mind of their 
mothers before their birth were taken into ac­
count. Physical monsters are caused by ar­
rested development through a shock ot some 
sort experienced by the mother. May not 
moral monsters also be caused by sudden ill- 
temper, or the indulgence of evil propensi­
ties ? The stream of tendency may be deflect­
ed from its course by accidental causes. Mar­
cus Aurelius, one of the noblest and wisest of 
men and emperors, was. the father of the 
drunken, brutal wretch, Commcdus, the ex­
planation being that the empress was a profli­
gate woman. Who could have thought that 
the life led by Lilithe Bonaparte, a compara­
tively obscure Corsican woman, during a short 
period would'have influenced the destinies of 
millions and changed the map of Europe: but 
from her life on horseback, sharing the mili­
tary expeditions of her husband, made , by 
circumstances intense, ambitious and warlike 
in feeling, came the selfish, insanely-ambitious 
and powerful Napoleon, the only one of her 
large family whose character was abnormal 
in those directions. It seems to he established 
that the sentiments most active in the mother 
during pregnancy become most prominent in 
the child, rather than those latent and natural, 
but for the time little exercised. If this rule 
were generally unuerstood, surprise at the 
widely-varying children of the same family 
would cease. Musicians have been born into 
unmusical families, made such by the effect 
of exquisite music, often heard, upon the 
mother’s sensitive mind, as poetical children, 
refined and beautiful, are born into coarse, 
unlovely families from similar accidental in­
fluences. Byron’s life was ruined by the mis­
anthropy and unreason derived from his half- 
insane mother; while in Goethe the seeds of 
his intense selfishness, which led him to pluck 
women’s hearts only to cast them aside like 
weeds, may be traced to his mother, who with 
rare gifts wished never to hear of any trouble, 
not even of a fire in the next street, until there 
was danger that she would be affected by it. 
Charles Kingsley is an eminent example of an 
intense love of nature, being transmitted by 
the mother’s exquisite enjoyment of beautiful 
spenery. The artful Rebecca stamped craft 

. upon one son, and perhaps through him upon 
a nation, while the gentle, devout Hannah 
gave birth to a saint. Upon John the Baptist 
were brought to bear the highest possible in­
fluences through the exalted frame of his 
mother, so that he was fitly framed for the in­
dwelling, in a peculiar degree, of the Divine 
Spirit. May it not be that one reason why 
there were so many saints and sages among 
the Hebrews was that their women universally 
desired children, each one hoping that to her 

~Wght come the expected Star of Israel, and 
also to the fact that they were treated by men 
with tender consideration. Many a mother 
before Mary hid in her heart hopes which 
wrought upon her child to make him holy. 
What will be the effect upon our national char-, 
acter of the almost universal aversion to child­
bearing? , The crime of footicide is shocking­
ly prevalent. In many cases some of which, 
were known to the speaker, children who es­
caped the murderous intentions of their more 
ignorant than wicked mothers, have been 
crippled In body or dwarfed in intellect, and 
have grown to manhood helpless victims, 
with their hearts full of hatred for those who 
ruined their lives. Surely the lash of Neme- 
sis forever falls upon the heart of one who 
has so sinned, In other cases the murderous 
purpose is reflected in the moral nature ofthe 
child, and a cruel soul is born whose hand is 
against every one until he dies. Many mur­
derers are stamped with that nature by moth­
ers who think#f<Bticide no wrong.

complete idiocy, the only cause assigned for 
their condition was the excessive devotion of 
their mother before the birth of each, to danc­
ing and gayety. The energy and magnetism 
of many mothers goes into dainty clothing for 
the expected infants. Instead of the daily ex­
ercise in open air, which they need more than 
at any other time; improvement of their 
minds by study or reading, they ruffle and 
plait and embroider uqtil they throb with fa­
tigue. It must be a poor consolation to the 
defrauded man or woman, going through life 
subject to inherited ailments, or with mental 
incapacity, that his or her baby body was 
wrapped in dainty and elaborate garments. 
They cost top much.

Many children are born tired, their mothers 
having constantly worked in the household to 
the verge of exhaustion. This is wrong and 
cruel. Liars are made before birth by the 
strategies and equivocation to which women 
resort to obtain from ungenerous husbands 
necessary money which is rightfully theirs.

The benevolent activities of women of our 
days will influence the unborn towaid good­
ness, but personal freedom would give a better 
harvest. Think ofthe delicate processes of 
nourishing a human body and soul until birth, 
and then reflect upon the ordinary conditions 
of motherhood; an overtaxed, ailing, often 
fretful and perhaps unwilling mother, who 
has little rest, almost no pleasure, and perhaps 
has to bear the fault-finding of her husband 
at her condition, and decide if humanity 
would not be immeasurably elevated by mak­
ing men and women familiar with the laws of 
human development Imagine all prospective 
mothers happily situated, with bodies and 
minds healthfully exercised; surrounded by 
affection; every child beloved and longed for. 
Then suppose the little one properly fed, 
clothed, exercised; its mind developed wisely, 
its powers of observation and reflection en­
couraged and directed; its will educated and 
its religious faculties trained. How much 
crime would there be by the time the second 
generation of this sort came into active life? 
Our prisons would be almost empty, knowl­
edge would increase and goodness become the 
law of life. To spread abroad such knowl­
edge is incumbent on all, both married and 
unmarried. To live purely and righteously 
with reference to future children should be 
urged upon the youth of both sexes; and 
above all things should women frown upon 
the sneers and contempt, the low jests with 
which this tender subject is almost universally 
treated. The birth chamber should be as sa­
cred a place as the chamber of death. The 
Spirit of God is there.

(Soon after the delivery of this lecture Mrs. 
Churchill, a woman greatly respected and es­
teemed, grew ill and passed away last March.) Can Spirits Suffer after Leaving Material 

Bodies?
The Faith and Prayer Cure, Or, Independ­

ent Spirit Healing.

by s. ». hay.

To the Eflltor of the BeUglo-Phttosophlcal Journal.
I herewith transmit for such notice or inser­

tion as you may deem them entitled to, sundry 
artideswhich I have clipped from the secular 
press, relating as you will see, to what is pop­
ularly known as “the faith and prayer cure”} 
and as the subject has created some interest in 
certain localities, both in this and other coun-
tries, I propose, in this communication, to 
examine it in the light of our spiritual philos­
ophy, that we may see just where the truth lies 
in regard to the matter.

A noticeable feature of the movement, so far 
as the same has come under my observation, 
is the fact that all tho published instances of 
such cures, represent them as occurring in 
some one of the Christian denominations. 
Now, as faith and prayer have, in all Chris­
tian lands, and from time immemorial been 
regarded as of the life and essence of the 
Christian system—as, in. truth, underlying 
••the plan of salvation’’ itself, the question 
naturally arises, why has this great remedial 
agent for healing of the sick, been so slow in 
coming to the churches? Spiritualism, with 
its all-embracing philosophy, answers all such 
questions, whilst the churches, standing out­
side of this philosophy can render no answer, 
unless they should, as I believe they do, claim 
them as miracles, but this , would come with 
bad grace from those who have so long flip­
pantly flouted in the face-of the Spiritualist 
the hackneyed phrase. “The days of miracles 
have passed.’’

I have before me a number of the Religio- 
Philosophical Journal, in which is a list of 
the names of some sixty persons thus adver­
tised as healing mediums, and I have reason 
to believe there are as many more who are 
regularly in the field healing the sick by 
spirit power, who are not thus advertised: 
Many of these have been healers for more 
than*twenty years. Do these healers pray? 
Yes. Ifva sincere desire for the cure of their 
patients, though such desire be neither uttered 
nor expressed, constitutes prayer, then they 
may be said to pray without ceasing. And 
what of their faith I That they exercise just 
such as the practical business man exercises 
when in his daily avocations-he uses the re­
quisite means for the attainment of the de­
sired ends; only this, and nothing more. Con­
ceding the genuineness of the cures alleged 
to be the product of faith and prayer yet de­
nying, as we must, the efficacy of these in the 
sense in which they are. claimed by their ad­
vocates, it remains for us to determine the 
category in which such cures should be rank­
ed. We assume, and shall endeavor to main­
tain, that the faith and prayer cure belongs to 
that, large and ever growing branch of Spirit­
ualism which comes properly under the head 
of ‘The Independent” By this I mean that 
class of spirit power and spirit manifestation 
which are wrought without any specific 
agency upon the part of the medium, and, not 
unfrequently, independent even of his expecta­
tion. Such, tor instance, is the independent 
voice, independent music, independent writ­
ing, and the independent development of me­
diums. This last mentioned manifestation is 
quaintly described in the New Testament, as 
the Holy Ghost falling upon them; and a no- 
table instance of independent healing, was 
that which represented the woman as believ­
ing that if she could but touch the hem ofthe 
garment of Jesus she would be cured, and 
when Jesus felt the virtue (magnetism) go out 
of him; and this I apprehend it was, and not 
her faith that healed her.

The experience of more than one genera­
tion in spirit communion has shown that some 
degree of preparation—some intelligent co­
operation between mortals in the flesh and 
those who have left it, is Indispensable to the 
attainment of the best results. In a word, 
harmony, quiet, and passivity of mind, and 
unity of purpose and desire on the part of 
those who would be the recipients of spirit in­
fluence, constitute the conditions necessary to 
ordinary spirit intercourse ; but these are ob-

our observance of them, we are indebted to- 
day either directly or indirectly for all we 
know of immortality and the after life, for all 
we have learned of the endless variety of the 
manifestations, for the literatureand the phi­
losophy of modern Spiritualism, which are 
everywhere received by thoughtful minds 
as the crowning glory of the age.

To tiie EdUoKof the Belfgto-PIi&oepbfcal Journal:
Will you allow me the privilege of expres­

sing my views through your widely circulated’ 
paper to its numerous and intelligent readers, 
upon the above interesting question. From’ a 
perusal of the many papers published In de­
fence of Spiritualism, I find many who ex­
press their firm belief in a hereafter enjoyed 
by the spirit, free from pain, misery, sorrow or 
death, but a career of unlimited pleasure and 
freedom of will wheresoever tbe spirit may 
list. In my aged search after truth, I cannot 
believe that death or change will absolve us 
from any obligations imposed upon us by the 
eternal law of our being". The spiritaal ele­
ments of our nature are the only criterion by 
which we can judge or experience either pain 
or pleasure. Sensation is not a natural ele­
ment of the material body after the spirit, I 
or Ego, has left, and ia no more sensible of 
pleasure or pain than the material rock or 
tree. When all intelligence of feeling or life 
has departed from the material body, dissolu­
tion of its organized form goes on, until each 
atom unites with its proper affinity, to build 
op another form, for the I am of eternal life 
to manifest through, to gain the intelligence 
of earth’S experience. The occupant of the 
former body of this rudimental sphere has 
passed on to be born again, or re-incarnated 
into a more etherialized form, just as natural 
to his spirit sensation, as the form of earth 
was, to earth-vision; not one faculty or expe­
rience lost. All of his organs with one more 
added for the second sphere ara ready for ac­
tive operation for-the unfoldment of the spirit 
to scenes of higher life. The dualism of the 
soul and spirit can never be dissolved. When 
the soul and spirit are properly born into a 
new sphere, it must become a threefold being, 
possessing tbe outer, inner, and the innermost. 
The outer form is produced by the intelligence 
of the sphere into which the inner and inner­
most will enter. The spirit may enter the 
second sphere before a body has been prepar­
ed; in such case the spirit can return to earth 
and take possession of our bodies, feed upon 
our food, and drink of our drink. Some are 
incorporated into our nature as guardian spir­
its, while the others may be called familiar 
spirits.. A triune spirit who has been proper­
ly born into spirit-life cannot take possession 
of our bodies or control us, except by impres­
sion, similar to mesmerism and psychology.

The natural body after the spirit has left it, 
ia not subject to any of the sensations which 
belong to the spirit; all have left, and decom­
position of the body soon takes place; each 
particle goes to its proper affinity there to 
wait until called forth by the inherent law of 
its being to higher forms of active life. The 
Ego or soul, withthe spirit covering, has left 
the outside form, without as much as saying 
by your permission, Mr. Form, and has enter­
ed its destined locality with all the experi­
ences and faculties which it possessed in ita 
physical state of existence. The spirit com­
ing in possession of more intricate and active 
conditions for progressive unfoldment, does 
not render it less exposed to atmospheric 
changes and events incident to further experi­
ence, and progression which exists every 
where throughout the realms of Nature. If 
heaven and hell are the mental actions of the 
soul, it has no better chance for creating its 
own happiness or misery in its new condition, 
than when a denizen of earth enshrined in 
flesh. AH the possibilities of his inherent na­
ture can only be made manifest through ex­
perience, which is always attended with more 
or less suffering. *

Upon entering the second sphere, we have 
by no means reached the ultimatum of our 
progressive existence; neither is the door 
called death, forever closed to our advancing 
intellect. Death has followed us through all 
gradations of ascending life, from the atom up 
to our present state, and is so interwoven in 
our very nature, that it is a part and parcel of 
ourselves. Life could not be eternal without 
its negative, eternal death, change, sleep or 
rest. Active Hfe is destructive by its contin­
ued exertion, and must be recuperated by the 
change called death. Let the minds no fur­
ther advanced in wisdom, advocate the popu­
lar idea that there are existing in nature many 
things which are wrong and should be destroy­
ed ; their belief or disbelief will make nodiffer­
ence with the great evolutionary wheel which 
moves slowly but surely on,and witii each rev­
olution cuts * shadow in advance, indicative 
of Its eternal unfoldment; also that there can 
be nothing lost outside ot nature in the min­
eral, vegetable and animal kingdom, for all 
things nave eternally existed in some form

and eternally will exist, as nature is unbound­
ed, having no outside locality where some­
thing can be changed to nothing, or where no 
thing can be made into some thing. There is 
not a particle of matter or life existing in any 
shape, but what will always exist in some 
form, rising from the lower to the higher con­
ditions through each successive chain of de­
velopment. The mineral advances to the veg­
etable, and then through the lower order of 
the animal, and so on up to man, and on 
through the ascending scale, to be associated 
with the highest order of beings who have 
gained their knowledge by pa-sing through 
the experience of eternal progressive forms 
of existence. We can not buy or sell knowl­
edge. Infinite experience can only be gained 
by partaking largely, of the trees which are. 
called good aud evil.

With due respect for the opinions of others, 
I remain as ever, the friend of progression

M. L. Sherman.
Adrian, Mich,, Oct 22nd, 1881.

In Memoriam.

Of the loving purposes and wise designs 
that characterise the ways of the Infinite, per­
haps there are few that more folly challenge 
our regard than that which makes the progress 
and the happiness of large numbers of de­
parted spirits dependent upon the good they 
are enabled to do, bj returning to earth and 
ministering to those they have left behind. 
More than one billion of immortal spirits 
within the last generation, have drifted into 
spirit life end taken their apparent places 
there. Of these what mind short of the Infi­
nite can compute the number of those who

“On errands of supernal mercy sent,” 
would gladly return to earth and minister to 
their brethren in the flesh if the door were 
but open to them and the Invitation given. 
Faith and prayer can never open this door. 
Earnest investigation, and a knowledge of the 
laws of spirit intercourse, alone can.

The most interesting and startling case of 
independent spirit healing that I have ever 
heard of, is that of Miss Magnolia Hibruner 
’of Guyandott, West Virginia, a detailed ac­
count of which you will find in the inclosed 
slip from the Catlettsburg Democrat, In this 
remarkable cure there was involved neither 
faith nor prayer nor hope, for whilst to all hu­
man seeming she is in the very jaws of death 
a band of angels which she hears/sees and 
describes, comes to her bed and miraculously 
restore her to health.

There are some dozen of those Faith and 
Prayer Institutes in the United States and 
Europe—the most prominent of those inthe 
latter, is the one at Knock in Ireland, and 
that at Lourdes in France: but in none of these, 
either at home or abroad, is such a thing as 
spirit mediumship recognized or practised. 
The old Bible doctrine of the ministry of an­
gels and the practise of healing the sick by 
the laying on of hands so largely practiced by 
our healers to-day, and the clairvoyance which 
locates disease, and the spirit intelligence that 
prescribes for it—all these are ignored and re­
pudiated by this modern therapeutic school of 
faith and prayer. With the Catholics the 
prayer is made to the blessed Virgin, with the 
Protestants to God and Jesus; and though the 
latter is credited with having “paid it all” 
while on earth, yet he is invoked to return and 
settle other ills and bills that daily accrue for 
the violation of the laws of health.

Amid all this darkness and unbelief, it is 
pleasant to reflect that the Christian world 
“does move,” and that the light from the Spirit- 
world may he seen resting upon a few of the 
eminences that overlook “the marsh lands of 
old Theology.”

Woodbury, Ky., Oct., 1881.

Tothe Editor of the Rolls ■ -Philosophical Journal:

An interesting and unique service in com­
memoration of the translation to a higher 
sphere, of Wm. Green, Esq., of Brooklyn, on 
Oct. 14th, was held at Steck Hall, N. Y., Sun­
day, Oct. 29 th, at 10:30 a. m.—-Andrew Jack- 
son Davis, president of the Harmonial Associ­
ation, the beloved and loving friend of a quar­
ter of a century, conducted the exercises.

On the centre of the desk facing the audi­
ence, was the last photograph taken of Mr. 
Green. Tasteful hands had surrounded it by 
an exquisite wreath of roses, daisies, smilax 
and ivy, the language of which is life immor­
tal, and the stand was covered with a wreath 
of rare vines, flowers and delicately tinted au­
tumn leaves. The audience included many 
old friends of our venerated brother, among 
whom was his wife and several of his children. 
His former friendly associate, Peter Cooper, 
was prevented by the lowering skies from at­
tending.

The soulful strains of the organ, evoked by 
the organist,,James M. Farnsworth, and the 
soaring, bird-like voice of Miss Conron, were 
but a fitting prelude for the discourse. How 
different the whole atmosphere from that 
where old-time beliefs prevail! Here, death 
is only a birth, a dropping off of the outer 
encumbering fleshy garments, so that the glo­
rified spirit is no more hindered and clogged 
by matter. The air is filled with hope and 
joy and a sacred religious awe at the wonder­
ful, but natural process.

Mr. Davis gave a graphic but succinct 
sketch of the life, character and labors and 
unfoldment of Mr. Green, from which we cull 
the following data, of one who passed on at 
the ripe age of eighty-five years.

Mr. Green early developed great business 
capacities, and acquired wealth by means of 
which he could carry out cherished humani­
tarian and religious projects, in connection 
with his friends, the Tappans, William Good­
ell, Rev. Charles G. Finney, and other promi­
nent philanthropists. With these men he had 
much to do with the erection of the old Broad­
way Tabernacle, which was largely built from 
his purse. That has been one of the most im­
portant churches in this country. In the 
chapel which was the nucleus of this church. 
Mr. Green himself originated the modern Sab 
batli school system, which has since become 
so popular. This distinction has frequently 
been given to others.

In the year 1833, Mr. Green assisted in the 
formation of the American anti Slavery Socie­
ty, in Philadelphia. He suffered the obloquy 
and opprobrium which fell upon his friends, 
Garrison, Tappan, and many others. For some 
time his windows were barricaded, and a tank 
ot hot water was kept in the top of the house 
to withstand the assaults of those infuriated 
mobs, that were the exponents of popular fury 
against anti-slavery workers. He was a man 
of action, rather than of words. Others have 
gone down to history with creater renown, 
who did less. His purse, his great executive 
ability, his matchless courage, his love of 
truth, made him the Cromwell of that stormy 
period.

The simple grandeur of his character and 
his absolute devotion to truth, rendered him 
capable of examining everything new, how­
ever unpopular. So, in due time,-having be­
come a good deal liberalized, he investigated 
modern Spiritualism, and received indubitable 
evidence of its truthfulness. Regarding it as 
a means, not an end, he 'went on to broad ’ in­
vestigations aud generalizations. He landed 
in the Harmonial Philosophy. Here he found 
that which satisfied the needs of his expand­
ing soul, during the tranquil remainder of his 
iiteon earth. Inits grand revelation he rejoic­
ed exceedingly. He demanded pabulum for 
reason; here it was. His strong, truth-loving 
nature rejoiced more and still more in its eter­
nal principles. As the natural man faded and 
drooped, the spiritual man grew sweet and 
strong and more in unison with the Harmo-

. nial Philosophy.
Mr. Green was immovable in upholding 

anything which tended to advance the race 
through inculcating the principles of the phi­
losophy which was so dear to his heart. He 
hailed with Joy the organization of the Har­
monial Association, and came over to New 
York, infirm as he was, to become qualified as 
trustee. With deep emotion, on that occasion, 
he declared himself thankful that he had re­
mained on earth long enough to become one 
of its founders. The most venerable of them, 
he is the first who has been called higher, to 
continue his work in a broader way and in a 
grander field.

At the close of the discourse, on motion of 
& member, a committee consisting of three, 
Mrs. Mary F. Davis, Mr. S. R. Filley and Mr. 
Wm. T. Van Zandt, were appointed to draft 

'the following resolutions, as embodying the 
sentiments of the Associations

Resolved, That in the long and well-round­
ed life and sterling character of our departed 
friend and brother, William Green, we recog­
nize the legitimate and practical workings of 
the central ideas and principles inculcated by 
the Harmonial Philosophy, of which he waa 
a profound student and unwavering supporter, 
in his loyalty as a citizen under a Republican 
government, in .his active sympathies with the 
oppressed and down-trodden, in his charitable 
deeds and self-sacrificing efforts in behalf of 
universal emancipation, in his loving fidelity 
to the tender relations of husband, father, 
friend, guardian; and, lastly, in his fearless 
adoption and uncompromising public advoca­
cy of whatever seemed to him to be the truth, 
however discredited and unpopular.

Resolved, That in his withdrawal from 
■earth to enter upon the nobler ministrations 
of a higher existence in the spiritual universe, 
we feel that humanity has gained an unchang- 
able friend and advocate, whose influence for 
the accomplishment of good works will be 
widely realized here in conformity with the 
wisdom and philanthropy of Celestial Broth- 
erhoods.

Resolved, That as 8 sacred commemoration 
of hia departure, which occurred in the ripe­
ness of life aud In harmony with the Divine 
plan, we solemnly pledge ourselves individ­
ually, and not less as the Harmonial Associa­
tion, of which he was the most venerable and

venerated officer, to keen fresh in our remem­
brance his exemplary life; to accept and to 
profit by his advice to his children “to culti­
vate integrity of character, as the only guaran­
tee of happiness in this or any other world,” 
and to be influenced in our dally walk and 
conversation by those eternal principles which 
were and are so dear to his heart and under­
standing.

Resolved, That we herewith express our 
profound sympathy with the children whom 
he held so dear and who cherished for him 
such reverent affection, with his companion, 
left lonely at eventide, and withall others who 
are sorrowful in their loss, which, in the light 
of our religious principles, is to him a blessed 
translation and an infinite gain.

During the preparation of these resolutions. 
Prof. A. Wilder gave an interesting sketch of 
particular phases of philanthropic and relig­
ious periods, in which Mr. Green was a prom­
inent actor. He was followed by Mrs. J. C. 
Croly, President of Sorosis, who paid a beau­
tiful tribute to Mra. Cornelia Green., the wife 
of Mr. Green, whom she pronounced to be one 
ofthe loveliest of characters. To Mrs. Green 
was owing the greatest inspiration and help 
of her own early life.

During the. address of Mr. Davis, he called 
upon Mrs. Van Horn to read a letter which 
Mr. Green had left, to be opened by the family 
after the departure of his spirit from its worn 
tenement. We give it as a characteristic exam­
ple of its author:
To my beloved children:

I leave this, my last communication with 
you (during my residence on earth), to express 
my special wishes in regard to my funeral.

For nearly forty years I have repudiated the 
religious system of christendom, because its 
very foundation is false, inasmuch as its fun­
damental doctrine is, that all mankind are 
born at enmity with God, and that their 
eternal happiness depends solely upon belief 
in the atonement, or, in other words, upon be­
lief and trust in what another has done for 
them, instead of upon personal integrity. I 
deem every falsehood, held as a basis of relig. 
ious beliet.to be eminently injurious to man­
kind.

The history of this belief, for more than 
1,500 years, has clearly demonstrated that its 
natural effect has been, persecution, the sup­
pression of knowledge, and a brake upon the 

^progress of the world; and to-day is only held 
in check, by civilization, which is the child 
of science. Therefore my wish is, not to have 
any of its clergy present, nor any of its theo­
logical tenets expressed, at my funeral; on 
the contrary, I desire, in this way, to repeat 
my protest against such a system of religion. 
To this request; I trust that all my children 
will cordially accede, and no one of them bow 
down to the “Idol St. Gustom.”
I have engaged my old friend. Andrew 

Jackson Davis, to make all remarks that need 
be made on that occasion. I would like to have 
cheerful music, appropriate to a glorious, joy­
ous second birth; to have a few flowers, not a 
superabundance of them; to have my body 
interred in a plain mahogany coffin, without 
ornamentation,and no more carriages than will 
be needed for the occasion, so that there may 
be no appearance of parade. Mourning cos­
tumes I disapprove of in all cases. As for 
yourselves individually, my advice is, to cul­
tivate integrity of character; for in accordance 
with it, will be your happiness in this, or any 
other where you may dwell.

Farewell. Your affectionate father, 
William Green.

1268 Pacific St., Brooklyn, Dec. 4th, 1876,
At the close of these addresses, Mrs. Mary 

F. Davis announced that Mr. Davis had heard 
from his dear friend, since the translation of 
the latter to a higher existence. A voice came 
in the early morning, sounding its message of 
flippy triumph to the one who had tenderly 
accompanied his elder brother to the very 
shores of that stream which bore him to his 
home in the Summer-land. His announcement 
finished with this %

message from wm. green.
Tuesday, 5 o’clock, A. M., Oct. 25,1881.
**Not{death,but translation I It was all accom­

plished for the most part painlessly, in con­
sequence of the affectionate attentions and 
care of my children, in the hours of my great­
est helplessness.

(After a silence of 8 or 10 minutes, he con­
tinued :)

“My anticipations are more than fulfilled. 
My cup is overflowing. In truth I may say 
I am overwhelmed with an indescribable 
sense of novelty and satisfaction.

(A tew moments delay, he added:)
“To my great suprise the first to meet me 

was Thomas Trusdale. Many of my early 
associates and acquaintances are in this vicin­
ity. (So I am told.)

■ “At last I am conjoined to my Cornelia as 
if we had parted but yesterday. *

“To all my dear family and friends, love 
from William Green.’’

W ith a tenderly eloquent apostrophe to our 
ascended friend, Mrs. Davis closed the deeply 
impressive service. P.

The Spirit of Washington.—In one of 
Josiah Quincy’s “Leaves from old Journals,” 
published in the Independent, he says that 
his father, while occupying for a night the 
room in which Washington died, saw the 
the spirit of the father of his country. “If,” 
explains the writer, “I gave the particulars, I 
should feel bound to give a full explanation 
of them by Dr. Hammond or some other ex­
pert in cerebral illusions; and this would oc- 
supy too much space for an episode. It may 
ie worth while to say that nothing my father 
law, or thought he saw, was useful in confirm­
ing hia belief in a spiritual world. His assur­
ance in this matter was perfect, he believed 
that brain action (it that is the correct expres­
sion) was at times set up in us by friends no 
longer in flesh, and that his own life had been 
guided by these mysterious influences. Shortly 
before his death, he spoke of reunion with 
hose he had loved, as men speak of what they 
tnpw; not as they soeak of what they hope or 
relieve.

A curious accident happened at the Elec­
trical Exposition in Paris. A gentleman 
was leaning over to examine closely an in­
teresting machine, when his gold chain 
made a connection between two conduct­
ing wires which happened to be exposed. 
The chain immediately became red-hot and 
set fire to the waistcoat, against which part 
of it rested.
. “Is Darwin Right?” by WilliamOwW n 

price $1.00, postage 8c. This last and best 
book of Mr. Denton grants the great merits 
of Darwin, accepts evolution, but shows 
how imperfect the Darwinian theory is 
unless there be a Central Mind to guide 
the wondrous process. It is the only Just 
criticism of Darwin, and the first and only 
book in the world that calls the great sci­
entist back to The Soul of Things and up 
to a spiritual philosophy. These, and many 
other books, are on sale at our.office.

Overwork and worry dwarfs many a child,
while idleness and self-indulgence is equally
bad. In the case of tw<K lads who seemed
cases of arrested development rather than
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Wimai and flit ImwIwM.'
BY SIHIK M. FOOL*. 

IMetuchen. Mow Jew.1

NOVEMBER.
Who eaid November’s face was grim?

Who eaid her voice was harsh aud sad?
I heard her sing ia wood-paths dim,

I met her on the shore, so glad. 
So entiling, I could kiss her feet! 
There never was a month so sweet.

Where short-lived wild flowers bloomed and died 
The slanting sunbeams fall across

Vine-broideries, woven, from side to side, 
Above mosaics of tinted moss—

So does the Eternal Artist’s skill 
Hide beauty under beauty, still.

And, if no note of bee or bird,
Through the rapt stillness of the wocds 

Orthe sea’s murmurous trance, be heard,
A Presence in. these solitudes, 

Upon the spirit seems to press 
The dew of God’s dear silences.

And if, out of some inner heaven
With soft relenting, comes a day

Whereto tlie-heart of June is given-
All subtle scents apd spicery, 

Through forest crypts and arches steal, 
- With power unnumbered hearts to heal.

This is the month of sunrise skies 
intense with molten mist and flame;

Out of the purple deeps, arise
Colors no painter yet can name;

Gold lilies and the cardinal flower, 
Were pale, against this gorgeous hour.

What idleness to moan and fret
For any season fair, gone byl

Life’s secret, Is not guessed at yet;
Veil under veil its wonders lie.

Througn grief and loss made glorious 
The soul ol past joy lives in us.

LucuLarcum.
A WOMAN’S CONGRESS.

The ninth annual Congress of the Associa­
tion for the Advancement of Women, was held 
in Buffalo. N. Y., on the 19th, 20th and 21st of 
October. This society has often been mention­
ed in these columns, but it seems to demand 
more than a brief notice. Originating in Soro- 
sis under the inspiration of its President, Char­
lotte B. Wilbour, it was hoped that its inter­
ests and aims should be national and general 
in character. In the little circular called “A 
Messenger.” which was scattered over the.coun- 
try, the objects of the society were thus set 
forth:

“The necessity of fellowship and concerted 
action among women interested in the advance­
ment of the race, and more especially of their 
own sex, is so apparent, that we do not hesi 
tate to assert that by far the larger portion of 
our efforts in that direction are fruitless, be­
cause they are solitary and isolated.

“ Thousands of noble and beneficent women 
scattered all over our country, are to-day think­
ing, writing and speaking the truths which 
all women heed and many are waiting to hear, 
and which would at once be a renovating force 
in tho land, if the believers could, in a con­
gregated body unite upon practical methods 
tor their incorporation into government, busi­
ness and social life.”

THE MUST CONGRESS.
Iu response to this call, a multitude of earn­

est, thoughtful women responded, and the first 
meeting was held in the citv of New York, 
October, 1873, with Mary A. Livermore Presi­
dent. It was a dignified body of able women, 
the exercises were crowded with interest and 
the papers read, constitute, when published in 
pamphlet form, a remarkably profound and 
orderly presentation of the condition, needs 
and hopes of women, the household and of 
society at large. Since then eight other meet­
ings have been held in as many cities The 
society has not outgrown entirely a certain nar­
row management which is, perhaps, inciden­
tal to all tentative understandings,but it would 
be impossible to state how much it has stimu­
lated thought, hope and effort in the hearts of 
women ; influenced public opinion,and enlarg­
ed the borders of women’s aims, opportuni­
ties and progress.

THE CONGRESS AT BUFFALO.
is fully repeated inthe Express of that city, 
in several columns, {sandwiched between '* Po 
Ileal Machine Work,” “ October Hieing.’’ and 
“The annual meeting of the Association of 
Congregationalists;” things so widely diverse, 
jostle each other in this world. Evidently the 
reporter was surprised to see such a body of 
noble matrons, conducting their deliberations 
in a calm, rational and temperate spirit. From 
the first, the liberal class of thinkers have been 
largely represented, and they are such as be­
lieve in harmony and order. Mingled with 
them arc a more conservative class, though 
holding advanced opinions upon woman’s du­
ties, responsibilities and labor. These win the 
audience to think upon topics very ably pre­
sented, for each one speaks of what she has 
special interest.

LIST OF ESSAYS READ DEBATED.
1. Influence of Foreign Study on American 

Girls. Mrs. Lucinda H. Stone, Mich.
2 Work of Women in the Reforms of the 

Past Century, Mrs. Lois G. Hufiord, Indiana.
8. Guardianship of Children, Status of the 

Mother, Mrs. Belva A. Lock wood, Washing­
ton, D. C.

4. The Ideal Home, Mrs. Edna D. Cheney, 
Massachusetts.

5. “ Rescue Work,” by Mrs. Dr. Elizabeth 
Blackwell, England.

6. Political Education of Women, by Miss 
Mary F. Eastman of Massachusetts.

7. Women of Eastern Europe, by Mr. Julia 
Ward Howe.

“ The Pursuit of Art,” Sarah W. Whitman; 
“Temperance,” Rev. AntoinetteB. Blackwell, 
N. J., and Rev. S. M. Perkins of Vt., (both 
Unitarians; “Factory Girls,” Mrs. Elizabeth/ 
B. Chase, R. I.; “Sericulture,” by Mr® Caro­
line M. Severance, showing that in the/earing 
of the silk-worm lay an inviting and/remun- 
erative field for woman’s work As the report 
of the last day's proceedings has not come 
to hand, the crowning topics and speakers of 
that day cannot now be given. It is safe to 
say, by the experience of other years, that such 
topics’as these were treated : “ Law as it affects 
Woman; Woman in the Pulpit,as Physician, 
as Teacher, etc.; Enlightened Motherhood; 
Woman’s Work in Philanthrophy, Prison Re­
form, Temperance and Peace; Co-operation; 
Organization of Household Labor, etc.

MEMBERS or THE ASSOCIATION. '

It is impossible to give a list of the humani­
tarian and cultured women who are enrolled 
among the workers of this society. Among 
those best known to the readers ofthe Journal. 
not mentioned above, are Bara A. Spencer of 
Washington,Mary F. Davis, Mrs.S. C. Hoffman 
and her sister, Mrs. Bascom, wife of Prof. Bas­
com, Madison, Wis, Mrs. Lita Barney Sayles, 
correspondent of the Journal, Rev. Phebe 
Hanaford, Jersey City, Kate N. Doggett and 
Elizabeth Boynton Harbert of Chicago, Rev. 
Caroline A Saute, Catharine A. F. Stebbins, and 
Charlotte Fowler Wells, Among medical wo­
men are Dra Susan G. Edson-remembered 
as the nurse of President Garfield--and Alida 
C. Avery of Denver; Dm Blake Clisley and 
Zakrzewekaof Boston; Blackwell, Webster/

Miller, Holcombe. Hastings, Austin, Bond, 
Botsford. Loring, New York State, and many 
from other parts of the Union. The list of 
names given is necessarily meagre.

To go back to Buffalo and the meeting there, 
it is, perhaps, as well to give verbatim extracts 
from the daily papers of that beautiful city, 
which is rather conservative in regard to wo­
man’s work. We premise that the masculine 
reporter seems much impressed by the fact 
that the assembly were well dressed aud good 
looking. He says:

DISTINGUISHED WOMEN.
On the stage were artists, poets, preachers, 

writers and workers—noble women all. At the 
left, the secretary, Mrs. Kate Gannett Wells, 
comely and with fine sympathetic features, 
and dressed in a plum colored silk which was 
extremely becoming; with her, the assistant 
secretary. Miss N. E. Blatchford. Near them 
sat Mrs. Edna D. Cheney, a lady of remarka­
ble power as a writer and lecturer in the field 
of art. Miss Abby W. May, another well known 
lady, was easily distinguished from her sis­
ters’ by the severe simplicity of her dress, both 
in texture and fashion. Towards the rear of
the stage was Mrs. Sara H. Spencer, a Wash- 
ington jady of elegant appearance, and who „ -
may with great respect be called the Roscoe I of Nature, by Sir William Thomson; The Du-
Conkling of the convention. Her brilliant 
style of speaking comports with the dash of 
dress, of broad brimmed Gainsborough, and 
the tastefully worn bits of color which con­
trasted strongly with the quietness of costume 
worn by Miss May. Miss Mary F. Eastman, 
in plain bonnet, with ribbons” tied under a 
very strong chin, was a prominent figure She 
is a well known platform and pulpit lecturer, 
and her calculating gray eyes do not belie the 
strength of thought and logical reasoning 
which mark every thing she does. She is one
of the most fluent, masterly woman speakers 
inthe country. Near Mrs President Howe 
sat Mrs Henrietta L. T. Wolcott, the treasur­
er of the association, and a lady of elegant and 
dignified bearing. Other ladies were coining 
and going on the stage as the exercises pro 
grossed.

THE PRESIDENT’S ADDRESS.
The President, Mrs Julia Ward Howe, step­

ping to the light reading stand at the front of 
the state, brought the audience to quiet order 
at a word. She wore a black silk dress, trim­
med with fringe and satin folds, and her white 
hair was drawn well back beneath a bonnet of 
seal brown. Mrs. Howe’s face is a strong but 
motherly one, her manner quiet, easy and dig­
nified, and her voice soft and not at all penetra 
ting. Her address of welcome was direct and 
simple in style, and was in outline as follows;

The work of tho Association for the Ad­
vancement of Women is essentially the solu­
tion of a problem of life. That problem is 
before- us, and it is our business to solve it. 
Whether we ga'her for a brief season to con­
sult together, or whether we study in the. iso­
lation of our homes, the object is the same-— 
it is to learn what it becomes us as women to 
do. and then to do it. As the church is an as­
semblage of worshipers whose duty consists 
in the individual practice of their religion, so 
is this congress an assemblage of women whose 
work is individual in their homes and imine 
diate surroundings, wherever they may be. 
The members of the association should., first 
of all, remember the freedom under which they
meet. A comparison with the condition of 
women in other lands would show more fully 
the blessings vouchsafed here. Compare the 
condition of the women of Turkey, where an | , . . . ,
edict from the sultan establisheaor forbids the- man. Tne doctor questioned him and found 
kind of veil a woman may wear, I *Ji3t He had been habiluur.y costive for years,

iso far as the speaker knew, Aire existed no j that now his kidneys were disordered and his 
other organization like the present association. [ whole system deranged Kidney-Wort was 
True, in Germany was a somewhat similar or- I recommended and faithfully taken and in aTrue, in Germany was a somewhat similar or­
ganization, but it was directed and officered
by men. This society was conducted exclu­
sively by women, and it looked to a public 
opinion from its own sex. The very nobility 
of its position thus occupied brings difficul­
ties, and there was danger, in the speaker’s 
opinion, that they show their likeness to the 
other sex by now and then mistaking sound 
for sense (The representative of the worser 
sex hereupon looked more lonesome than be­
fore.)

Under the heads of economics, ideals and 
methods, Mrs. Howe reviewed the field of 
available work for women As for the first, 
in active business and trade, women had been 
pushed to the wall. In the realm of ^ideals, 
foremost came religious doctrines. And here 
lay inequality at the start. Men, knowing 
themselves to be sinful, have little time or 
taste for repentance, and have, by a time hon­
ored custom, virtually requested the women 
to settle the sins of the men as well as their 
own. After full consideration of these points, 
she passed to that of methods, showing what 
could be done towards making education hu­
manizing and elevating. The women of this 
congress all find their first duty in the restric­
ted region of home; were all home loving and 
home serving. She believed that the time when 
it was necessary to make this statement to 
controvert an. erroneous public opinion had 
gone by

It seems invidious to mention only a portion. 
of the papers presented, but it is unavoidable. 
At a future date we shall make farther extracts 
from essays which are worthy of universal 
consideration. We close this brief notice with 
a little more upon our favorite topic,

THE HOME.
Women, and men too, may well listen to 

Mrs. Cheney on the Ideal - Home. Her ideal 
home is not the shining castle of the poet’s 
fancy, but a many-purposed family life. The 
monogamic family must form its basis. Love 
must .be its inspiration. The recognition of 
the equality of members must be its law She 
pictured the home of different grades of socie­
ty; the nomadic tent of the patriarch, the half 
civilization of the Moor, the wrong home ideas 
At the Roman, the Athenian The errors of 
Fourier and the Associationists were pointed 
out and the principal evils of modern home 
life depicted. Mrs. Cheney pronounced an 
earnest phillipic against tobacco, and which 
we doubt not many a good wife will ding in 
to the ears of her fumigating spouse from thia 
on for many days. The true reciprocity of 
the family relations were shown, and a picture 
drawn of the ideal home which would be like 
a seed in good ground, becoming a mighty tree 
whose leaves were for the healing of the na­
tions.

Discussion followed the heading of these 
papers, which in many respects were fully as 
interesting as the essays themselves,

Magazines for November not before Men­
tioned.

The Phrenological Magazine. (L.N. Fow­
ler, London, Eng.) Contente for October: Al­
fred Tennyson; The Face as Indicative of 
Character; The Teachings of Phrenology; Lee- 
fares on Phrenology; Influence of Tobacco on 
the Functions ofthe Brain; Breathing; Over­
work; ALong Sleep; Poetry; Little Kate and 
I; Facte and Gossip.

The Herald of Health. (M. L. Holbrook. 
M. D., New York.) Contente: Hygienic Treat- 
ment of Consumption; Au Ancient Health 
Book; Dangers and Diseases of the School­
room; Our Dessert Table; Editorial Depart­
ment; Studies in Hygiene for Women;

Wide Awake. (D. Lathrop & Co., Boston.) 
Contente: Frontispiece; Riga in the Chim­
ney; How they drowned out the Woodchuck; 
An Explanation for Mamma; Miss Tipty- 
Toes; How the Little Steadmans Had a Good 
Time: B»ya anti Banties; To Day; All Hal­
loween; Sharon; A Brave Boy; A Little Shop­
per; Kitty’s First School; Grandmother’s Bear 
Story; Grandfather’s Bear Story; Some Morn­
ing Orders; Having His Own Way; Tlie Man 
in the Moon in Folk Lore; The First Thanks­
giving Day; Rix’s First Errand; Making the 
Jack a lantern; The Boy King of Egypt; Pol­
ly Cologne; Home, Sweet. Home! Tangles; 
Music; Magna Charts Stories; Door yard 
Folks; Ways to do Things; Little Biogra­
phies; The Travelling Law-school; Health 
and Strength Papers; What to do about it,

Tlie Popular Science Monthly. (D. Ap­
pleton & Co., New York) Contents: The In­
dustrial Type of Society, by Herbert Spencer; 
Deterioration of American Oyster Beds, by 
Lieutenant Francis Winslow; Volcanoes.Their
Action and Distribution (llluatra ed); Physi­
cal Education, by Felix L. Oswald, M D.; 
A Half Century of Science, I By Sir John Lub­
bock ; Organic Remains in Meteoric Stones, 
by Francis Birgham; The Available Energy

ration of Human Life, by M. De Solaville; 
Worry, by Dr. J Mortimer Granville; Amer­
ican Climate and Character, by Edward C.
Towne; Sketch of George Jarvis Brush, by 
Professor T. R Lounsbury, (with portrait); 
Correspondence: Editor’s Table; Literary No­
tices; Popular Miscellany; Notes.

The Phrenological Journal. (Fowler & 
Wells, New York’) Contents: James A. Gar­
field; Lucretia Garfield; The Mould of Mind; 
Presidential Nasotogy; People who live in 
Grooves; Alvan Clark; The Puritan Child; 
Old Aunt Dinah; Mother and Daughter; Vege- i 
tarijinism and Teetotalism; Danger of Exces­
sive' Fatness; Why we get Sick; Eccentricities 
of Bullets; Notes in Science and Agriculture; 
Poetry; Editorial Items; Answers to Corres­
pondents; Personal; Library.

The Book-Keeper. (Office No. 76 Cham­
ber street, New York.) A fortnightly maga­
zine devoted to Commercial Science, Business 
Economy aud Practical Knowledge.

The Student’s Journal. (Andrew J Gra­
ham, New York ) Devoted to Phonography, 
Music, Hygiene. Philology, Bibliography, etc.

Revue Spirit? Journal D'Etades P$;wi0‘ 
logiquca. (M Leymarie, Paris, France ) This 
Magazine is devoted to the Spiritual Philoso- 
phy.with able writers.

Psyehiche Studien. (Oswald Mu-ze, Leip­
zig Germany.) An able exponent of Spiritual- j 
ism, having as contributors some of the lead- I 
ing writers of Europe. |

Our Little Ones. (The Russell Publishing 
Co., Boston, Mass.) A magazine containing 
beautiful illustrations and stories, for the 
youngest readers.

Golden Pays. (James Elverson. Philadel­
phia, Pa ) An illustrated weekly for boys and i 
girls . ■

Babyland. (D. Lothrop & Co., Boston, 
Mass ) A magazine for jmunuest readers fill­
ed with short stories and illustrations. ,

‘ My Back Aches So, 
and I feel miserable,” said a hard-working

short time every trouble waa removed The 
cleansing and tonic power of this medicine 
on the bowels and kidneys is wonderful.— 
Congregationalist.

A western coroner’s jury returned a verdict 
that the deceased came to his death from ex­
posure “ What do you mean by that?” asked 
a relative of the dead man. “ There are two 
bullet holes in his skull.” “Just bo,’’ said the 
coroner,, “ he died from exposure to bullets.”

Lydia E. Pinkham’s Vegetable Compound 
has done thousands of women more good than 
the medicines-of many doctors. It is a posi­
tive cure for all female complaints, bend to 
Mrs. Lydia E» Pinkham.

He who strings the pearls of moderation, 
industry and self denial, on the cord ot a high 
courageous character, shall wear the jewels 
of a noble manhood.

In the cure of severe coughs, weak lungs, 
spitting of blood, and the early stages of Con- 
sumption, Dr. Pierce’s “Golden Medical Dis­
covery,” has astonished the medical faculty. 
While it cures the severest coughs, it strength­
ens the system and purifies the blood. By 
druggists.

" It looks like the scene of a great battle,” 
remarked a traveler, viewing the work of a 
recent cyclone atthe west. “Yes,” said the 
native, solemnly, and without removing his 
pipe, “ the place was tuk by storm.”

Day Kidney Pad Co., Buffalo, N. Y.: Gen­
tlemen—I have had rheumatism since I was 
a boy, and vour Pad has cured me entirely, 

WM. MONTGOMERY, Acker, Can.
The Paas cure all diseases of kidney and 

urinary organs. $2. by druggists or by mail.

No man has so grievously fallen at any time, 
but he may rise again. And on the other hand, 
no man taketh so fast footing but he may fall.

Horsford’s Avid Phosphate
In Loss of Appetite.

Hereford’s Acid Phosphate is used with 
great success in languor, loss of appetite an 
hypochondria.

The true church is society informed by the 
spirit of God. True religion is the health of 
the spirit manifest in healthy and beneficent 
action.--B. Hedge.

Warner’s Safe Kidney and Liver Cure.

INVENTORS
Desirous of advertising any Specialty, or 
articles of their own manufacture,in City 
or Country Newspapers, will save money 
by consulting us. Correspondence soli­

cited. C. A. COOK & CO.,
Advertising Agents, CHICAGO, HAS,

8018 82 16 ________
TO:CLERGYMEN AND OTHERS.

The Tobacco Habit Cored,
NO DRUGS. MAILED INSTRUCTIONS. $1.00.

WILLIS S. YATES, K. 3, 111 Masira «t,
sis 11 NEW YORK.

MRS. E. V. WI LSON
Inform* all Friend that (he will respond to calli accompanV 
ed by her daughter# (both Medium#—Inspiration*! and Test). 
Im Wilson Porter sud Lol# A. Wilson, and tire Parlor En­
tertainments. Tert Seances 4nd Prints Sittings. For term# 
and particulars apply to MaK, V. Wilson, Lombard, Du 
ftpw.,111. Ilttt

r?ft ALL NEW STYLE Chromo Card*, No‘2alike 
• V name on. Wets. Clinton Bro#., Clintonville. Conn.

ill V S3 eeow

"agentswantedflSSltaSlyKnW.
tiller Machine ever invent,'-i. W:; tint a pin;1 of

, ,«-n^u.:~, w.tir HEEL, and TOE complete, iu 
ainm.?, It will also knit a great variety of fancy- , 
work for which there ia a*, wav* a ready market. S-rJ 1 l 
Jot < ^ifa and terms to the Twombly Knitting j I 
M*cMael*o.,4iBWiiasfeiiSt.1li'JStsiilXiS> | f
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MAGA! CATARRH and NAoHL BRONCHITIS.
Childs Treatment for Nasal anil Bronchial 
Catarrh is the only one that can be relied 
upon for the Permanent and positive 
(®^Home Treatment. S3 
jr. For details of method and terms, address Hev. T. P« CHII.DS, Troy, OMO.
S313 82 Iieow

SCSCPSBLB’S FATESFO

CAKE GRIDDLE

3

PDCC AICTI Accpyofmy Med- r ilEt VI* I # leal Common 
sense Hook will be sent to any person affleted with Ooa- • 
aumptton. Bronchitis, Asthma, Bora Throat, or Mm*I 
Catarrh. It 1* elegantly printed and Illustrated; 144 pace* 
law. 1879. It has been the mean# of saving many vaiusbi* 
lives. Send name and post-office addreu, with six cent* port­
age for mailing. The book Is Invaluable to persons suffering 
with any disease of the Noss, Throat or Lunar Addreu. 
Dr. N. B. WOLFE, Cincinnati, Ohio.

UTState the paper lu which you saw tuts advertiser ent. 
W-ffi.
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The NEATEST arri ar? PRACTICAL thine cwt 

^•p:i. t’bsiiKH fVfVvJtn-iv. Every family v.ant'< nn-‘. -so 
viip afterr.aniTv.T;' L? with-it ’for numy tiin—• il^copt* 
L-T^Thc Koiin'lPansh’i’ii: hinged 
cm :;ie turned into £ :pb»ncr pan a tu:»ii asitk-i ’iflSrH-nt- 
«ytb-.ftf-n<mviiib^".! 1 Ho rotra-l pan ntr.mt :iFvanyfor 
anothvr cabj. lint CrrHMte'i arvinfuh* of va-t ir'di asvx 
v.’vi;;h S^miu’KritMle bv esrr-"?-* in bhsp:»n;f”h-sN 
W.>; bv mail :w<or< d 31.25. POSTAGE STAMPS 
TAKEN# S’i"iiforynnplei?.:ude and tcniHintents; 
eanviv 5 year town ri^tt awav, you will t’?nui -ri4 d a* 
the «rvar nujntvr c-<» iters yon will pet. Aibteess F# E 
VAN ETTES. Manu^’r. 20S jziSaHeSt., ChiCi.JG, 111.
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A New Edition of E. V. Wilson’s. Book,

THE TRUTHS»' SPIRITUALISM,
With a Sae Photo. Engraving of the Author, 811.50.
Also Cabins* Photo, of E. V. W&on, 50c.: Memorial 

Pictures, each "Sc. For sale by application to Mrs. E. V. 
Wilson. Loinbird. Da Pago Co., UI;, where all orders will 
be promptly tilled, ■ si S f

HOPE-DEAF
Dr. Peck's Artificial Ear Drums

PERFECTLY RESTORE THE HEARING 
and perform tbe work of the Natural Drum. 

'Always in position, but Invisible to others.
AU Conversation and even whispers heard d:s- 
tinctlv. W# refer to those using Hot. Send for 

■ Ceserfptive circular with testimonials. Address, 
H, P. K. PECK & CO., S33 Broadway, New York.

Agents wanted for tlie Life nnd Work of 

GARFIELD 
Theonly complete &tory<»f!us nohh’Hfi’arjl iiaz.n 
death# Vn^-h* brilliant.r<*ii«mte. Eh’vriuUy pa ininl 
in EngHvh nnd German; nin^iiiicfi.uyUth- 
trated; jLiiH^ompI.v Ennui. Fi^te^t j-vUir^ bin's 
^ver’>!ih;?«auiL By Joint <'. lUdimtli# LL.IK 
rAtrTTnir n*-VAUXXvli vanibvii ejiupJ^u with
v.H ’j tun country whuMiib-L 'iiivy an* utterly 
v?rthh“-:’; a’tf>u!r;y.5p up.m tin- nKajoryuiUn’ ^r^at 
i?. ^^alid a bu«x» fraud on tiio public. This hvC te 
entirely new. TLp mHy work v»- rUty d;“ thvh-Os 
^*:n<l uOc. in stamp* for A#eHt% Outfit,f

J’>m> BeoihelS^ Co,! Chicagj «C:K»bLiti.
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NEW RICH BLOOD!
Parsons' Purgative pills make New Rich 

Bteml, an-1 will completely change the bleed in 
tlieentirer-ystem in three mont'.m. Anvper-an 
who will take 1 rill each nightfrom 1 to 12 weeks 
mavhe rertored’tosound health, if sueha thing 
Le possible. Sentlw mail for S letter stamps.

I. 8. JOHNSON A- GO., Hosto». Mass., 
formerly Hangar, Me.
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PKOOF PALPABLE 
.OF' 

IMMORTALITY, 
Bein J »n Account of the Materialization Phe­

nomena of Modern Spiritualism, with Re­
marks on the Relations of the Facts to 

Xheology.Morals and Religion. 
Bv EPES SARGENT,

Author of ‘ Planchette, a History of Modern Spiritualism,’ etc. 
Price, paper covers. 75 cents, postage free; cloth. 

$1.00, postage tree.
•.•For Erie, wholesale and retail, by the lixUGio-Pnu er 

loraicth Pi-BLXsuiMO Hous*. Chicago.

THE CLERCY
A SOURCE OF DANGER

sTOTHE
AMERICAN REPUBLIC.

By W. F. JAMIESON.
This work I* written in the rigorou*. Iconoclastic vein, whit* 

te bo characteristic of Its author, quoting largely from the ut­
terances aud writings of clergymen to sustain hts position. It 
embraceaamMsorracwin regard tothe attempt* ofthe Com- 
tian movement to control the government toise found no- 
where else#

Price *1.50. Postage 8 Cents. - .
For sale, wholesale and retail, by the JUeUglo-PhlIO*ophlO*l 

Publishing House, Chicago._____ ___________

JUST PUBLISHED.

WHAT WAS HE?
OR -

JESUS IN THE LIGHT 
Ofthe Nineteenth Centurv. 

Br WILLIAM DENTON.

Thia work presentssonreoftlseconcluslonsarrivedatbys 
study ofthe Gospel accounts or Jesus; and gives a faint out 
line of what psychometry reveals regarding hte parentage, 
life, and resurrection; leaving the complete portrait for an* 
turn life.
Cloth, 31.25. Paper, 81.00. Postage, 10 cts 

JFor sale, wholesale and retail, at the office otthi* rumen

"straw VISITORS^
A SERIES OF ORIGINAL PAPERS,
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POETRY, ABT. FICTION, SATIRE, HUMOR, 
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terestlng nature. ' . ■ .

The we of this extraordinary Work Is constant an-1 *te*dy.
'Price, W.5»; postage JOc.

.’Jot sale, wholesale and retail, by the lUKSio-fKlO- 
MMidUiPiBnsBms Hons*. Chicago. '

W. B.OSGOOS. M. F. Eibling
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IMWTBR^

12 aivi 13 Timet BulHing, 179 W^hington 81.
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XVl’icturlal Boole*and Bible*. Price* reduced83 percent.
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OOI n by Watchmakcra. By mail, 30 cts. Circmai* 
OULiU FREE-}. 8. BIBCU A CO„IBD<iSt,M 

30 14 32 13

Would You Know Yourself
CONSULT WITH A. B. SEVERANaV. TH* WBLL-XMOWB

P*ycltometei*t and Clairvoyant.
Come in person, or send by letter a lock ot your hair, or 

hand-writing, or a photograph; ho will give you a correct da 
lineation’of character giving instruction* for Mlf-Improve- 
ment, by! telling what faculties to cultivate and what tors- 
strain, giving your present physical, mental and spiritual ooa- 
dltton, giving part and 'stare eveau^telllng what kind of* 
medium you can develop Into, if any. What ourinem or pro- 
fusion you are but calculated for, to be luoceutai in Ilie. Ad­
vlee and counsel In buataeai matter*, alio, advice In retereau 
to marriage; the adaptation of one to the other, and, whether 
you are in a proper condition tor marriage; hint# and advice 
to those that are ta unhappy married relation*, how to make 
their path of lift emoother. Further, will give an examlnatloa 
of dI*eMU, and correct dlagnoeii, with a written prescription 
and instruction* for home treatment, which, tribe patient* 
follow, will Improve their health and condition every time. U 
It dou not effect a cure.

DKUMAVIOn.
h« ai*o mwi bi*n***» m#o»*tic*llt mb onnwio.
Tun:-Brief Delineation. *1.00. Full and Complete De­

lineation, 82.00. Diagnosis of DIimh, 11,00. DligUMl* and 
Prescription, #3.00. Full and Complete Delineation with Di- 
agnosia aud Prescription, #5.00. Addreu A B, Hirnsxoi, 
211 Grand Ave.. Milwaukee. WU vUniltf

RUPTURES
Cured In 80 nay# by my Medical Compound aud Rubber 
Eisitlc Appliance. Send Ftamp for Circular. Addre#* 
Cap?. W. A. Colmsgb, Smithville. Jefferson Co., N. York

THE PRESEAT OUTLOOK OF SPIR­
ITUALISM.

2 Y HENR Y KIBBLE.
Tiih S3H sSc. thoughtful am! c.-.inprekeEFivo aay.de- 

Eerdtg of wide i‘Seu.ails3 aud the ara®: waKcraitor. ot 
every Spiritualist.

FamplilA. 21 paces. Price ii cents.
Fer trie wholesale aral-rc'ufl by tie Eei'glo-Fhi’OKphltai 

FuWif/aiis attije.'Cl^

Sexual Physiology.
A Science and Popular Exposition of ihe Funda* 

mental Problems of Sociology.
By B.T. TRALL, M. B.

Cloth. Km., 304 pages, IHustratail. Price, tLGO;
Postage, IO Coma.

This J^Uy fip-te work. convoymR eurha large MBtuut of 
valuable information, baa already passed throunli thirty edi­
tion;’. and is nav.tig an frtf-F.re ,»;■?. For sale. wtelMle 
and retail, by the F,S:g::ofti;®p!L:£ Puti^hig House, 
Chicago. ■

Life Beyond the Cxiwe, 
Described by. a Spirit Through a Writing- 

Medium.
•Die future life aa described In detail by a spirit, through a 

■-■fitiiiR-iiirtai, h.w been given In this volume. There is so 
mse-i in It that a person feels ought to be true, that its recital 
fey a disembodied s pint, with all the necessary circumstance. 
USuCleieat to bring conviction.
Published from English sheets, nnd bour.il In cloth. Price, 11. 

Postage In e.
VFsrsils, wholesale and rehW. by the BsilGW-PldW- 

sopnicrt PtBasHisa Houbb. Chicago.

THE GOSPEL OP NATURE
Bv SHERMAN & LYON,

AWioratg" Tlie Hollow Globe."
Th's book contains many startling Ideas that are calculated 

to dispel the iiiyat.hcat’on and unravel the numerous difficui- 
ties by which thinking minda have been environed concern­
ing the great problems of human existence. The contents are 
divided into ten different subjects, as follows: The Soul of 
Things; Intelligence; Intellect; Discords: Progression;Jus­
tice :Kia Science of Death; The Confounding of Language; 
Spirit Alwdea; Spirit Biography.

For tale, wholesale and retail, by the Retlgto-PUUosophiav 
Publishing Huime. Chicago.

THE HIROKI OF THE CONFLICT
BBTWEEN

RELIGIOXaiylSCIENCE,
Br JOHN W. W?®, M. D.

1 Vol., 121110. CToth. Price. 91.75.

The conflict of which lie treats has been a mighty tragedy of 
l-.iimau’tytliri hi;:-tiri-wi nations into vortex and involved 
I Ue fate of empires, 'i lie work is full of ins truction regarding 
the rise of tlie great ideas of reienee anil pbtlcsupliy; and de- 
scribes in an Impnixre manner and with dramatic effect, the 
way rekgions authority has employed the re-eater power to ob- 
itriu-t the progress of knowledge and eyush out the spirit ot 
investigation. ■

.•.For sale, wholesale and retail, by the EltiGloPntw- 
iomwal Publishing House,ttuiisi.

f« of tie life. Beyoil ani WiiMt
Voices from many lands and centuries saying. “ Man, tin* 

Shalt never die.”
Edited and Compiled by GILES B. STEBBINS.
“It begins withold Hindoo poems, and will bo of interest 

not only to Spiritualists, but to all who love the Qulckenlngor 
the beat poetry.”—Syracuse Standard.

“Clear type and tinted paper make fit setting for it* rid, 
cotLtetua."—Jlocht»ur Union.

•‘The *eleet!on* show culture and acholawhlp. From all 
thepagesfloataaBWeetperfumeof purity, and there u no *pol 
or XemlBh. No one can read without feeling elevated and eo 
nobled hv the exquisite viewa of a future life. It is in evert 
respect meet creditable to the fplritual library.”—ffwlM( 
Tuttle.
Price, $1.50, mailed free o£ postage. Gilt $2.
For Mie. wholesale and retail, at the office of this paper.
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Science of Spiritualism,
PRINCIPLES?

READ THE

ARCAKA OF SPIRITUALISM;
AManualof Spiritualscience andPhlfosopljy

BY HUDSONTUTTLE.
We have received a lunpivof the English Edition, oont*l»> 

tng a fine photograph otMr, Tuttle. Of thl# remarkable vol. 
tune A J. Davis says, “It is a bright, wholesome, beautifid 
book, and bean in every Une the royal badge of integrity, ia- 
dustry. and inspiration. « * * • • The self-evident in­
tegrity of motive which breathes out wholesome facta and apt 

e illustration* on every p«ge, pours* sacred *uthoiifr«Y*rtM 
entire production.” ■
Judge Edmunds wrote of It on first appearances— 

k»:hMi»»»””^ • ’ • 
Eugene Crowell, M.D., writes:—
”• The Arcana of Nature’ Is one ofthe very bertpWk>loMaB& 

expositions of Spiritualism that has yet appeared. ’
“The* Arcana of Nature* is a perfect encyvlopodi*, net 

only of » spiritual.fact, bnt of tbewholeziatareofBMSu*
Ax# Human Nature.

THICK, #1.50. POSTAGE, 10 CENTS.
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G. B. Stebbins.—Editorial Farewell.

With this issue my editorial connection 
with the Religio-Philosophioal Jour­
nal ceases. My wish and expectation has 
been to remain to the close of the year, but 
illness compels me to leave. My eyes fail, 
and my hand protests by its stiffness against 
its too severe task. At sixty-four one can­
not do the work which was a pastime at 
forty, and it is too late for me to undertake 
editorial duties or to be active in the pion­
eer lecture-field. Of the arduous labor and 
constant care needed to conduct the Jour­
nal its readers should have a just appreci­
ation, leading to its active support.

Those who have thanked me for my ef­
forts here, in the past few months, I 
gratefully thank in return, and those who 
have criticised me frankly and in good faith 
are equally entitled to my thanks.

In a few days I leave for my home at De­
troit, Michigan, where my postoffice address 
will be after Nov. 18th.

Giles B. Stebbins.

The Prayer Test—Whar the Seymour 
Times has to say on the Position of the 
Rellgio-Phllosophical Journal.

Concerning the editorial on “The Prayer 
Test andthe Science of Medicine,” which re­
cently appeared in the Journal, the Bey- 
mour (Ind.,) Times has raised objections. 
After praising the good sense of the main 
portion of the article, it says:

... .What a melancholy commentary on 
sanity and the defenceless condition of the 
human intellect in the whirlwind of hallu­
cination is presented when he gravely and 
with apparent sincerity, adds the follow­
ing:

How readily would a clairvoyant have 
pointed out the position of the baU, and with 
how much more certainty than the electric 
balance I And yet with what contempt 
would this proposition have been received!

On which it makes the following com­
mentary:

That a clairvoyant could have pointed 
out the position of the ball quite as ac­
curately as the electric balance is quite 
probable. The electric balance isn’t yet a 
reliable instrument, and surgery has to be 
backed up by common sense. But the 
greatness of the patient appalled the sur­
geons and common sense took flight. Then 
they fought wild. Had Garfield been a 
poor man in the hands of an average physi­
cian in a country village he would have re 
covered. Very little surgery was required 
in his case. All he wanted was a medical 
attendant who had learned theart of letting 
his patients alone:

But to assume that what is called clair­
voyance, a pretended trance state in which 
the animal brain is adapted to the enter­
tainment and control of an‘invisible in­
habitant of the air, a disembodied spirit, 
which by virtue of its escape froixuE-mS- 
terial, human brain, sees things hidden 
from .mortal eye and ken—to assume that 
this pretended trance state enables the me­
dium to receive and impart the knowledge 
possessed by a “spirit* is to admit the 
demonology and witchcraft so ably set 
forth in the Holy Bible

The only explanation is (for most people 
with cranks are sincere and honest), that 
insanity is the rule and perfect sanity the 
exception with the human animal. A man 
or woman able to take a level considera­
tion on all subjects is the exception. Most 
of us are constructed with obliquities and 
weaknesses and imperfections that pervert, 
warp and dwarf our judgment, blind dur 
perception and distort the impressions 
made upon the brain by our surroundings. 
And the knowledge of this, our pitiable 
condition, should soften us into tolerance 
and charity for our fellows and All our 
hearts with sympathy and loving kindness 
for all who are struggling for truth and 
the elevation of our race to a nobler man­
hood and a purer happier life.

we know of. There is something about 
Materialism which tends to such results; 
converting a manto a first-class egotist. 
The editor has expressed his opinion, and 
in such a way it would seem that he thinks 
it a finality, and there is no chance or 
need of reply. Luckily, however, it is 
after all only his opinion, and he brings 
not a single proof to support his bare as­
sertions. Even his bare statement that the 
President would have recovered if let alone, 
is in conflict with the known facts of the 
case. His physicians might not have 
known the condition of the wound, but 
that had nothing to do with the result, for 
the wound has been pronounced by those 
who are thoroughly competent to judge in 
the matter, to have been necessarily mor­
tal.

But this is not as essential as the next 
position denying clairvoyance, and the pow­
er of a clairvoyant to locate the ball. “Clair­
voyance,” he says, “is a pretended trance 
state,” and that any one should believe in 
, shows that “insanity is the rule and san­
ity the exception with the human animal.*' 
Aside from the main question, we pause 
to express our gratitude that we have a 
knowledge of a philosophy which is above 
the appalling view of man here expressed. 
After all he is to the editor of the Times 
only a “human animal,” a thinking beast, 
to go down to deathlike the brute, die and 
go baek to dust. With this poor “animal” 
“insanity is the rule,” "sanity the excep­
tion,” and only such men as the editor of 
the Seymour Times, are fully sane, and 
their sanity is proved by their denial of 
everything that exalts life above the gross 
realm of the material senses.

We said Dr. Monroe brought no proof; he 
does at last, however, and says: “... .to as­
sume that this, pretended trance state en­
ables the medium to receive and impart 
the knowledge possessed by a 'spirit/ is to 
admit the demonology and witchcraft so 
ably set forth by the Holy Bible.” In his 
intense hatred of the Bible, that Spiritual- 
igiii has anything in common with it, to 
him is sufficient evidence that it is false! 
That is all tbe proof heoffers against it; and 
this proof we regard as in its favor, for it ex­
plains the Bible and all other so-called 
sacred books, and offers a key whereby the 
secrets of the soul may be unlocked.

Dr. Monroe unconsciously admits a state 
of true trance when he calls clairvoyance a 
“pretended trance.” What this state is he 
does not attempt to define. He has never 
investigated Spiritualism or clairvoyance; 
he will have nothing in reference to them 
in the columns of his paper. In this he is 
as “hard-shelled” as any churchman aud 
as violent in his expressions. Mark the 
following passage and remember that it is 
from the columns of a liberal paper:

But while we cannot discuss nor suffer 
to be discussed in our columns the merits or 
demerits of clairvoyance and Spiritualism, 
these being subjects foreign to our purpose 
while priestcraft is all predominant, we 
cannot suppress our wonder that modern 
believers in demonology, spirit existence 
and communication with human beings, 
seeing into the future and the impenetrable 
by the clairvoyant eye, and healing by the 
laying on of hands, as did the “Savior” and 
his apostles, should reject the Bible and 
modern Christianity.

The Times is too occupied in proving 
mana “human animal,” with beastly at­
tributes and desires, and destroying all 
aspirations for spiritual existence, to give 
place to a line in their favor. Its ed­
itor believes with Bennett .and others 
that error in the form of “priestcraft” can 
be destroyed with the bludgeon, and that 
the proper way to rule it is by the rude 
manners of brutal force. They know noth­
ing of the silent power of pure spiritual 
energy; while it is notorious, and has been 
abundantly prominent to Materialists 
themselves, that Spiritualism has wrought 
greater changes in public opinion from 
superstition and bigotry, to free thought 
and knowledge, than any other special 
movement of the century.

The editor of the Times is again wrong 
in his statement that Spiritualism “rejects 
the Bible and Christianity.” Some Spirit­
ualists may do so, but' Spiritualism itself 
regrets only error and accepts truth wher­
ever found. Whatever is true in the Bible, 
it makes its own, and while it eschews the 
methods of churchianity, it has nothing 
but praise for true Christianity. Because 
selfishness has made capital out of the 
blood of the martyr Jesus, it does not re­
gard it as a reason for denying his exist­
ence or his service to mankind, in giving 
his life for the truth. Oh! no. Brother of 
the Times, it weeds out of Christianity all 
that, belongs to the “human animal,” and ■ 
takes for its own what is essentially spirit­
ual. .

We fully appreciate, as will every Spirit­
ualist; the sadness of the fiwwhenit 
contemplates the "obliquities,” “weakness­
es,” and “imperfections that pervert, warp 
and dwarf our judgment, blind our percep­
tions and distort the impressions made on 
him by our surroundings,” only the object 
on which it is bestowed is different We 
feel all this when looking over the dreary 
columns of Materialist papers. We feel 
sad when we see a man of the acumen of 
the editor of the Times, devoting his 
energies to prove himself and his subscrib­
ers “human animals,” and attempting to 
blot out all the infinite longings and pure 
aspirations of the spirit for immortal life. 
We are sad when we see one who boasts of
liberality as a leader of -free thought, with 
the same bigoted narrowness of the con­
servatism hehates.closehiscolumns against 
what, if true, is the grandest system of 
belief of the ages. Contrast this with the 
policy of the Religio-Philosophical

Journal, which gives Materialism fair 
and impartial hearing, not being afraid of 
its triumph so long as Spiritualism is rep­
resented by its advocate.

We might Indefinitely enlarge this arti­
cle by an array of facts substantiating the 
claims of Spiritualism and the capabilities 
of clairvoyance, but the Religio-Philo- 
sophioal Journal has for years been a 
repository of such facts, and will furnish 
the re der with an overwhelming amount 
of evidence. This evidence has convinced 
such men as Crookes, Varley, Zollner, But- 
lerof and a host of others equally eminent, 
and we earnestly ask the Editor of the 
Times if it is not at least slightly rash to 
pronounce all this grand army of leaders in 
seieiice, philosophy and letters, "insane.” 
Would it not be wise for him to investigate 
the subject as they have? As he now 
stands, he reminds one of a man with eyes 
tightly bandaged,declaring there is no light, 
and angry at those who assure him there is. 
He neither will let any one else remove the 
bandage, nor take it off himself; and 
although spiritually blind, declares his 
sight better than the best.

Anti-Spiritual Orthodox Darkness.

A subscriber and valued friend in Wes­
tern New York sends us the following from 
a journal called The Countryside'.

“Mankind have always tried to peep into 
the future life, but it is a question if the 
veil to that world Is not mercifully closed. 
If immortality of the soul be granted, the 
theory of departed ones’ still having knowl­
edge of this life involves consequences 
more awful than pleasing to the thoughtful 
mind....If we fully believed it and com­
prehended all the consequences, it would 
make a tremenduous difference to our lives. 
Many a man and woman would then prefer 
annihilation.’’

The editor selects, to point the moral of 
his. strange conclusions, a doleful and most 
unnatural story from Macmillan’s Maga- 
zine, entitled “Lost,” the gloomy crisis of 
whichisthe anguish of a wife who looks 
back to earth and sees her husband with a 
second companion. One thing is notewor­
thy. This "Countryside” man is original. 
The noblest pages of the Bible, the most 
golden inspirations of the great poets of the 
ages, the tenderest thoughts of gifted 
preachers, Protestant and Catholic, and the 
divlnest words of the classic Pagans, all 
dwell on the sweet joys of immortality and 
the undying hope that those in the life be­
yond can see us and care for us; but this 
poor “lost” editor has reached new dark­
ness ! Did he ever wish to be cut off from 
all knowledge, in this life, of what his rela­
tives and friends are doing daily, lest he 
might suffer pain from their misdeeds ? Do 
not the joys of social life, and the pleasures 
of human grace and goodness far overbal­
ance the frailty and error that we constant­
ly see ? How miserable this man would be, 
isolated from all knowledge of his kind! 
Does he want to make his ancestry and his 
departed friends miserable by cutting them 
off from all knowledge of his life?

The one sweet grace in the Roman Cath- 
olic Church is the Idea of the intercession 
of the saints—-who see us and help us in 
their heavenly abodes. Their power to do 
so, which the Catholic devoutly believes, 
adds rich enjoyment to their angelic exist­
ence—the enjoyment of practical useful­
ness.

Mrs. Mary Fletcher, a co-worker with 
John Wesley and a woman eminent in good­
ness, said: “Nor doth it seem contrary to 
reason to suppose a spirit In glory can turn 
its eyes with as much ease, and look on any 
object below, as a mother can look through 
a window on her children and see their ac­
tions in a court beneath,” and she suggests 
that spirits can impress us and “converse 
with our spirits,” as easily as when they 
were on earth.

But these good souls and great teachers 
did not have the benefit of orthodoxy run­
ning mad against Spiritualism. They never 
dreamed of such foggy nonsense as the 
‘Countryside” delights in!

Well-Earned Promotion.

Mr. John M Eddy is one of the rising 
railroad men of the West. In noticing his 
recent promotion the Chicago Tribune says:

“ Mr. J. M. Eddy, formerly General Agent 
of the Atchison, Topeka and Santa Fe Rail­
road in this city, and for the past year Su­
perintendent of the Construction of the ex­
tension of the Texas and Pacific to El Paso, 
has been appointed Superintendent of the 
Missouri, Kansas and Texas Division of the 
Missouri Paciflc railroad from Hannibal to 
Minnesota, and from Junction City to Par­
sons, with headquarters at Sedalia, Mo. He 
will assume the duties of his new office 
Nov. 5th. The promotion of Mr. Eddy to so 
important and responsible a position will be 
a source of great satisfaction to his many 
friends in this city, and the general verdict 
will be that he deserves his good luck. . Mr; 
Eddy is an able and energetic railroad man, 
a skilled civil engineer, ahd is thoroughly 
posted in the operations of railroads, in 
which he has had a long experience. That 
the old Missouri, Kansas and Texas will 
prosper under his management, and will 
soon become one of thebest handled lines 
in the country, there is no doubt among 
those who know what kind of material,Mr. 
Eddy is made of.”

As a boy, Mr. Eddy was an expert in slid­
ing down hill. Some of the ladies who 
recall with pleasure the skill and enthusi­
asm he displayed in engineering the sled 
down hill and his patience and perseverance 
in dragging it up again, claim to have pre­
dicted therefrom his future greatness as a 
promoter of rapid transit.

Boston Bile and Blabber.

The JR. P. Journal, ot Chicago, has not 
ascertained as yet that this paper has been, 
by the addition of four pages, enlarged one- 
half of its former size; but it, on the con­
trary, has room for a gratuitous fling at us, 
which clearly shows the animus of that 
sheet.-—Banner of Eight, Nov. 5th.

Thus tearfully scolds the ancient* sen­
sitive who edits the “oldest spiritual paper 
on earth.” Alas! his youthful friend out 
West cannot please him though he should 
sit up nights to try. The Journal quo­
ted from its illustrious contemporary one 
of its most eloquent, truthful and heart­
moving editorial paragraphs, embodying 
more truth than Bro. Colby generally gets 
into the same space. We quote it again in 
proof of this assertion:

“Had it not been for donations we have 
occasionally received from generous heart­
ed souls, to-day would find us financially in 
the slough of despond.”

Instead of being pleased at this courtesy 
from his modest Western contemporary the 
dear old man of Boston waxes wroth and 
calls it a “gratuitous fling.” Well, well! 
children are hard to suit, whether in their 
first or second childhood and so his petu­
lance must be overlooked.

Regarding Theodore Parker’s or rather 
Bro. Colby’s first assertion that we have 
not "ascertained” that the organ of Hazard, 
Reed, Crindle, James & Co., has “enlarged 
one half,” we wish to say confidentially, 
we have been made aware of the mourn­
ful fact Indeed we “ascertained” the ne­
cessity of such an enlargement on the 
part of our high-spirited contemporary  sim­
ultaneously with it own illumination, to- 
wit: The moment Dr. Eugene Crowell an­
nounced the publication in New York of 
Ihe Two Worlds. For shame. Dr. Crowell! 
You, a wealthy and retired gentleman 
to thus come forward and materialize 
new perplexities and burdens for a poor 
soul on the ragged edge of the “financial 
slough of despond.” O Parker, Greeley, 
Lincoln, Socrates, Raymond. Swedenborg, 
Gruff, Billy-the-Boot-black, Blackhawk, 
Hermes, Texas-Jack and all the rest of the 
noble “band” alleged to be in charge of the 
old B of L, why is this thus, why have you 
allowed your favorite organ to be thus 
tried? Is it forsooth, that Hazard, Reed &■ 
Co., may be obliged to put forth further 
exertions, "financially” as it were, on the 
treacherous banks of the “slough of des­
pond?”

The Religio-Philosophical Journal 
circulates, not only among intelligent, clear­
headed Spiritualists, but is largely read by 
equally intelligent, clear-headed, truth-lov­
ing investigators who, through its impar­
tial, scientific and philosophical treatment 
of SpirituMtom are being gradually led 
into new !®ht. Hence we hesitated to 
let them know that spiritual literature was 
being cursed by an additional flood of inan­
ity and intellectual small beer; fearing to 
disgust those who are turning from the 
weed-grown fields of orthodoxy, eagerly 
seeking for the golden wheat they have been 
told lies beneath the chaff in Spiritualism. 
But we hesitate no longer, for is it not bet­
ter that we soothe the sensitive soul in Bos­
ton than that we convince thousands of the 
fact that man continues to live beyond the 
grave and can return and communicate? 
Yes, indeed! Let the dear old man commune 
in peace with the spirit of his favorite friend 
Mr.N. E. Rum, let him defend “Crindle,” 
James et id omne genus to his hearts content ? 
For is it not a less calamity that the world 
remain ignorant of the saving truths taught 
in the Journal, than that the forlorn 
Boston bachelor should be thus annoyed?

Mrs. Crandall, alias Crindle in Trouble.

The thorough expose of Mrs. Crandall- 
“Crindle’’-Reynolds, at Clyde, Ohio, as de­
tailed on the eighth page, may possibly con­
vince some of her enthusiastic admirers, of 
the wisdom ofthe Journal’s refusal to 
advertise her as a physical medium until 
she had demonstrated to its editor the 
truthfulness of her claims. That she may 
be a medium is quite possible; that she is 
an unprincipled, dangerous character is cer­
tain. The Banner of Light, by its wilful 
and persistent support of such tricksters 
is largely responsible for the disgrace con­
stantly being heaped on the spiritual move­
ment. In the opinion of the editor of the 
Banner apparently, mediumistic power, be 
it ever so little, covers ail the sins in the 
decalogue and entitles its possessor to the 
right to prey upon a gullible public and be 
puffed in the B of L,

Woman Suffrage State Convention at 
Champaign, Ill.

A well-attended State Woman Suffrage 
Convention was held at Champaign, Nov. 
3rd, Mrs. E. B. Harbert,of the Inter-Ocean 
editorial staff, presided, and Mrs. Elizabeth 
Loomis, of Chicago, was Secretary. Capt. 
J. S. Lathrop made a welcoming speech. 
Mrs. Harbert, Mrs. Dr. Wardner, of Anna, 
HL, Mrs. E. C. Earned, of Champaign, 
County School Superintendent, Mrs. M.C. 
Haggart, of Indianapolis, and others spoke. 
Senator Castle, of Sandwich made an able 
argument, and Mrs. Haggart’s address is 
spoken of as “a brilliant plea.” The main 
object of the meeting is to present the sub­
ject of woman suffrage to the people of the 
State irrespective of party.

We regret to learn that the wife of our 
talented contributor, W. E. Coleman, is pro­
bably a hopeless Invalid. She is now in New 
York for treatment, but the physicians give 
no encouragement. Mr., Coleman is detain­
ed in California, but hopes to get East very 
soon.

In Memoriam—Clara A. Clark.

A Port Huron, Mich., journal comes with 
a paper “In Memoriam” on Miss Clara A. 
Clark, daughter of Samuel-1). Clark aud 
wife of that city, who passed away on Sun­
day evening, Sept 25th, aged twenty-four 
years. She is spoken of as highly gifted 
and amiable. The paper was read before 
the Lotus Club, of which she was a mem­
ber, The Literary Club and the Public 
School teachers, met and gave testimonials 
to her worth, and the schools adjourned to 
attend the funeral. She had been a teacher 
among them for five years, and a large con­
course of people attended the services.

The discourse, by Dr. Spinney, of Detroit, 
is spoken of as follows:

Dr. Spinney’s sermon was very eloquent, 
both in thought and expression. He took 
the most- advanced spiritual view of death 
and life again, spoke comforting words to 
the almost inconsolable family and gave 
bright gems of advice to the young asso­
ciates of the deceased favorite. His tribute 
to her charming personal character and ac­
complishments was very affecting. She 
was patient, industrious, good aud pure. 
She loved the beautiful in life and in na­
ture. She loved painting and commenced 
to learn the art. She loved poetry and he 
read her favorite poem, Longfellow’s “Re­
signation.” A few lines in Her handwrit­
ing, found that morning in her scrap book, 
seemed to exactly suit her nature: 
“Be good, dear child, and let who will be clever,

Do noble things, not dream them aHdaylong, 
And eo make life, death, and that vast forever,

One grand, sweet song.”
Her parents are well-known Spiritualists. 

May the light beyond the clouds reach 
them!

Mm. F. O. Hyzer on the friends of Me­
diums. ' '

This lady, long and well known as an elo­
quent speaker and as a medium, in a late 
lecture to the Brooklyn, N. Y. Society is re­
ported in The Two Worlds as follows:

“During her address, she diverged from 
her regular line of thought to answer a 
question that was laid upon her desk, con­
cerning the duty of that society to medi­
ums, and in answering it she said, in sub­
stance: ‘Try the spirits, aud try the medi­
ums, and see if both are true. Distrust any 
of them who shrink from investigation, for 
if there is any mission in mediumship, it is 
to remove doubt. Always honest, generally 
correct; when you can say this, it is enough. 
Conditions, the fallibility of mortals and 
spirits, will cause mistakes. Expect them; 
but demand honesty. Not all who claim to 
be mediums can prove their claims. Many 
of these may have powers that, while they 
are of no value to the world are to the in­
dividual; and these we must not call im­
postors, though we have no use for them. 
Your duty is to investigate thoroughly, 
honestly, and truthfully. Whoever does 
this, we hold to be the friend of the medi. 
ums.”’

Current Items.

Dr. Geer says: I notice the thinkers all 
like the Religio-Philosophical Jour­
nal. '

Mr. A. B. French has our thanks for a 
copy of the Clyde, O., Enterprise containing 
the Crindle exposA

The Two Worlds is to be enlarged next 
week, and will be on sale at our counter, 
price eight cents.

Mr. G. H. Geer spoke for the First Society 
of Spiritualists of Geneva, O., during Octo­
ber. He is engaged-hy the same society for 
November.

Mrs. Maud E. Lord holds stances at No. 
10 Throop street (near Madison street), on 
Sunday, Monday, Wednesday and Friday 
evenings of each week.

Carl Tuttle, son of Hudson Tattle, is at­
tending the Western Reserve Medical Uni­
versity, and gives great promise of eminence 
in surgery for which he manifests peculiar 
talents.

A. B. French having finished a very suc­
cessful course of lectures at Philadelphia, 
speaks during November in AIliance,Ohio.’ 
Efforts are making to induce him to visit 
the Pacific coast during the winter.

A. J. Fishback writes as follows from 
Milton, Ill.: “ We are'engaged to lecture in 
Milton, HL, Nov. 3rd, 4th, 5th, 6th and 7th; 
and in Time, HL, on the 10th, 11th, 13th and 
13th. Wethen goto Pittsfield' III., for a 
course of lectures.

Judge Folger, now Secretary of the Trea- 
aury, is reported as strongly favoring wo- 
man suffrage, but the treasury portfolio is 
not big with the fate of that movement. To 
the woman suffrage cause one small con­
gressman would be worth a dozen secreta­
riesof the treasury.—Times.

The Boston Sunday Herald says that the * 
Sunday Schools, by their indiscriminate use 
of the Bible, start questions among the pu­
pils which the teachers are unable to ans­
wer, and gives this reason why “the ranks 
of infidelity are constantly recruited from 
the church.”— Unity.

The demand for extracopies of the Jour­
nal dated October 39th has entirely ex­
hausted our supply. The report of the. 
speeches on the subject of Spiritualism at 
the English Episcopal Church Congres late­
ly held at Newcastle-on-Tyne, which was 
printed in that number, caused the demand. 
Rev. II. W. Thomas, D. D., tells us he spent 
two hours on that report and wished the 
Journal had printed more of it.'

Probably the oldest twins in existence in 
this country are Georgeaud Edmund Grave 
ly, who In good health are still living with­
in five miles of each other and within three 
miles of where they were born at Leather­
wood Postoffice, in Henry County Virginia 
They wiU be S3 years old the 1st of Decem­
ber, 1881. Their mother" lived to be over 
100, and their father died at the age of 90.

The editor of the Times is a materialist,
and as such he is, perhaps, a little more
bigoted than any church deacon or priest
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Volney’s “Ruins,Meditationson the Ruins 

of Empires.” This able work, by an elo­
quent French infidel, so-called, is full of in­
terest. Price, 81.00

“Religion/* by Dr. E. I). Babbitt, unfolds 
the inspiring ideas of natural and practical 
religion in clear and earnest words. It is 
a gospel of spiritual life and immortality. 
Price 81.00

Mrs. Geo. B. Nichols’s residence is now 
at 217 South Sangamon St. Mrs. Nichols 
will continue her faithful work in behalf 
of Spiritualism. Her residence in the East 
during the past summer lias strengthened 
her mediumistic Vowers.

An American flag will be borne in the 
procession whieh forms part of the inaugur­
al ceremony of the Lord Mayor of London, 
this year, and the American National an­
them will be played during part of the pro-' 
cession, in recognition of the friendly senti­
ments existing between England and Amer­
ica. ;

Old Men as SciENTisT8.-~RecentlyProf. 
Huxley said that ninety-nine men out of 
every hundred became simply obstructive 
after sixty years old,and were not flexible 
enough to yield to the advance of new ideas. 
The world, he thought, would be benefited 
by any man who had taken part in science 
being strangled after sixty.

Warren Sumner Barlow’s Poems. The 
Voices of Nature, of a Pebble, of Supersti­
tion and of Prayer, 1 volume, 81.00; gilt, 
81.25. Full of spiritual insight in quaint 
and clear verse. If, Then and When; From 
the Church Doctrines; Orthodox Hash,with 
change of diet; sparkling poems, 10 cents 
each. All richly worth having.

The Inter-Oeean says that a drug clerk in 
this city put up a prescription with mor­
phine instead of calomel, causing the death 
of an infant. Doctors send us all to these 
druggists for prescriptions, league together 
for the profits, and then want “doctor’s 
laws” to rivet our chains, and slaughter the 
innocents “regularly.”

West End Opera House mediums’ and 
speakers’ meeting last Sunday afternoon 
was full. Music, instrumental and vocal, 
by a choir, singing in some strange tongue 
by Mrs. Isa W. Porter and Mrs. Wilson, 
tests by Mrs. Porter and Mrs. Maud Lord, 
and brief talks by Judge Holbrook, Mrs.. 
DeWolf and others filled the two hours to 
the manifest interest of the large audience.

The last Mormon conference appointed 
100 missionaries, sixty for' Europe and the 
balance for the United States. Twenty- 
four are now in New York ready to sail to 
Europe. The forty for this country have 
gone South to get dupes among the “poor 
whites.” We hope intelligent southern 
men will warn these people against these 
villainous polygamists.

Epes Sargent’s books. All full of interest, 
of accurate and faithful research, beauti­
ful narrations of spiritual facts, and elo­
quent arguments for spiritual philosophy. 
Scientific Basis of Spiritualism, 81.50; 
Proof Palpable of Immortality, 81.00; 
Planchette, or The Despair of Science, 75 

‘ cents. These valuable books sold ac this 
offlee.

Mrs. R. C. Simpson has arranged her plan 
of making engagements so as to better ac­
commodate transient visitors to the city,and 
those whose time is limited. Mrs. Simpson is 
located at 24 Ogden Avenue, and is readily 
reached by either the Madison or Randolph 
St., horse cars. She is one of the very best 
tests mediums, and delights in convincing 
all reasonable skeptics.

Thenew Society of Progressive Spirit­
ualists of Chicago held their first Sunday 
meetings this week, with an address by Mr. 
Brooks in the morning, and an interesting 
conference in the evening. The audience 
was quite as large as was expected, and the 
interest is promising. At 599 Milwaukee 
Avenue, Mr. Brooks will speak each Sun­
day morning, with evening conferences.

The Windham County Rtformer comes 
from old Vermont with an article taken 
paragraph, headings and all, from Mrs. 
Poole’s Woman’s Department of the Relio- 
io-Philosophical Journal, without cred­
it, If the editor can’t "give honor to whom 
honor is due,” he makes poor use of the 
privilege of being on our exchange list.

Ireland has a Land Bill. Scotch and En­
glish farmers and tenants want one and 
now comes up a like demand fro m Russian 
peasants, and Poland joins in the cry. It is 
“the beginning of the end”, of primogeni­
ture and the grinding injustice of land­
lords, Give the tenant a fair chance and 
then let there be peace, let him labor faith­
fully under just laws and win his way to 
being a landowner.

The sales of stamps, wrappers, envelopes, 
and postal cards at the Chicago postofflee 
during the last month aggregated 8149,306, 
as compared with 8118,029 in October of 
last year. During the month 191 carriers 
delivered 25,326 registered letters, 2.412 657 
mail letters, 516,571 mail postal cards, 525,- 
416 local letters, and 354,673 local postal 
cards. The total postage on local matter 
was 817,261.

At Economy, Pa., the home of that once 
large and active community, the “ Harmon­
ists,” founded by Father Rapp, about one 
hundred old men and women still linger, 
most of them on the brink of the grave. 
The business affairs of the society have al­
ways been well managed, and its aecumula- 
ted wealth is now enormous, in the neigh-' 
borhood of 810,000,000, it is said. To a recent 
visitor's inquiry as tothe final disposition of 
this property, an old white haired man re- 

. plied that he didnot doubt that Pennsylva­
nia would gladly settle the society’s affair 
and take the assets for its trouble.

Liberalism-Spiritualism in the East.

To the Editor of the ReflKio-PIfilMopMcal Jonaals

The city reeks with mud and steams with 
fog, yet rejoices. The water famine is over. 
We can once more go on wasting the Croton 
as usual, until another drouth. Why is it 
that we fail to prize.free gifts? They are 
the richest of all, yet valueless, until we 
have to work for them or pay for them in 
the product of work—money. The glorious 
sunshine, the ambient air, health, comfort, 
the play of the affections, the aliment of 
the intellect, the far more precious heritage 
of spiritual life--all are accepted without 
gladness until withdrawn. Then we fret 
and complain. Such is undeveloped human 
nature.

But I did not intend to moralize in this 
strain, only to tell you a little about the 
liberal element in Gotham. In this category, 
comes Pt of. Adler and his society. The 
enthusiastic young Hebrew is eloquent and 
winning; he is sincere, studious and gifted. 
He is attracting many from the creeds, to 
a creedless religion—-the religion of hu­
manity. Why is he more successful than 
many others in stamping his views upon a 
large class of bright, intellectual people? 
We must sadly confess that this is true of 
a man who is yet unconvinced of the grand­
est of ail truths—that of progressive im­
mortality.

THE SECRET OF POWER.
I opine his power lies in his readiness to 

make religion practical. He is absolutely 
in earnest, this fiery young apostle of hu­
manitarianism. . He shames merely wordy 
theories, by his vita! grasp of wrong. With 
his brilliantly sharpened sword, he tries to 
cut off the Hydra head of evil at one sweep, 
and hacks and hews away right manfully. 
He is worn and weary, though enthusiastic 
as Savanarola, for he lops at the heads, and 
not at the hearts of the monsters he would 
vanquish. He tops the tree, not uproots it 
—aud so do all who are not grounded in the 
Philosophy of Religion. However, we hail 
him as a right noble liberalizer and worker. 
Too many Spiritualists can sit at his feet 
and learn how to order their lives after
godliness/which is true godliness. Words! 
words!! words!!! We are fain to exclaim* 
as we listen to one speaker and another, 
who belong simply to the spiritualistic 
ranks. The time is coming when ethical 
teachings must become something, more 
than teachings. There must be a seizing 
upon principles, a growth, a striving after 
vital spirituality, which shall quicken the 
lives and behavior of the rank and file, or 
all lecturing will be vain as sounding brass 
and tinkling cymbals. I tell you, dear Edi­
tor, “the time is coming and now is,” when 
there must be growth and blossoming and 
fruit, or—decay. Such is the ordering of 
Nature.

Moralizing again! This will never do! 
The other liberal halls in New York, seem 
to be well patronized. Mrs. Brigham’s, af­
fluent inspirations attract one order of 
minds, and she is’ successful in impressing 
those who are yet church-bound, by 
the womanly tact which she always dis­
plays. Mr. Wallis, the English lecturer, 
made an agreeable impression, and Cephas 
Lynn took his place last Sunday. The Chil­
dren’s Progressive Lyceum meets iu the 
afternoon, under the leadership of that 
faithful worker, Mrs. Mary A. Newton. 
The time will come when interest in this 
most necessary work will be aroused anew. 
It is a state of transition now. The period 
between theories and truths; phenomena 
and philosophy; materiality,(underanother 
name) and spirituality, is drawing to a 
close.

Moralizing again! Forgive me for think­
ing aloud.

.STECK HALL.
Mr. Davis lectured on Sunday night upon 

“The effect of Habits upon the Character, 
both in this life and that which is to 
come.” It really set me to thinking. For we 
were assured that we had will and power 
to overcome the effects of hereditary evils, 
entailed upon us by our ancestors. Nay, 
more: we were told that we had power to 
resist evil, even if we were mediumistic.— 
told that evil and undeveloped spirits did 
not incite people to drunkeness and other 
demoralizing habits. Why, Mr. Editor, 
that puts us upon our own responsibility! 
We can’t go and have a ‘’high old time,” 
and then lay it upon some spirit who tempt­
ed us,or compelled us, rather! That’s uncom- 
monlyinconvenient; it puts a man upon his 
own metal, sends him to the bar of his own 
conscience, tells him to go to work! It is 
much more easy to believe in obsession^nd 
when we want to “go as you please,” blame 
some one who has gone where he can’t dis­
pute it, as easily as we can assert it. I do 
not know how we can get along with such 
a code of morals; which involves self-gov­
ernment and labor and—

There! more moralizing!
BROOKLYN SOCIETIES 

are also alive and full of vitality. At the 
next meeting of the Fraternity Mr. Kiddle 
will give one of his scholarly lectures, and 
your correspondent, Mrs. Foole, was heard 
last week. It seems to the .writer that an 
improvement could be made by letting the 
lecture end the services. A general con­
ference afterwards is like taking custard 
and cream after a full meal—more than 
one can digest, if the meal is worth eat­
ing. Bro. Nichols is working hard, and 
the other friends are willing he should* 
He who can work, ought. But there is, or 
there will be, more moralizing. Mrs. Hyzer, 
who has many friends In Brooklyn, is still 
the acceptable speaker at Everett Hall, and 
the conference confers every Bunday after­
noon at the same place.

OTHER MATTERS.
The U. S. Medical College of New York 

city, of which mention has been made, will 
probably absorb the New York Eclectic 
College, which has lost its ruling spirit in 
the departure of Dr. B. S. Newton, the Dean 
of Its Faculty. The strength of this lead­
ing medical school, will therefore receive 
reinforcement, and it will become the ruling 
school of the entire East.

FROM LEIPZIG.
Upon the desk of a friend I found a card 

from abroad containing this information; 
The Harmonial Association in Leipzic ar­
ranged a picnic in order to celebrate the 
natal day of A. J. Davis and Dr. B. Cyriax, 
your well-known sometime correspondent, 
Whieh occurred upon the 11th of August. 
A large number of members and their 
friends accordingly assembled in a suburb­
anwood, where they had a delightful, social, 
and fraternal re-union. After a toast to 
Mr. Davis, Dr. Cyriax gave a sketch of the 
life and works of the Seer, and defined the 
Harmonial Philosophy. The occasion end­
ed with the sending of many kindly 
messages, from those assemoled, to Mr. 
and Mrs. Davis, who must be gratified to 
know that they have "kin beyond the sea.”

New York, Nov, 5th.

D«. Price’s Cream Baking Powder, for excel, 
lence in every respect, is unequalled.

8uti» Letters answered by R. w. Flint, No 
1327 Broadway, N. Y. Terms: |2 and three 3 
cent postage stamps. Money refunded if not an­
swered. Send for explanatory circular. 21-23tf

Da. Price’s Flavoring Extracts are free from 
poisonous oils and strong, rank taste. They are 
natural flavors of perfect purity.

- Important Notice to Newspaper Readers'^— 
The firat number of Maxsox’s Subscription 
Journal, published at West Liberty, Iowa, has 
made its appearance. It is a twenty-four column 
paper, devoted mainly to tho subscription busi­
ness. It will save, you money . to write for a sam­
ple copy before making your selections of news­
papers aud magazines for the cumitgyear. Afi. 
dress Jont. Maxson & Co., West Liberty, Iowa.

The Wonderful Hsame and Clairvotak®—, 
Diagnosis by letter.—Enclose lock of pattoni’s 
hair and $1.1*0. Give the name age and sex. Kes- 
edieo sent by mail to all parts. Circular of testi­
monials and system of practice sent free on ap. 
plication. Address, Mrs. C. M. Morrison, M. D„ 
P. O. Box 2519 Boston. Mass. ’ 3

Dr. Prior's Perfumes are as rahiral as the 
flowers from which they are made. His Alista 
Bouquet is charming.

CLAIRVOYANT BZAMIMATIONS FROM LOCK. Or 
Hair.—Dr. Butterfield will write you a clear, 
pointed and correct diagnosis of your disease, its 
causes, progress, and the prospect of a radical 
cure. Examines the mind as well as the body. 
Enclose One Dollar, with name and age. Address 
EF. Butterfield, M. D., Syracuse, N. 1

Curbs Emr Cass or Pius. 27-18

Convention of Spiritualists of New 
Hampshire.

The New Hampshire State Spiritualists Atscs’atioa wil’ 
M a Quarterly C -nventlsn at Putney’* Hail, Sutton Mills, 
Saturday and Sunday. Nov. ISth aud &tb, 1831. Good speak­
ers are expected. .

- Entertainment will be provided fo- visitors dc'Eg the 
meeting. , Per Order.

ANNA M. TWISS, SI. D„ Secretary.

Spiritual Meetings in Brooklyn and New
York.

NEW YORK CITY.—The Second Society of Spiritualists 
hold services every Sunday, at Cartier’s Hall, 28 Eats Mtb Strait

At ll A. M. and 7.45 P. M. Good speakers every Sunday. Beiw free, . "

CITY.—The Harmonial Association. Free 
M£^r!fe?‘t,eyiE® Sunday morning, at 11 o’clock, in 
Steck’sMwlcal Hall, no. HKaat Fourteenth St, near Fifth 
Ave» Discourse every Sunday mojnlue at 11 o'clock* bv 
Andrew Jackson Da vis. * *

NEWYORK.—The New York Spiritual Conference, the 
oldest Association organised tn the interestot modernSn'r- 
itualism, In the country, holds Its sessions in the Harvard

Address Box4400 RO.™- ^^WOBTH. Secretary.

THEFIBSTSOCIEIY OF SPIRITUALISTS holds services 
at Republican Rall, No55 West SSrtlSt, (near Broadway) 
SI; Sunday at half past ten, a. m .ard half past seven pa 
Children’s Progressive Lyceum meets ats r. m

Brooklyn, N. Y.> Spiritual Fraternity.
Sunday Services In the large li il of the Brooklyn Institute, 

corner y.aeiiing-en and Concord Srr .ats, seven blocks from 
Fulton terry. November ana Dcaember, Sirs. E Eb.-fard- 
Lliiiewtd speak under spirit control at 3 p.M and 7 am. 
Pref. J. T. Lii'fe, an aecoaiplis'aed phutes and vocalist, win 
have charge of music.

Confcnnce Meeting* held inthe lowcrEallcfi’ieBrooklya 
Institute every Friday evening.

Nov. ISts, Orgitimlon a Neesidts, feigew H. Dailey. 
b>ov,25tb, The Sabbath. Deacon D. M. Cola 
Dec. ,nd,Col.Wm. Hemstreet.

s. B. Nichom. President. •

lew ^MijJM 8110 17
Box 1205, Adrian, Mich.

•’? A day 5? h0!K® CMIIF made. Costly yl wOaiSt free. Address taz & Co-, Auguste. Me.
St 11 33 10

IT RAYS to sell our Band Printing Rubber Statons. 
Circulars free. G A. HARPER A BRU., Cleveland, o.

811117 eow
AfJ/Jaweek tn your own town. Term* and 15 outfit 
SBOQfree. Address H. HauhttACo.. Portland. Me.

81 ll 33 10

Agent,—Tiie Immense Demand for the

LIFE OF GARFIELD.
“Krom Log Cabin to White House,” by the fun- 
ou* author ot • Life of Lincoln.’’ requires duplicate plates, 
many presses and an arm? of Agents to supply the books. 
One Agent says. -‘Took ISO order* in 6 day*.’’ An­
other “Never saw anything take like it.” Elegant 
illustrations. Includes funeral, etc. Send 50 cents for can­
vassing book, and belt supply the demand. Terms tree.
JA8.R EARLE. 118 Washington St, Boston.

■8111
1_ '8CIAWt day at home. Samples worth 15 free. 

®O IO VMdrc'8 6n8aos A Co., Portland, Me. 
V 81 11 8810

A
W RlRftOT’1®®®™! A gilt-bound Floral w *a**E*'*Au> a autograph Album only 15c 47 select 
quotations a story paper 4 elegant Sample Chromo free. 
Wltheach.-G. W. Hocenwdea. West Haven,Conn.

—— 31 10 13

1 Can now grasp a fortune. Out- 1 |>L’ffll|IV fit worth $1O free. Address Aubn 10 svst^
31 10 S3 »

MEDICAL DIAGNOSIS• Cent’s hal^agej 
sex and One Dollar. Patients coming under treatment, will 
lie credited with thia Dollar on their first monthly payment. 
Different patients, separate letters Remedies aud treatment 
for one mocth. by mall Four Dollars,

Address VOGL and ALLEN, Lock Box 2033, Kansas City, 
Mo.

31 1028

THE WEEKLY CAPITAL te an bight-pag«, 49 column 
paper, published at'Topeka. Kama*, giving Full and Re-‘ 

Hable Stare News, Crop and Weather Report* irona every 
County. <1.00 per year/ Sample Copy Free. 3110 17

Babbitt’s Chart of Health.
Dr. E. D. Babbitt has prepared a large, handsome Chait 

of Health, over a yard long, to -be hung ur in homes, 
schools and lecture-rooms. The following are some of its 
headings: The Laws of Nature: The Law of Power; The Law 
of Harmony; How to Promote Health: How to Destroy 
Health; How to Cure Disease; How to Dress; How to Ent; 
Whatto Eat; How to Sleep: How to Bathe, etc., teaching peo­
ple to be their own doctors on the powerful and yet simple 
planner Nature.

Price Mcents, po-taga 10 cents,
•.•For sale, wholesale and retail, bv theBaiuioPHiw- 

wmo4^BusimBoM.Ctaea^^

Modern Spiritualism,
REPLY BY

Rev. A. A. WHEELOCK, Utica, N. Y.,

Trinity (Episcopal? Church. .Utica, N. Y.

^B®»6 Was«KS E»a«”<y^
himself. It should be generally circulated as a missionary 
tract. Single copies. 10 cents; 20 copies, <1.00. For sale, whole- 
Ml” and retail, by the Beligio-Philosophical Publishing, Houss, 
Chicago.

11 V n M M I , 
THE CHILD-MEDIUM.

A Captivating Hook.
This Is * story of remarkable Spiritualistic power and tes» 

ly, depleting in glowing language the wonderful event* in UM 
l[feofthecM!d Nora,and the phase* of mediumship which 

• a» manifested.
Paper, ITO pages. Prien 50 cents, postage free.
•.•For sale, wholesale and retail, by the RxltoioPj«w»- 

aownoxuPcBusHiNUHousaChicaap - -

OKAI I I !»««®M882.

New Style 
No. 2023 

rice, $297.50 
INCLUDING elegant cover, stool, book & music. Pih-’~p*!??.&l££^ P’ANO New Stylo No. 30^3 has all feern tepravenMr.M. Kt".

1>R8 and tyro; 
^re Pwi"? ™^ frat fi:!i8:;, ,i aiife**- Mr "If s BMf lro» Frame, I.nmowtl
* dt^eaa^Oi.elsti ungli .-.s, At/raffe*. Freneh Uraud Aetim, ItatMe Captietz Ilamniern..

Length, 7ftJ^tMft.6lns;Wejgh^ ICOOIbs.
„HOMDAY OFFERS, Now tin,.- to oSer'pitNdd mj* CS::.vn
n.mr..r >:ir-.-!y iiisiw.4 j m» ueilitusrar mairunoiur::::’. mv H..ii<!ar<>;f<--s for i—. 3 
fra u-.e:’"«.!yt!iob,we>tl Inveev mu-lo. :-’-.-:.d tor lull i ^ijeiun. S ^eini Y- w 
iri-ra cr-.n o.-sene t>'.mslr.uldifferentin-tnimr-nt--. ORGANS. f'Jto Si:’-L'ts ;3 
Mops. Have v<ei r.-«-n “BEATTYA BEST” PAUDSGiUHX t’p is a 
t?'1^' if-" '■iilySKM^-TCATTrs iljsf. HAPHL i>C-;.lS>,hW,7& 

6!ud.- —.Uke.;.^ THK “j- IRIS”nov- «..;• rei lor
fjK styles how R-. adv. HaNOs, {;ranj Huunre and 1'^gh;,
s*2-»tosl.OiW. hv -ryinstrr.nunt is rally wairai.ted. 5at:<&:; a ■r i .iatwi’ 
»r.5;orjy reltmd.-J.a:ii-r the inurnment huslre.-nin i^e a vean Nothi::-?cau ho 
'T^/^HowtoOraer.t by POS1 ()Fh<<L MOM;.* OrtJLR, x;ui:[i D^aft. i2*.gist!‘iv4 jr^^i'cr’ii? 

rcxiL Meaty refunded freight chanre.)xud
VIMTOKSABB AMVAYS Wfaf^ a^Mwith rx^ 

attendautaccti aHtraia^ Jou carpet c.Ul, bo sure to writ? S r Catalogue beLre buying eisywhere. ‘ ^U^mbmbJiB^1 DANIEL F, BEATTY, Washing^onJ^ev^

I®

Photo-cophxg I Splendid, portraits cf any 
— - T l■■■^l■*■il■■l■^■■■s!zp^cr kind Cny^dlnfie 
KelUble Agents want* Ci In ev« r? r’’.irfy m V. ? 
%^ *‘7W* a^’r^s THE AMERICAN COPYING

Co.5 84 Genesee St.f Auburn N, Y, 31 10 11

BALES HEALTH PRESERVING 
ews.

SOMETHIMJniMy NEW-
Dy tin arrcii^H^'.-nt. of fine

MDHtt REFUHBED
31 19 22

i ui’i :1 wire s*>n?4. which al- 
imv^thecorsf1: tu yieM readily 
•Aith every movefflent of the 
wearer, the mt r-t perfect fit- 
finu and e^mfertablo corset 
gmt made i.i thu 71 cej«d»

Kvn i«i2:eEl *L ty our bust 
rhv>iclans. Tori-ale by Itad- 
ir.# Drv Goods dtakTJ and 
un? by mail Juany addre*# on 
nvrj't c?|l«6O ty

CHICAGO COKSET €«.
Chicago, Hl*

SOUL READING-,
OR

Psychometric DeUneatlosa of character.
MARY M. D. SHERMAN wen'd respectfully anncuuco to ! 

the public, that she wil up;n reception of a letter contain- * 
ing photograph, [to be returned.) u oath f f birth.Sie.single 
or married, givo an accurate descriptioncf the lecd'ng tracts 
of character withinarkei claugtstn past aud future life. 
Including birth stones tobe worn,ami why

Terms 81.00 and shree postage stamps.
. Address May M. 1). SHERMAN,

If joa are going from Chicago to any point in Northern 
Illlnote. Northern Iowa, Nebraika, Colorado, Wyommg 
Utah, Nevada. California, Oregon, Wisconsin, Minnesota or 
Dakota, you should he sure to purchase your tickets via. the 
Chicago*North Western Railway.

It Is by ail odds the best route between Chicago and al? the 
prominent points in the States above named.

Tickets over this route are sold by all Coupon Ticket 
Agents.

Be sure that they read over the above named route, and 
taka no other. ■

Dr. Hunter’ ePraetical Observation* on Food 
and Diet, and on the Proper Treatment of the 
Throat and Lungs.
Tills pamphlet is designed for the general public, and Is a 

guide for all shir persons. The preface rays: 'What to eat 
to preserve the body in health, aud what to do to regain 
health when it Is lost, are problems which medical sages 
and philosophers in all ages.have striven to solve.The aim of 
tbe writer In the preparation of this pamphlet,hag been to pre­
sent the reader with an epitome of his experience on these 
pointe, derived from the active practice of hte profession 
during a perlon ot thirty-five years.” Dr. Hunter is widely 
known as one of the mt st experienced and successful practi­
tioners in diseases of the Throat and i ungs. and hte views on 
these subjects will be found of great Interest, The contents 
embrace -Catarrh, Sore Throat. Laryngitis, Bronchitis, Asth­
ma and Consumption, the “Prevention of Lung. Diseases.” 
“The Early Symptoms of Consumption.” "Can Lung Dis­
eases be cured?” - Their Proper Treatment,” “Examinations 
ofthe Lungs.” various opinions as.to the nature of consump­
tion, “Winter habits am Changes of Climate.” “Inhalation 
Treatment ot Lung Diseases,” the "Cure ot Hay Fever,” etc.

The style of the Treatts! te well Illustrated by Ite opening 
Saragraph: “The two great forces of life are the air we 

reatue and the fooil we eat. The two great receptacles of 
tbe system for these forces are the Lwtgs and the Stomach 
The Lungs and the stomach co-work together in imparting 
Strength and lite to the system,”

Orders for the trade supplied by the Western News Com­
pany Chicago. Copies can be secured or any bookseller and 
at the offlee of the author, 103 State St,

801833 15

DR. SOMERS
Tarkish, Russian, Electric, Sulphur, 

Mercurial, Roman, and other Medi­
cated Baths; the FINEST in the 
country, at the GRAND PAOIBTO 
HOTEL, entrance <ih Jackson-st,, 
near La Salle, Chicago,

These bath* are a great luxury and moat potent curative 
agent Nearly alifonnsof Dienaae Rapidly Disappear Un­
der Their Influence when properly administered. AU who 
try them are delighted with the effect. Thousands ot our 
best citizenscan testify to their great curative properties. Try 
{hem at once and Judge for yourself.

JMLKCTB1CITY A SPECIALTY. The Electro 
Thermal Bath, at ulveu by us, is par excellence in Nervous 
Diseases and General Debility .

Open for Ladles and Gentlemen from 7 a. m. to 8 X. r. 
Bundays. 7 Ai M. to 12. 

8018128

THE HISTORY OF

THE ORIGIN O F ALL THINGS,
HCLTOIKO THE

History of Man, from His Creation to 
His Finality, But Wot to His End.

KUTTEN BY GOD’S HOLT WteffH THEOVaK AX XABTUT
MEDIUM, I* M. ARNOLD.

Dr. Annie Getchell mys: “I would not have taken twenty 
Ave dollars for my copy when I found I could not get another

M Allen says: “My verdict 1* that It i* just what It 
purpOTt* to be. a revelation from Josuz of Nazareth, through 
tbe mediumship of L.M Arnold.”

' Cloth, pp. » DmOb M Po«tpajd.

P V G n T Tl IPD O and -^^ Hants UA * M U llU 1 UlV M sample copy of:hat 
wonderful paper.

The World A Soldier published at Wasliiugton, D. Cl 
-t esr.nits Stories of the War. Can? Life. Scents from tho 
Battlefield, and a thousand thrnga ot Interest to cur coin- 
tre's defenders. It. Is she great sc'-Jlers’paper. It contains 
all the Laws and Instructions relating to Pensions and 
iinuntis for soldiers and their h-lra. Every ex soldier 
6\< u:d enroil h’s t ame under the World & -oldter ban­
ner a- >.-n> e Eight-; ag's. lor-y < oIbms, wee* ly. SI a tear. 
LaBip.eiHs. Address World. & Soldier. Box t83 Wath- 
l8ffoa,O.C.' ’ Si 1011

flfiyiBaji I Quickly and
AalnniA Permanently

CUREDDf.Stirson’sAstiimaReinedy 
is unequaled as a positive 

.Alterative and Cure for
' Asthma and Dyspepsia,
aud all their attendant evils. It dc?s not- merely 
afford temporary relief, but is a uennanent cure. 
Mrs. B. F. Lee, of B -imore, O„ say’s of it: “ I am 
turpriteA at tlx raruf-,' i/r's if ynr remedy, it is 
Ite Ursi mr’ii'tbie in. s:.~ ‘\ sis ttet has let-seized tv:v 

. caagl.ar.'imadeeep"!w<:trjneasy, iv.'ji:’ e>epalt 
siiaht ssiih'.at c'/^;^i:li-:^.', Ifyourdruggi-t does not 
keep It. send for treat L-e and testimonials t i

II. r. H. PUCK A CO..
883 Broadway, New Yurz>

31 10 21

the ’Complete Life of

JAMES A. GARFIELD.
WOI’mei. Able Authors. i-lite IHuhtmlone. New* ^

Authentic* Complete. Iks
eoceas a Soldier ami kgisUwr: vkctkn to the Presidency, ■ 
the femstKiB of Mst’aMneHthoconte^^^ the ■
A-. a'lhus Atttrh; Cw f-i^zaul Ti.'-.i^'.cr.t. iUnzwa! t?

/ui’i'it/, AIHSNTn WANTEDi>vcFywhere* Fer full

4. V. MeCCEDt & <’O„ CMe^ HL

33 14 32 13

PISO’S CURE FOR
Conaumptiven snd people 

who have weak iimijsoras'b 
rr.u, should use Pisos Cure for 
CoB-Biuptioa, It has cured 
thousands. It has not injur­
ed 6na It is not bad to take. 
It is she best cough svrup. 
Sold everywhere. SJc.&Sl.

CONSUMPTION.

31MI1

SOUL AND BODY;
Oli,

THE SPIRITUAL SCIENCE
OF HEALTH AND DISEASE!.

ByW.FEVANS.
Author of "Mental Cure" end" Mental MctUcinc."
It is a book of deep and gr-nuine inspiration, Diaase traced 

to ite Sernlnal-Spirituiil Friaeiple. spiritual fctaM« and 
y»-?;i the Appropriate Remedy. Tne Fundamental Prinei- 
nie of the Cures wrought bv Jesn?, end how we can do the 
pane. The Influence of tiie Spiritual World on Health and 
K':!".1. The Piiilo-rmhv c£ Spirit Intercourse. How any ono 
niav Conwreo with Spirits and Angele. The Psychology of 
Faith and Prayer. ■

Cloth, $1.00, postage, R cents.
•.•For rale, whole-iile and retail, by the Rsitsio-Pnno 

soPHiCAi. I’vBi.iBHiNG Holm:. Chicago.

MENTAL DISORDERS;
OB, .

Diseases ofthe Brain and Nerves.
DEVELOPING THE ORIGIN AND PHILOSOPHY OF

Isiania, Insanity and Crime
WITH FULL BIKCSIOKS POT. THSIB

TREATMENT AMD CURE.
BY ANDREW JACKSON DAVIS.

In thlsvolume the reader will find a comprehensive and 
thorough exposition of the various diseases of the Brain and 
Nerves, in which the author develops the origin and philoso­
phy of Mania. Insanity and Crime, and presents full direc­
tions fortheir treatment and cure. No subject on the roll of 
modern treatment appeals wltli more vivid force to the gen­
eral attention, as there certainly te none from which the pub, 
lie might expect more satisfactory treatment from a elairvoy- 
ant like Mr. Davis. . ,

Price,cloth, 11,50, pos. 12c. Paper, tl,pos. 8c.
. •.•For sale, wholesale and retail, by the BHiMO-Pfiito 
lopnioaL Publishing Houck, Chicago.

POEXSW1JMB1WB
By MIS* MZZIE DOTMXs

The exhaustion of numerous editions eftheco lvcautifaljK> 
ems rtwwa how well they are appreciated by tho pulxlc. The 
peculiarity and intrinsic merit ottla™e poems are admired by 
ill Intelligent aud liberal minds. Every bpinfaatet in the 
land should have a copy.

TABLE OF CONTEXTS—PAWT X.
A Word to the WiH’rrmrstoti^fe Prayer of the Sor- 
rowlug; The Song ot Truth; Tuo kntarWM; Ampler’* 
Vision; Love and Latin: Tise Song ofthe. Nori 1; The tsMoj 
Webster; The Parting ol Sigurd and Gerda; Tee Meeting of 
Sigurd and Gerda.

' ■ ■ MBTII.
The Spirit Child [by “Jennie "kite Revelation; Hope for me 
Sorrowing;ComriE-stlon; The IXff ot Sreiuein; jIutreM 
Glenare [by “Marian”}: Little Johnny;; "Birfes” 8pmt 
Song; My spirit Home [A. ll. Spwguel; I Still Live lA. W. 
Sprague j- Life IS’uifaspwrel: bw fcttew ; I or a’ 
That [Burns!: Won. o’ Cheer I Barash Besurrexj [Pm : The 
PropheevofVala I Pooh The kingdom M; fho Cradle or 
Conln I Pool; Tne Strei ts of Mrinan fei: rhe Mystcrh* 
of Godlinewt A Lectureh Farewell to iirtli [PoeS
psrez: gilt, KM postage 10c. ms, »1.W, postage Hfc 

‘.•Far fi’e, wholesale and retail, by the Bhimo-Phu®
soraiou. FfBlisnisu House, Chicago.

DEATH.
In the Light of ihe Haruionial Philosophy, 

By MARY F. DAWN.
A whole volume of Philosophical Truth I* com- 

densed into this little pamphlet.
Mrs. Davis has developed with rare faithfulness and pathos, 

the pure principles of true bplritnaU^ii. The sorrowful may 
find consolation In thesis pages, and the doubtful, a firm foun­
dation ami a clear sky.
Price, p«iitatep*l<L16e> ixjr «wpr. .PlMWilW 

for |L In Handsome cloth binding; 30c.
.Vw sale, wholesale and retell. by the Rxu«XO-F*W» 

wraicu, Piblibhisg Hoven, Chicago.



EELIGIOPHILOSOPHIOAL JOURNAL. NOVEMBER 12.1881.

Quiets fault l^|t(r|ltt
AND INFOBMATION ON VARIOUS 

IOBJECT8 PBBTAIMN6 TO TUB

A Flight.

BY EMMA. ITOIH.

At last the busy house is etill;
Its inmates walk the vales of sleea, „ 

Op Cream upon seine heavenly KU;
Without is daikuess deep.

I, too, should close my staring eyes 
And seek them in the vales so etiE, 

But up beyond the midnight skies 
My soul vaults strong of will.

I seek the white souls of the dead 
Now that the living need me not;

On downy pillows sinks each head 
But mine is tired and hot.

I cannot rest—so let me fly
Up through the midnight hits light

I do not weep, Ido not sigh, 
Bat, oh—I need a flight 2

Not cue will miss me if I go
- Joy-touting for one little hour; ■
I lang for something heavenly eoj 

A fees, a song, a flower,
I earo not what, so I may rise

To win Its sweetness—not stoop Sown. - ' 
. X’dratherriseand takeaerogs

. Than stoop and take a erown! ’.

B» IK Borneo .

To the Editor of the EeM^o-PhUoBopMeal Journal; . 
f I am just now ta rceeiot cf a long note from II 
Dunglas Home, author of “Incidents in My Life,” 
which you have on sale and which 1 found the 
most interesting book I ever read, and thinking 
that many of your readers would be glad to have 
from this most celebrated medium, 1 have taken 
the liberty to send for publication such extracts 
as will not be deemed a violation of the confi­
dence reposed in a private communication. His 
letter is dated at Geneva, Oct. Sth. 1831-

“Your kind and right welcome letter came to 
me last evening after having traveled about in 
Austria, France and Italy, but at last reaching its 
destination....Ab you are aware I have never 
been strong, and during the past nine years I 
have been a great sufferer from acute neuralgia. 
The baths of Levico {not Lerico) combined with 
the baths of Loeeke have greatly benefited me, 
and I hope again to he able to do some work for 
the cause of truth. The first volume of Incidents 
was my best book. I was surrounded by only 
quieting influences and the whole atmosphere of 
Spiritualism was at that time purer, for the great 
tidal wave of imposture had not assumed a form. 
Previous to writing the second volume my health 
had become impaired by the mental strain endur. 
ed and caused by the Lyon vs. Home suit My 
last book,‘Lights and Shadows,’was a work not 
in the least congenial. I wrote it as a duty and 
in more than one instance I was too lenient. You 
can have no idea of the shameful abuse which I 
have had to bear on account of that book, though 
no one has been able to show that I have exag­
gerated in even the slightest degree.

“A few days since a friend wrote me desiring 
" to have thafwork published in French, and kind­
ly furnished the means to defray tho expense. 
The work will appear the coming ep-ing.... AI- 
though e iittle stranger I am still an invalid.... 
When the translation is completed, it is my in­
tention to cornseEce a more complete volume of 
‘Incident?,’ giving details and correspondence. 
Th's will probably be my last work, for I know 
right well that the day of rest is net far distant. 
Mine has been such a strange, weird life—1 seem 
to be eo little my own master, that the ways and 
means all seem to be supervised and shaped by a 
power from without which I. c-f course, consider 
as being God’s providence. In ten days we go to 
'Russia to pass the winter with our dear old uncle 
Akeakoff, father of Alexander Aksakoff, whose 
name may be known to you... .You speak of the 
‘abuse heaped on me;’ it dobs me no harm. I 
have but one object in view, and that is to have- 
the cause of truth respected and respectable.”

Mr. Home then painfully alludes to the sicken­
ing details of imposture that come to him from 
correspondents as “very hard to hear,” but adds, 
“He doeth all things well.” From some remarks 
he makes about his son (in allusion to my own 
son) I should not be surprised to hear his name 
mentioned as widely as that of the father, for his 
fame as a painter.

In a recent edance at Yonkers we had a mes­
sage from Rev. John Tyerman, formerly of Mel­
bourne, Australia, who, when requested to preach 
against Spiritualism, concluded first to examine 
the subject; did so and became a celebrated lec. 
turer. He passed over about six months ago.. 
Almost every week we have satisfactory com­
munications from our depaited neighbors—from 
two last evening: Wm. H. Post, who was murder­
ed by the Utes, formerly a merchant here, and 
another well-known merchant. As Mr. Home 
signs his letter to me, I repeat. ‘-Yours for the 
truth.”

James B. Silkman.
Secretary Yonkers Spiritualist Association. 

New York, Oct. 25,188i.

letter from an old Subscriber.

To the Editor ofthe BcWrla-PaUosopblcal Journal:
Being an old subscriber and constant reader of 

your highly esteemed paper, allow me to trespass 
upon your valuable time a few moments In ask­
ing a favor of brother William Emmette Coleman, 
whose writings I have always admired. His phi- 
loeophy and logic have found in me a responding 
heart. Inthe Keligio-Philosophical Journal 
of Oct. -22nd, I found a piece from Bro. Coleman, 
entitled, Medlumistic Prescience. He gave the 
readers of the Journal certain predictions made 
by Mrs, R, A Robinson ot San Francisco; said 
predictions being literally fulfilled, and becoming 
facts, all of-which he would vouch for. Now I wish 
to ask Bro. Coleman, through the medium of your 
most excellent Journal, if the facts of our ex- 
perlence had an existence before being worked 
outby us. I would like to have him give us his 
ideas and philosophy on this subject. That pre­
dictions are fulfilled, I have no doubt. We have 
too much evidence in its favor to disbelieve it, but 
I never could reconcile it by any philosophy of 
my own. Can we arrive at a fact by reasoning 
from cause to effect before that fact had an exist­
ence, and if the facts of to-morrow are in exist- 
ence, then what? ’ I ask for further light, that I 
maybe raised to a standard where lean behold 
the truth as it is recorded In the great book of 
naiurallaws. A. D. Rice.

Clayton, Mich.

Fetter from Enterprise, Kansas.

To tho Editor of the Reilgio-PhUosophical Journal:
Could we get a good, test medium here, quite a 

number of the most prominent men ofthe coun­
ty would investigate. Mrs. Diggs writes me that 
she stopped over with you. She undoubtedly has 
told you of our hopes snd aspiration in the liberal 
cause here; If only all the Spiritualists would 
wake, we could work * grand success. We must 
reach the masses by phenomenal proofs, that they 
can not gainsay, and then becoming interested, 
they will believe. Test mediums are what we 
need for doing the pioneer work. If at our next 

’ annual meeting, in connection with a good lec­
turer, we had a good test medium^-not one who 
goes off on the stage in public and talks a lot of 
nonsense—we have plenty of them—but one who 
in private could give tests, such as Mrs, Simpson, 
Blade, and others give, a greatdeal of good would 
come from it. People like Mrs. Djggs, enthusiastic 
for the liberal work, cleir headed, morally strong 
and clean, working hard for the elevation of the 
human race, are ready to accept Spiritualism 
when proven to them. I believe one good test 
medium one year in this state could almost en- 
lively revolutionise the liberal body. Thia pre­
diction is based upon# quite extended observa­
tion. Is the plan possible? Can not something 
like this be done?

C.B. Howman.

A Ghost at Noonday.

(From the “Pall Mall Gazette," London.)
We have received the following extraordinary 

narrative from a correspondent for whose good 
faith and professional acuteness :of observation we 
can vouch. Re substantiates his story with full 
details of dates, names, and places, which, how­
ever, for the sake of the survivors, he does not 
wish to be published. Without any further pre 
face, we lay his letter before our readers:

“As my wife and I were sitting at breakfast 
with a friend whom I will call Mr. A. then on a 
visit for the first time to our house and neighbor- 
hood—our maid-servant passed out of the room 
on her way to the kitchen. As she closed the 
door Mr. A. startled me by saying, ‘I saw a spirit 
of a man following that woman, who, as he passed, 
said distinctly in my hearing, “God judgeth not as 
man judgeth. I was innocent of the murder for 
which I have been hanged. I was there, but I did 
not strike the blow.” ’ ‘What was it like? I asked.’ 
He replied by describing a young Irishman whom 
I recognised at once as the husband of my do­
mestic, who a year or two before had been execut­
ed on the charge of murder.

“Mr. A., a complete stranger to the locality, had 
only met me for the first time two days before,and 
he was totally ignorant of the crime In which my 
servant was so deeply Interested. For obvious 
reasons the subject was never alluded to in our 
household, where the widow was regarded with 
feelings of sympathy, which led us to avoid as 
much as possible all reference to her husband’s 
fate. I had previously good reason to doubt 
whether the evidence against him justified his ex­
ecution. He had died protesting his innocence. 
His wife and friends were firmly convinced that, 
although he had been in the fight, it was not by 
his hand the fatal blow had been dealt.

“In addition to this, I had good reason to be­
lieve that the real murderer was still at large. 
You can easily imagine my astonishment when 
Mr. A thus suddenly ventured upon forbidden 
ground, and abruptly declared that the spirit of a 
man who had suffered the capital penalty, and 
whose personal appearance exactly coincided 
with that of the unfortunate Irishman, was actual­
ly following the servant about the house pro­
claiming his innocence in accents which, although 
inaudible to me, my guest declared were perfect­
ly audible to him. I had heard that Mr. A. had 
been a ‘seer,’ but I was not a little startled at this 
striking illustration of his peculiar faculty. I re­
marked that it was very strange, and Informed 
him that the woman whom he had just seen for 
the first time with her ghostly companion was 
really the widow of -an executed felon. Some 
time afterwards he exclaimed: ‘There he is again, 
repeating the same words!’

“Intensely interested by this sudden and appar­
ently supernatural confirmation of my suspicions, 
I determined to put the seership of my guest to 
what I regarded as a crucial test. I told Mr. A. 
that shortly afterwards I was going into the town, 
«ud as I should be passing the spot where the 
murder was committed perhaps his ghostly visit­
ant might indicate the place where the dead man 
lay.

“Some time afterwards we started for the town. 
When we left the house Mr. A remarked, ‘There 
he is following us,’ alluding to the ‘spirit.’ When 
we had proceeded part of the way along the road, 
which was quite unknown to my friend, I made a 
detour to make a business call and went along 
another street, Mr. A. following me. Just as, 
without a word on my part, we were turning out 
of the main road, Mr. A. said, ‘The spirit is stand­
ing at the corner. He says we are not going the 
.right way towards the place where the murder 
was committed, and which he has promised to 
point oat to me? I replied, ‘Oh, we ehall come 
out in the main road again by-and-by before we 
reach the spot?

“We proceeded on about a quarter of a mile, 
a^d having done my business and struck the 
main road again—which differed, I may remark, 
from none cf the other roads we had traversed— 
Mr. A. soon after declared, ‘There is that man 
just on there, waiting for us? As we continued 
our walk, I purposely retrained from uttering a 
word, or even from thinking, as far as I could, 
about the murder, so as to prevent any possibility 
of my companion obtaining any clew. As we 
were passing through one of the lowest parts of 
the town Mr. A, Suddenly exclaimed: ‘He tells 
me that It was here the murder was committed. 
It was just there (pointing to the place in the 
road where the murdered man fell). I see the 
hubbub and confusion rise up before me as a 
picture, with the people round. He, however, 
again tells me that he did not strike the fatal 
blow. He does, not excuse himself from being 
morally guilty as being mixed up with those who 
accomplished the death ot the man, but strongly 
maintains that he was not the murderer?
I will only add in relation tip the last incident 

that Mr. A, described the exact spot "where the 
murder was committed, and the circumstances in 
connection therewith. How can you account for 
that? Mr. A. had never been in the town before; 
he had never lived within a couple of hundred 
miles of it; he did not know till within a day or 
two before he arrived that he would ever visit it; 
he could not by any possibility have known that 
the poor woman in my employ was. the widow of 
a man who was hanged. He had no conceivable 
interest in deceiving me, nor was he concerned to 
prosecute the matter any further. I have in vatu 
attempted to account for his story, nor can I on 
any of the popular hypotheses explain to my own 
satisfaction how he saw that ghost at noonday. 
That he did see it he assured me, much to my 
eurprise, when no one expected any such revela­
tion; and, whatever he saw, it certainly led him 
to the exact place where the murder was com­
mitted.”

A Short Tribute to the Memory of 
President Garfield.

From the address given by N. J. Morris, at the 
family gathering of Wm. C. Maynard (home of 
Mrs. Nettie C. Maynard) at Arhefetta Farm, 
Springfield, Ohio, Sept. 26th, 1831, we extract as 
follows:

Gathered as a family, our words can but feebly 
express the sorrow we feel and the honor we 
wish to show to him who has j-Mt passed Lorn 
our mortal sight. From every home this day 
will arise heart-felt expressions of respect and 
-honor for the Nation’s dead. Our beloved Presi­
dent has been stricken down in the pride of his 
manhood, and at the very zenith of his fame and 
glory, by the bullet from the hand of an assassin. 
As we bow in sorrow to day, let us supplicate the 
power above to speedily Influence human hearts, 
and help to unfold them up.and out of these low 
conditions, so that the recurrence of a like calam­
ity may never be seen again.

Not only this Nation suffers loss, but the world 
mourns because a representative human -charac­
ter Is withdrawn from the labors and activi­
ties which must result in humanity’s progress. 
His great heart, full of philanthropy, knew no 
narrow boundary lines of race or class. He was 
ever ready to clasp the hand of every human be­
ing, rich or poor, black or white, bond or free.

A devoted and affectionate son, * loving hus­
band, a kind and wise father, he fitly helped to 
form the characteristics that make up a repre­
sentative American home circle. The loss of this 
great and active soul in earth life, is to be made 
up by the influence he will wield in the days and 
years to come over the hearts and lives of man­
kind. His power for good Is increased, and at 
times the world will feel the uplifting Influence 
of that life we so deeply mourn to-day. The 
judgment, the devotion, the heroic conduct of his 
affectionate wife during all these long weeks of 
Intense suffering and anguish command our ad­
miring respect.

J.B. Cone writes: Inthe Journal of the 8th 
October,an error occurs which makes messy, 
“Moody and Sankey Pentecostal rentings,” In­
stead of “Moody and Sankey, Penn * Co.” rant­
ing#. Penn & Co. are a troop of “Texas Evangel­
ists,” compawing sea mid land to make a prose­
lyte. .

A. Moore writes: The Journal furnishes the 
mental stimulus necessary for me to overcome 
the ills of life with greater ease than I could with- 
outit.

W. H. H. Soger a, in renewing subscription 
for another year says: I like the Journal better 
every year.

Dr. E. W. H. Keels writes: I would not do 
without the Journal for double the price.

The Secret Ont.

Tothe Edltorof the Religto-PMlosoohlcal Journal:
The nation hu agonised and prayed. Our deep­

est sympathies have been touched u they seldom 
have been. The practical uses of prayer have 
been tested and found wanting. Never was the 
“prayer gauge” so faithfully accepted and so con­
fidently applied. By public announcement the 
churches united on specific days to pray for the 
restoration of our honored and beloved chief 
magistrate. For weeks the painful suspense 
vibrated between hope and fear. Believers trust- 
ed In God and prayed, but took the daily bulletins 
for their guide and manifested more faith in the 
surgeons report than the promises of Holy Writ. 
The President died. The autopsy showed that 
the authority of science (?) was no more trust­
worthy than the Christian’s prayer. At the meet­
ing of the State Eclectic Medical Society, Oct. 26. 

. 1881, Dr. Robert A. Gunn said, “The history of 
Garfield’s cue was a disgrace to modern surgery.” 
“Who shall decide when doctors disagree?” This 
same class of surgical and medical blunderers, in 
whose hands no life is safe, whose assumed sci­
ence Is chiefly guess work, are constantly tinker­
ing with our legislation to protect their Ignor­
ance against progressive students and the super­
ior skill and success of those healers they are 
pleased to call quacks. Their infamous class 
legislation, though manifestly unconstitutional,- 
has done much harm and secures them in the 
right to kill scientifically!

A good woman in New York was arrested and 
imprisoned for extracting a sliver from a child’s 
foot, and applying a plaster, in the absence of any 
“regular” to do It scientifically and then extract 
his fee! The clergy, brave ana anxious to appear 
consistent, and fortify their faith against the 
facts, resolutely come to the rescue and explain 
the causes that defeated prayer. By especial ap­
pointment a prominent clergyman in this city re­
cently preached a sermon on the reason why the 
prayers of the church failed to restore thewound- 
ed President. It is very simple and easy to com­
prehend. Strange they did not think of It before. 
It would seem that any child might have under­
stood It without the aid of the minister. But lest 
some may still remain in the dark I will expose 
the secret as given by this eminent divine: It 
was “because he was shot in the back!”

The surgeons attempt self justification by a 
similar plea. It is assumed that the wound was 
fatal, and therefore the stupid malpractice is not 
responsible! Bat had the President been treated 
by a “Quack” and got well, these same “Regu­
lars"-would have seen to it that the doctor was 
fined and imprisoned for curing without their 
special permission, especially if he lived In the 
Empire State. It Is the success of the unauthor­
ize I that troubles them, not their failures. If 
"Quacks” were unsuccessful, if they killed half 
and injured all they treat, the regulars would not 
molest them, for then they would not be danger­
ous rivals. Medical bigotry is as bad and danger­
ous as religious bigotry, and they are closely 
allied. Is it not time the people were aroused to 
a sense of these abuses? Shall we not thunder In 
the ears of these stupid law makers?

Lyman C. Howe.
Binghamton, N. Y., Oct. 28,1881.

Dr. Kayner Retires from the Eecture 
Field and Medical Practice.

To tbe Editor of tbe Eellzio-FhUosoithtcal Janrnsl:-
After some hesitation and with many personal 

regrets in severing the ties which have so long 
and closely bound me to my many patients and 
friends all over the country,! am at last compelled 
to announce my entire withdrawal from the fl-Id, 
for the present at least, in the capacity of either 
physician or lecturer. Circumstances b jond my 
control have rendered this step necessary. My 
feeble health for some years past has prevented 
me from carrying forward an extensive work in 
that direction and necessitated my laboring in 
other fields. In doing this other work I have 
been led, step by step, into a greater familiarity 
with the practical workings of nature’s forces 
through which all progressive growth is attained. 
Face to face with the chemistry of nature, I have 
learned that in order to comprehend the hidden 
powers of being, and know the vast resources at 
our command, we must, with faith believing that 
we shall receive, fearlessly knock at the doors of 
her laboratory to be admitted to the unlimited 
storehouse of knowledge in her keeping and 
thence be inducted into the grand mysteries gar. 
nered there as fast as we can learn and understand 
their Bignificanee and uses.

This system of analysis has extended into the 
Investigation of ores and metals until It has 
opened out into a practical application of natural 
chemistry to the arts and manufactures. It is 
in this field I am now called to labor, and the 
magnitude of the undertaking will demand all my 
powers and abilities, leaving no time to attend to 
the work to which I have hitherto devoted all the 
energies of mind and body. I have made full ar­
rangements to superintend the laboratory work 
of the Champion Reaper * Mower Co., at Spring- 
field, Ohio, which will occupy all my time, so 
long as I remain with that company, and must 
therefore reluctantly take leave of my numerous 
patients and friends who have heretofore reposed 
such confidence in me, leaving them in the hands 
of loving angel guardians who will henceforth, as 
in the past, lead and guide them in the way of all 
truth Let forward forever be your motto, and 
the attainment of the highest truth ever be your 
alm. and sometime in the near or far future, as it 
may be, patient loving faith and earnest effort 
will bring the happy fulfillment of all our desires 
which are based upon the laws of permanent 
growth within the sou).

With these heart-felt adieus 1 now take my 
leave of a generous coterie of my friends, and 
though I shall be seel uded in my laboratory from 
outside work in the spiritual vineyard, I trust that 
I may still be considered as working, with the 
spirits of this and other spheres for the advance- 
meat of the interest of a common humanity.

D. P. Kayner, M. D.
Chicago, Not! 1st, 1881.

Prayer.

To the Editor of the Keiigio-PhiloBonhlcal Journal:
In your issue of Oct. &d; in referring to “The 

Prayer Test.” we are left to infer that because the 
prayers of 50,000,000 of Christians proved a “pit­
iable failure” as a health restorer Inthe case of 
President GarfHd, that the whole scheme of 
prayer is a failure. N jw, to our mind this simply 
proves. 50,000,000 failures, and not that prayer is 
at all times a failure; neither does it follow-that 
because there were 50,000 000 failures in this In­
stance, that prayer is a “sad superstition.” We 
might as well say that the repeated failures of 
Edison and other scientists are follies and sad 
superstitions, or that because mediums oftentimes 
fall, that mediumship, as our orthodox friends 
claim, Isa "had superstition?’ Prayer 1b the 
communing with God through the medium of an­
gels, and is the only way that we can communi­
cate with the Infinite. To our mind the reason 
why there are so many prayer failures Is, that the 
materiality of the message is such that It is im­
possible for these spiritual messengers to under, 
take its delivery. R. Fisher.

Bement, 111.

Note from Mlehlm.

To the Editor of tha Bellgio-PhllowpIiIcs’Journal:
The cause moves on in this section nicely. Prof. 

Seymour is with us, spoke here the 23rd, also two 
evenings and Sunday the 80th. The Professor is 
doing a good work. Wherever he goes the people 
become Interested. We have regular meetings 
every month, and oftener when we can. We are 
In good shape for another year’s work, provided 
with hall, etc., under our own con trol. Since the 
Christians national prayer day, aud our PreBident 
died, and the Lord changed not, all is quiet in 
the “valley of dry bones,” As Spiritualists and 
Liberaliste we nave the credit erf causing the 
death erf our President, despite their prayers and 
an infinite God. In hu death the whole Christian 
world have met with a defeat before unknown In 
the annals of history. His change to splrit-llfe 
has opened the eyes of millions who will leave 
the stalls of superstition for an open field; where 
the beauties of our philosophy so natural and 
true, will at once be embodied by them.Charles A Amprus.

Flushing, Mich, Oct M, 1881.

May Illa Kind Increase-

Better late, perhaps, than not at all; certainly 
only just to the cultured speaker, to say that the 
First Association of Spiritualists of Philadelphia 
have been enjoying for several Sundays the very 
intellectual, effective, elevating and refining lec­
tures of Mr. A B. French, of Clyde, Ohio, a gen­
tleman possessed of most excellent abilities, a 
soul cultured and refined, broad and penetrative 
thought, trenchant reasoning powers and in- 
cisive convincing logic; a natural orator, his 
flights and spirit pore are perfectly sublime. There 
are seasons when he seems to lose self entirely 
and he floats off amid a boundless sea of the loft­
iest inspirations, carrying hla audience breathless 
and enchanted with him.

Mr. French also gave to some of his discourses 
a local interest to us, very effective, pleasing and 
happy. Good angels encamp about him always, 
and in their hands bear him up and keep him 
above all harm. We loved the man from the first 
time we met. His presence is refining, his touch 
magnetic and healing. Oh! how the spiritual 
rostrum does need more such souls, such clear 
clean minds to elevate it above the rash petulant 
and sensuous murky atmosphere gloaming round 
it. Societies that prefer to be upbuilded and 
strengthened In real social culture and kindly 
fellowship, should be careful to Invite into their 
midst such inspirational men as A. B. French, in. 
stead of persons of doubtful character. Men or 
societies who wish to live above and remain un­
contaminated with scandal and its deleterious 
effects, must not associate with nor endorse it, 
nor those with whom it is associated.

Society does not laugh enough. The world is 
far too serious. Men live and act as If the circuit 
ot life was simply for the solemn business of 
money getting. There is one muscle for drawing 
the mouth up; two for drawing it down. Why 
should we not live natural-elongate the face 
less, laugh and broaden and round it more, and 
perseqtienee live longer and enjoy our living bet- 
ter.
I have just read with mueh pleasure your edi­

torial contained in Journal of 22id inst., under 
the head of “Give our Mediums Time to Rest.” 
Bless you for the timely and essential suggestions 
contained In that article. They are replete with 
happy, healing, unctions thought and affectionate 
advice from the angel world, who so often camp 
round us with healing in their wings. It should 
be perused and pondered aud gratefully acted on 
by every medium in the land. Fraternally,

. M. D. Reichneb. 
Oct 23,1881.

English nttnalism.

The continued confinemeht of the Rev. Mr. 
Green, rector of St, John, MilXPlatting, Man­
chester, In Lancaster Jail, is still chase of much 
excitement and Irritation not only among his own 
parishioners, but largely throughout ecclesiasti­
cal circles In England. Among non-conformists 
Mr. Green’s case is regarded as a sort of practical 
commentary upon the unsound condition of the 
English Established Church. Mr. Green has, by 
persistently indulging In certain prescribed ritual­
istic practices and by stubbornly refusing to pay 
any attention to the monition of his Bishop, and 
the exhibition that followed, set himself up in 
open defiance of the laws of his church. It is true 
that he says that the laws under which he has 
been cast into prison are unconstitutional. But 
this is a poor way of justifying the course which 
he has so persistently pursued. As the law now 
stands, and as the law is now administered, Mr. 
Green Is a transgressor; and as a transgressor he 
is now suffering. But the non-conformist natur­
ally enough asks, “Why keep up all this excite­
ment?” He had refused to put himself 1a the 
hands of his own Bishop two and a half years ago, 
and what he could not m then he would not do 
now. Mr. Green Insists on continuing a minister 
in the Anglican cbmmuaion, and yet he will not 
accept the ruling of the Archbishr.p’s court, nor 
the opinion of the assembled Bishops of the 
Anglican communion throughout the world, nor 
the deter tai nation of his own Bishop, nor-the in­
vitation of the Archbishop of ah owa proviace, 
hence he must remain In prison, simply because 
his opinion differs somewhat from those in au­
thority.

Another Wonder.

(London Telegraph.)
Wonders will, never cease. By aid of the dio- 

scope, an ingenious instrument, brought for the 
first time to public notice during the Parisian 
E ectoral Congress, patrons of the drama who 
are reluctant to leave their comfortable firesides 
and temporarily revolutionize all their domestic 
arrangements in order to attend theatrical per­
formances in loco, will henceforth be enabled to 
see as well as hear their favorite operatic and his- 
trionlc artists without stirring a yard from home. 
The apparatus consists of a small “objective” 
lens, fixed up In a position commanding the stage 
of no matter what theatre, and connected with 
an electric wire with a diminutive white glass 
plate, which may be framed and-set in the panel 
of a private drawing-room, however distant from 
the play-house in question. Total darkness hav­
ing been obtained in the room furnished with a 
dloscepe.s perfect picture of the stage,ite scenery, 
actors, etc., faithful in color, and absolutely re­
producing ths whole perfoimance, will become 
visible upon the surface of the glass plate. Sup­
plemented by a telephone communicating with 
the theatre, the dioscope will therefore enable its 
owner to spend his evening at the opera in dress­
ing gown and slippers, if such be his ideal of com­
fort, seated in an essy-chair. To those—and their 
name is legion—who detest premature dinner, 
hurried dressing, and a couple of hours’ cabbing 
‘ there and back,” as the hitherto inevitable con­
comitants of a visit to the play, the condition of 
things rendered feasible by the invention of the 
dloscope will present itself as a truly blissful ad­
dition to the pleasure resources.

Fishback-Winans.

To the Editor of the Kellglo-PhilOBophical Journal:
Messrs. Flshbaek and Winans were here during 

the past weekend we have no doubt of the hon­
esty of both of these gentlemen. Mr. Fishback 
as a lecturer has but few equals, but in our ooin. 
ion it Is a mistake to introduce Mr. Winans be­
fore a skeptical public audience. He Is the most 
sensitive and susceptible person that we have 
ever met, and can be influenced by any kind of a 
spirit in or out of the body; and Is liable to be 
controlled by infiaences that make a bad impres­
sion upon those who are ignoraut of psychologi­
cal taws.

His private stances and teste while here have 
been a success in every instance, so far as we 
have been able to learn, and some have been con­
vinced of the fact of spirit presence and spirit 
communication.

R. Fisher.
Bement, III., Oct 27,1881.

Nathaniel N. Fierce, Inspirational speaker 
and healer, writes as follows: I wish to congratu­
late you on the good work you are doing through 
the columns of the Journal—exactly what is and 
has been needed In the spiritual ranks for a long 
timei and I hope you will continue your fearless 
course. I am an Inspirational speaker and heal­
ing medium; have been in the field constantly at 
work for the last thirteen years, principally in the 
New England and the Middle States for the last 
six years. I have been engaged In giving psy­
chometric readings on business and health. I 
have performed many remarkable cures. I in- 
struct my patrons howto cure all forms of dis­
ease without any medicine whatever, and can in­
struct any medium in one how?* time to do the 
same. No trouble about Doctors’Laws; let them 
get silly Legislatures to paw all the laws they 
wish, to regulate the practice of medicine. I have 
a discourse on “Common Sense Thoughts and 
Criticisms on the Religious Teachings of the 
Present Day,” and would be gla^to deliver It be­
fore any of the liberal societies in NewEngland.

Tbe evidence that Mohammed was a good man, 
devoutly religions, and a noble specimen of the 
human race, la too great to be put aside by preju­
dice; and It la possible that inspiration, as now 
understood and explained by Spiritualist#, might 
have had very much to with his career.

A BemarkaMe Epitaph.

Scientific men just now, are anxious to show 
that they act according to Herbert Spencer, in 
that they neither affirm nor deny anything in re. 
gard to religious questions. Prof. Clifford, who 
recently died near London, had the following 
placed on his tombstone:

“I was not, and was conceived; I lived, and did 
a little work; I am not, and grieve not?’

Note* rend ExtHKits.

w^re°W*,t #nd improvement arc possible every- 

Nothing really succeeds that is not based on 
ful y* skarn, in a large sense, is never suecess-

Nothing can be more manly than honor,trust 
and love, working out truth, purity and gentle- 
ness.
g The Hindoos, who taught the existence of 
fourteen spheres, were by no means at sea in their 
speculations concerning the unseen.

All do not need the same form of discipline, 
but all require a discipline adequate to develop 
every grace of the spirit.

A man is neither a fool nor a rascal for being 
an atheist. He is following his logic honestly, 
and his honesty will bring him out all right after 
awhile.

Is it to be expected that any great baptism o. 
the spirit will be vouchsafed to those who only in 
terrogate spirits prompted by motives ofidleen.' 
rlosity or greed of gain?

Spirits who inspire trance-speaking and other 
mediums, ought not to be expected to be perfect 
encyclopedias of information on all seientiiie, his­
torical and theological subjacts.

A good portion of our go-called religion of to-day 
is inherited from fetish worshipers. There are 
fetish days, fetleh books, fetish priests, fetish 
robes, fetish buildings—all too sacred for average 
use.

A boy came home from school much excited, 
and told his father that he believed all human 
beings were descended from apes, which made 
the old man so mad that he replied, angrily, 
"That may be the case with you, but it ain’t with 
me, I can tell you that, now."

This is an age of rapid transition. Each 
month reveals some new *and startling intelli­
gences. There is a -power invisible and strong 
within our minds which is sweeping humanity 
along in its pathway up the difficult, ascent 
through which human development must be 
achieved.

Glve-the world a rational spiritual religion, 
throw away the doctrine of an atonement, let the 
people have the truth, let them understand there 
is no forgiveness of 6i„s—that every man is re­
sponsible to every other man,and every other man 
is responsible to him for the manner in which 
the problems of life are being solved.

Tbe child many times is made to believe that 
God is offended with him; he starts- out in life 
with the idea of an angry God, and aa if this was 
not enough, the theory of a devil is added; so you 
see first man, and an angry God hurling thunder­
bolts at him, which he attempts to dodge, and no ■ 
doubt would succeed were it not for his ubiqui­
tous majesty, who comes up on the other side and 
defeats all previous plans of escape.

As the lion and elephant would starve in Lap- 
land, so the reindeer could not survive In India; 
and as the Hindoo could not endure tho severity 
of Greenland, so the Icelander would be unable to 
exist in Ceylon. To every flower, animator man, 
there is a congenial spot which he fain would call 
his home, and away from which he feels an exile; 
nature having so adapted localities to their inhab­
itant®, th at not a living thing is without a home 
somewhere,

Our B:b’e, the Koran,^nd Mother eacred books 
acknowledge God to be omnipotent in power, 
omniscient and omnipresent; and this consti­
tutes a very broad platform. Such a power must 
have a perfect knowledge of the results of every 
force, principle or law. In action throughout 
all worlds; to him there could be no disap­
pointments, no surprises; therefore it is absurd 
to speak of that sublime Intelligence as be­
ing angry at any time.

Tbe Rev. John W. Chadwick, in a recent ser­
mon, says: “No doubt, if once the evolutionary 
theory of man’s descent should obtain the uni­
versal suffrages of scientific men, it would be in- 
stated that the Bible taught this theory, and that 
the church has always taught it. I could name 
more than one Bible text that seems almost im­
patient for the honor of anticipating the Darwin. 
Ian hypothesis, and It. should be more apt than 
many a text which is to-day esteemed prophetic 
of scientific truth.”

The American Board of Foreign Missions late­
ly held their Annual Meeting in St. Louis. The 
statistics of the year’s work are good. Number 
of laborers of all classes in mission work, 2.131; 
pages of tracts In native languages, 25,000,000; 
churches, 272; church members, 18,440; added 
during the year, 2,161; punite in school, 33,360. 
The financial statement shows total receipts of 
8451,214; of this the sources were, donations 
from churches and individuals, $215,016; from 
legacies, $92,268; from the Woman’s Board, $102, 
037, and the remainder from Sunday schools and 
miscellaneous receipts.

A Paris physician relates the particulars of a 
curious case he has under his charge. It is that 
of a young girl, eighteen years of age, who 18 af­
flicted with what b termed nychatopia, that is to 
say she loses the faculty of sight in daylight and 
recovers it in darkness. Although her eyes do 
not present any special morbid character, she Is 
forced to keep her eyelids closed during the day 
and to cover her head with a thick vei!. On the 
Other hand, when the shutters of a room are her­
metically fastened she reads and writes perfectly 
In the deepest darkneBS. She feels no pain be­
yond a slight lassitude when the solar light 
strikes her visual organs.

To us nothing la more clear than that morality 
depends noton any system of faith; It requires 
no miraculous evidence; it is independent of theo. 
logical dogma; no supernatural halo can heighten 
itsbeauty; no ecclesiastical influence can strength, 

•en jts obligations; it is confined to no one country, 
limited to no one age, restricted to no one form 
of faith, the exclusive possession of no one class, * 
sect, order, nation, or race of men; It requires no 
single Individual authority; theology cannot add 
to it, neither can it take from it. It has its indes­
tructible basis in the nature of man as a feeling, 
thinking, acting being,and In society as an aggre­
gation of such beings, with the manifold relations 
and acknowledged rights and duties that spring 
therefrom.—R. F. Underwood.

What we want Is not to get up a heaven of 
all sort* of whitewashed saints—a paradise com­
posed Jargely of the unterrified democracy of 
rascality; to tell the truth, that heaven is m 
much a myth m hell. You and I live under natu­
ral laws, and we are just as much subject to them 
as the trees of the forest. Decay is decay. A rot­
ten tree cannot blossom; you may transplant it to 
a garden of Eden, If you will,—it Is dead, rotten, 
flowerless, fruitless.- You may transfer your de­
cayed souls where you will, they are decayed, 
dead, fruitless and hopeless. Immortality is 
“fl ccBtenancq of our life forces—the soul pow­
er, which is apart of God. Keep yourself as 
a part of God and you cannot be destroyed—von 
are immortal— Olive Branch.

No dream ofpoet.no conception of religious 
teacher.csn ever portray with adequate vividness, 
the real torment awaiting the vicious and the ut- 
terly selfish in the world beyond death. That any 
Buffering 1# everlasting, we utterly deny; the 
thought of an angry Judge and a burning lake Is 
altogether foreign to the truth. No external per­
son or thing will be there to condemn you. Con­
science, memory, effect,—these abide; and the 
realization that yon are not what you might have 
been,the stinging conviction that ail happiness wm 
possible unto von, and would have been yours had* 
?°1B^ spurned it, the full assent of yonr reason 
to the justice of the doom that has overtaken you, 
these considerations are your punishment; bnt 
they are also your salvation, for out of the prison- 
house of misery, well-nigh of despair, the spirit 
may extricate itself alone by desires to atone for 
DW*-* being never impossible.

ofpoet.no
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Heber Donaldson, a lawyer in Emlenton, 
Pa., has been expelled from the Presbyte­
rian church far walking through a qua­
drille, he could not dance. He has carried 
his ease up to the presbytery andthe synod, 
made eloquent speeches in his own de­
fense, tried to show that walking in a 
dance is not so very bad but is deposed each 
time, and now proposes to appeal to the 
General Assembly. Grand work for tbat 
pious body, with its 603 clergy or more.. If 
he were only a Rook River Methodist 
preacher charged with lying, how pleasant 
would his path be! But tqdancejs a grave 
matter! -’

The successor of Dr. Holland as editor of 
The C^fitury (late Seribner's Magazine), is 
Richard Watson Gilder, associate editor 

. from its start, born in Bordentown. New 
Jersey in 1814, son of a Methodist clergy­
man; self-taught and an editor aud author 
of acknowledged ability. The December 
Century will be largely a memorial of Dr. 
Holland aud President Garfield. It will ap­
pear Nov. 19th, with flue portraits of both 
and matters of interest in their lives.

“Real Life in the Spirit Land,’’ price We., 
postage Sc., 210 pages; and “The Principles 
of Nature, as discovered in the development 
and structure of the Universe, the Solar 
System, the Earth, Laws method and his­
tory of their development. An Exposition 
of the Spiritual Universe, given inspira­
tionally,’’ Three volumes, $5.00; postage 
83c. Both these valuable works 'are by 
Mrs. Maria M. King, and should be widely 
read, for their rare interest and instruc­
tion.

The Second Day Adventists’organ, the 
Review and Herald, thinks that the Lord 
is getting ready to burn up the world be­
cause there are here and there surface in­
dications of petroleum, and petroleum will 
burn! On which the Alliance says: “If all 
the fools were as afraid of petroleum as is 
the Review and Herald there would he 
fewer kerosene explosions.”

The Chinese imitate their Caucasian 
brethren in more ways than one. There 
has existed in San Francisco for some time 
a Chinese religious society called the Sing 
Tong. Dissensions arose among the breth­
ren, and one faction seceded and started an 
organization under the name Hop Sing 
Tong, whereupon the Sing Tongs raided 
the joss-house of the seceders, smashed 
their idols, and destroyed things generally.

The decrease of the public debt since 
June 80 has been $41,742,880. In the month 
of September it was $17.483641. This is 
reduction at the rate of $167,000 000 a year.

The leading Scientist* of to-day agree that mon 
diseases are earned by dtsorderea Kidney* or Liver. If.t-.ere- 
rare, the Kidney* Md Liver are kept in perfect order, ner- 
fect health will be the rarut. This truth hM ouiy been 
known a Mort time and for year* people suffered great agony 
without being able to find relief. The discovery of w arner* 
Safe Kidney and Liver Cure mark* a new era in the treat­
ment of these troniiei. Made from a s mnle tropical leaf ot 
rare value. It contain* jolt the element* neceieary tonourlah 
and Invigorate both of these great organs, and safely restore 
and tan them In order. Itis a POSITIVE Kennedy 
for all the disease* that cause pain* in the lower part ot the 
body-for Torpid Liver—Headache*—Jaundice—Dizziness- 
Gravel—Fever. Ague—Malarial Fever, and ah difficulties of 
the Kidneys, Liver and Urinary Organ*

It 1a an excellentandaafe remedy for females during Preg­
nancy. It will control Menstruation and Is invaluable for 
Leucorrhcsa or Falling oi the Womb.

A* a Blood Purifier it isnnetiuaied, for it cures the organs 
thatmak* the blood.

Tilts Remedy, which halftone such wonders, is put up in 
the LAR HUT SIZED BOTTLE of any medicine upon the 
market, anti i* sold by Druggists and ail dealers at *1.211 
per bottle. For Diabetes, enquire for WARNER'S SAFE 
DIABETES CURE. It is a POSITIVE Remedy.
H. H. WARNER, & CO., Rochester, N. Y.

20 Beautiful Star:5. t» Octave* 
Carved Walnut Ca-io. Srndfor 
cur Illustrated Catalogue. It 
gives information which pro­
tests the purchaser and makes 
deceitimpcrsiKc. Marchal A 
Smith, 8 W.iito Si.,N. Y.
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Truth Is Mighty. .
’ When Dr. Pierce of Buffalo, N. Y., announ- 

■ ced that his '’Favorite Prescription” would 
positively cure the many diseases and weak­
nesses peculiar to women, some doubted, and 
continued to employ the harsh and caustic lo­
cal treatment. But tbe mighty truth gradual­
ly became acknowledged. Thousands of la­
dies employed the '• Favorite Prescription” 
and were speedily cured. By druggists.

KmixiTOM or BmiaxcM-'Dally except Sunday. 
tExcept Saturday*. IDatiy. {Except Monday*.

The Duke of Sutherland is atthe head of 
a company of Englishmen, with £2,500,000, 
who have bought sixty square miles on the 
St. PauLand Omaha Railroad, stxty miles 
east of Sioux City, for a colony; price, 
$103,000.

Troublesome Children, 
that are always wetting their beds ought not 
to be scolded and punished for what they can 
not help. They need a medicine having a 
tonic efiect on the kidneys and the urinary 
organs. Such a medicine is Kidney-Wort. It 
has ,specific action. Do not fail to get it for 
them.—Exchange.

Rev. Mr. Piper was once called upon to 
marry a man to his fourth wife. Aa he ap­
proached the couple, lie said :" Please to rise.” 
The man wriggled about in his chair a mo­
ment, and finally spoke: “ We’ve usually sot!”

" And the Leaves were for the healing of 
the Nations.

Dr. Pierce’s Extract of Smart-Weed breaks 
up colds, fevers and inflammatory attacks,and 
is specific for colic, cramps, diarrhoea, and 
dysentary. By druggists.

Newspapers and Magazines 
Tor Sale at tbe Office of thi* Paper.

Banner of Lights Borton. 8 Cbm.
Olivo Branch, Utica, N.Y.
Tte fjpiritnallatand Journal of

10

Psychological Science, London, d
The Shaker Manifesto, Shaker*, N. Y. ID Mb

Medium end Day Break, London, Eng. 8 *»

The Theosophlst, Bombay, India.’. W . to

The Two World*, New York. B M

RATES OF ADVERTISING.
Kadi Une in Agate type, twenty centefor the first, 

and fifteen cent* for every subsequent insertion.
NOTICES set as reading matter, fa Minion type, 

under the head of “ Business,” forty cent* per line 
for each insertion. 

Ag&te type measures fourteen Une* to the inch.
Minion type measures ten Unes to the Inch.

Eritoi of payment, strictly, cash In mItmu,

whettpamMa.

A GENTS WANTED for MARY CLEMMER'S

JAMES A. GARFIELD. 
it!inr.T,mtk?‘,i®rii'«1” wonders,marvels,mysteries, 
I. ere: doings, ete., ofthe Capital, "®<: rMr.i K-^th‘vi," 
Vives sketches of The, Ladies of tlie While Howse, 
find in the lol ffT.ir.J tukesl. It Inetolcs -IHJli:- amir.iti:^, 
Iri’il prtr oft < ’ !’r-'.’ it! n i *•■. ote Sto?. Send for circulars 
with Extra. Terms to Agent;:. Grand riant? to zil ®cr>. 
AdteoExcelsior Pub. Co., 27N.Clark-st,Chicago, HI.

81 7 82 5elW

THE G-REAT 
SPIRITUAL REMEDIES 

MRS. SPENCE’S 

Positive and Negative
"Our family think there is nothing like the Positive and 

Negative Powder*"—soiays J. H. Wiggins, ofBeaver Dam, 
Wii., and so say* everybody.

Buy the Positives for Fevers. Coughs. Cold*, Bronchitis, 
Asthma, Dyspepsia, Dysentery. Diarrhoea, Liver Complaint, 
Heart Disease. Kidney Complaint!, Neuralgia, Headache- Fe­
male Disease*, Rheumatism, Nervousness, Sleeplewin-. m, 
and all active ana acute disease*. , ,

Buy the Negatives forFaralysfa.Deatkies*, Amsar nJ*, 
typhoid and Typhus Fever*. Buy a box of Positive a id 
Negative (baitand half) forChiI1«and Few.

^filled, postpaid, for #f.® a box, or six boxes for *5 0. 
Send money at our risk and expense by Registered Latte’- or 
by Money Order. Agents wanted. Solti by Druggists, 
. »»For sale wholesale and retail by the Bellglo-PliUoscpM- 
eai Publishing House. Chicago.

VOICE OF ANGELS.
8 page*, published at No. 5 Dwight Street, Boston, 

Mas*., the lit Md 15th ofeach inonth.
BpibitL. JUDD PARDEE. Editor-In-Chief, 

D. K. MINER, Buslne** Manager.
D. C. DENSMORE. Publisher.

Price yearly, . - • ;
Six month*, • .
Three month*, •
Single copies, '• • •

The above rate* include portage. 
fret on application atthliofflce.

fl.® In advance.
.75 “
.40 “
.07 “

^P«C*nU*» «JH«I '*4*4

All Pottal ordere should be made payable to M. B. Sprague. 
No. 5 Dwight St., Beaton; and all letter* anil communica­
tions (to receive attention) mu*t be directed (postpaid), in

Critical History ofthe Doctrine of a Future Life in all 
Agro and Nation*. Wm. E. Alger................... ...

Conant Mr*. J. H. Biography of.. ............
” " " " fullgllt...........................  t

Does Matter do it AB? Sargent.7 Reply to Tyndall, 
Death In the Light ofthe Harmonisl rhilesopto by

Mary F. Davis,cloth—............................. . ..............
Dlakkaism............ . ................................ . ...................
Debate, Burgtm and 'Underwood. Cloth *1.® ® Paper 
jar»m;su vs. trm'i’ualtoi:!—lion. J. M. Pevu.ca. - . 
.Math a -d the Alter Life -A.. J. Davia Pa. €5 Cs. Cis. 
Vroatable Land. &>?. Lt, D. Owen...........-—-..........  
Tfiia-XJ. Davis, CIstii,®®- Paper............. - 
toiltgz.s fur Children............................................     —
Sovas::* his Msl-;> r................................... . ...................
'usgcS g:!;?, bv MaryF.Davla...............................
Semi :; Light to rlartnonlal Pi.iiocepto—M. F. Dav.s 
Defence of Srii talto.- Wnllaee...............................
'sMcttoiuuy, Webster'* Uimbridp d ."to express)........

*’ " Pocket, fe:zMcor;r.............
Dyspepsia, its Treatment, etc,........................................  
Descent of Man, by Darwin...... . ....................................  
Davenport Brothers,—their Ifemarltable and Interest- 

lag History—.......... . ......................  ...
Die&sts. by Liev. Robert Taylor, written by him wMla 

imprisoned for blasphemy. This work Is an account 
ofthe origin, evidence, and early history of Chris- 

9w&jIpiK'by Rev! RolierETaylor.'^ a sketch of 
tte Author’*- .

3eluge»by Wm. Denton.'.'. . .......................  
tarienti* of .Tuilgo Edmonds la Spirit-life, given 
tpiromeefS^irVrmli^^ »iifflet2i,"tai

Verity, Practicability, Conditions and Laws. Paper 
175 06. Clot!....................... .................................. .........

Utting for Strength -............. y-.-wn—o.'—'
kthlc* of Spiritualism, by Hudson Tlittl*,.—Paper.

„ .. ,, « Cloth,
Edwin Drood. Cloth...................—. .............. . ........... .
Experienceof Samuel Bowles In Splrlt-Llfe, through 

the Mediumship of Carrie E.B, Twlng— ......-
itopusiuiiu o; »«!im rreeuoiu. . ..................................................
O«sy^on Man—Pope, Cloth gilt l.W ®. Board, School 
Srrora of the’Bllfle, Demonstrated bjrtlio Truths of Na­

ture, by Henry C. Wright. Paper ;i5 01. Cloth......  
“essence of Religion. L. Feuerbach. Paper 35 02. Cloth 
Exeter Hal), Theological Romance. Clo. 85 10. Paper 
Cmpiro of the Mother over the Character and Destiny

oftheRace,by II. (3.Wright, Paper® 01. Cloth... 
Cectrlcal Psychology. Dous...............—-.................
Qetulnlanantl Baccate Mysteries—.....—..——.—— 
Foot Note*, or Walking a* a Fine Art....................... 
Fabulous Tendency of Ancient Author*, by M. B.

Craven.—............. . ............ ................—......... ——.......
Fu S.mg; or. The Di wovmv of America, by Chinese 

Buddhist Prlitosin ?lis> Mil Century........................
flata of Light from the Spirit Land, through the 

mediumship of Mi i. J. 11. Conant....... . ...................
IcotCills on tiie Binmilarv of Another World, by Ro’o’t 

Dale Gwen.............................. .
Free Thoughts Coni’crnin" M?lnn, or Nature ts.

Theology, by A. J. Davis.' Enter,led Edition. Cloth 
75Paper............. ............................... .........—.

Fountain. A. J. Davis........... . .......................  ....
FuturoLtfe. Mrs.Sweet..,;.............-...—....... ...
Four Essays Concerning Spiritism—Dr, H. Tleileman 
God tiio Fathe-r aril Man tiie linage of Ged, by Maria 

M. King............ —. .......—..’.............„—.
Glimpses of ths Supernatural........ . ............................ .
Genesis anil Ethics of Conjugal Love. A. J. Davis

Plain,75®. J’aiw—........ ...........-.-—.--- .
Good Sente. By Boron D’Holbach........... ...... ..............  
Great Harniimia. A. J. Davis. 5 Volo., viz.: Vol. I,

Tho Physician; Vol.2,Tiie Ttwlier: Vol.3, 'ilia Sesr; 
Vol. 4. The Reformer: Vol. 5. The Thinker. Eiu:h-

Hlitory of the Christian Religion, byC. V. Waite, 
Clothf2.39 Sheen/-.....——.;——

8reteae of Hie Brain and Cura of Nervousness, by 
M.L. Holbrook........... —. ............... —. .................-

Howto Magnetize, by Jsmeo V. WIison....... .............
Homo Talks, by J. H. Noyes.....................................  
Higher Aspect of Spiritualism, by M. A. fOxon).'...

Herolncs of Free Thought, by Sara A. UndenveoiL.... 
Haled, Prince of Pen-iii, Ills Experience in Earth-life 

ami Spirit-life, Illustrated.——....■•—-.........
Hierophant; or, Gleanings from the Past—G.C.Stewart 
Harbinger of. Health, by A. J. Davis...............-,-.-,.
Harmonial Man;or, Thoughts fertile Age, A. J. Davis

Cloth........................................................ .................
Haunted School House—-.-----.--..---.-. 
History and Philosophy of Evil—A. J. Davis. Pa. ® ®.
H#^rd$B<»kofan’BeU$onK!n'ci^
How and Why 1 beciuno a Spiritualist —- -.—.—. 
How to Bathe. E. P. Miller, M. R Paper ® 01. Cloth 
Hedged in. Elizabeth Stuart Phelps, author of Gate* 
Hte'PisiK;Mffi®ni’2S;«^

Condition* arat Course of the Life of Man. J. W. 
Draper, M. ft, JXD. 650 pp. Cloth——....— 

Hesperia: a Poem. Cora I* V, (Tappan) Bichmond- 
How to Paint. a*Kner--to.-....... .
HisWof tte Jtattilrctutfl Development of Europa 
J. W. Draper; Hevtoed Edition. 2 Vol*........ .......

History of the Pre-HUtoric Age*, to H. L. Nuon, 
translated by Dr. J.Cooper—,...... ............. ......

ItTheu, and Woen. poem, to W 8.Bartt>wM,—c
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M. A. Blunt, Printer.

Dr.KEAN,
173 South Clark St, Chicago, XVW 
mall. Ree of charge, on ail chronic or nervon* diseases. Dr. 
J. KEAN h the only physician inthe city who warrant* 
cures or no pay. Finest Illustrated book extant; SMpage*, 
beautifully bound; pcncriptlom for all dlteaM. Price *1, 
poitpald- : :

FOUR ESSAYS CONCERNING
SPIRITISM.

WHAT IS SPIRIT P
WHAT IS MAN P 

Organiza tion of the Spirit-Body, 
Matter, Space, Time.

Thoanthor. Heinrich Tledeman,M.D.,!*aGennan scholar, 
lie present* many thoughts in reference to the snhjects trea*- 
ed Sat are worthy of careful consideration, 

FriceSOcents, portage Scent*, 
.•.Tor sale, wholesale anil retail, by theHnwOIOPHlSO 

toriwaiFuni-waijra Hons*. Chicago.

I*1iunveiled. 2 Vol*...... .  WOT
IIDarwInRlght? W.Denton.............................  I® 10
Intimations i,t Immortality, by Geo. A. Fuller..........  
incidents in My Life. 2nd Serina.................................
Intuition, a Novel. Mrs. F. Kingman............  
Important Truths, a book for every cldld.............. 
mtns Bible Divine? 8. J. Finney. Paper &5 02. Cloth 
Ii there* Devil? The Argument Pro and Con........... 
Infidel: or. Inquirer’s Text Book. Robert Cooper.... 
I* it the Despairof Science. W. p. Gunning........... .  
Irrepressible Conflict and the Unity of God, whig two 

lectures. Emma Hardinge and T. G. Forster.......
t*Spiritualism True?, Wm. Denton,.......■ 
Irreconcilable Records or Genesis and Geology. W.

Denton. Paper 25 02. Cloth.......................... .
Influence of Christianity on Civilisation. Underwood 
Identity of Primitive Christianity anil Modern Spirit­ualism. E. Crowell. Vol. 1.2.50®. Vol. II. J
Jeiusof Nazareth, By Paul and JudM, through Alex­

anderSmyth. Remarkable and interesting work..
Jehovah Unveiled; or, The Character of the Jewish 

Deity Delineated..'.................. . ............................
Joan of Arc, a Biography translated from tlie French, 

bySarahM. Grlmkee................... ..........
KuiccftheAli-Foem.hyMrb 0,8. Matteson..........
King David Mini his Times, Common Senia View, 
Heyto'Politlcil Science] by John SenLC”“—«L”"I!! 
Kinder’s Secrets of Bee-Keeping................,.,.....
Koran, with explanatory notes, by George Sale. 8* 
. 410 pp. Best edition yet published................... 
foraa, with Life of Mohammed, translated by George

Ufa Beyond the Grave................................................  
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Prfccitec’sof Namre, bv Mr?. 31. M. King....................
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Progressive tte: vter, ft* ii*. Giit.................................. 
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What Wm He? By W. Denton. P.-.Mr, 4.® 10. Cicth 
Worlds within Worlds—Wonderful Dhaaveriesln Ai- 

tronomy—W. B. Fahnestock,........... . .................to
Welting, A. B. Binirrapto of.........................................  
Who are Christinas?. Deuton........ . ..............................
Wlist is Right—Denton....................................................
Why I Was Excommunicated from tub presoyterra
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CHICAGO, BOCK ISLAND & PACIFIC B Y
Is The Croat Connecting Link between the East and the West I

8
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Its main line runs from Chicago to Council 
Bluffs, passing through Joliet, Ottawa, LaSalle, 
Geneseo, Moline. Rock Island, Davenport, West 
Liberty, Iowa City, Marengo.Brooklyn,Grinnell, 
Des Moines (the capital of Iowa), Stuart; Atlan­
tic. and Avoca: with branches from Bureau 
Junction to Peoria; Wilton Junction to Musca­
tine, Washington, Fairfield Eldon, Belknap, 
Cantreville.Princeton.Trenton.Gallatln. Came­
ron, Leavenworth, Atchison, and Kansas City: 
WashingtontoSigourney, Oskaloosa, and Knox­
ville; Keokuk to Farmington, Bonaparte, Ben-' 
tonsport, Independent, Eldon, Ottumwa, JEddy- 
vill&Oskalonsa, Pella, Monroe, and Des Moines; 
Mt. Zion to Keosauqua; Newton to Monroe: Des 
Moines to Indianolaand Winterset; Atlantic to 
Griswold and Audubon; and Avoca to Harlan 
and Carson, This is positively the only Rail­
road, which owns, and operates a through line 
from Chicago into the State ot Kansas. .

Through ExpressPassengerTralns, wlthPull- 
man PaiaceCars attached,are run each way daily 
between Chicago and Peoria, Kansas Cite, 
Council Bluffs, Leavenworth and.ATcHi- 
bon. Through carsarcalsorun betweenMllwau- 
kee and Kansas City, via tho “Milwaukee and 
Rock Island Short Line."

The “Great Rock Island ” Is magnificently 
equipped. Its road bed issimply perfect, audits 
track is laid with steel rails. , ,

Wbatwlll please you most will bethepleasure 
of enjoying your meals, while passing over the 
beautiful prairiesot Illinoisand Iowa, in one of 
our magnificent Dining Cars that accompany all 
Through Express Trains. You get an entire 
meal, as good as is served in any flrat-cla*s hotel, 
for seventy-five cents.

Appreciating the fact that a majority ot the 
people prefer separate apartments for different

Sleeping Con for sleeping purposes, and Palace 
Dinina Car* foresting purposes only. One other 
great feature of our Palace Cars Is a SMOKING 
SALOON where you can enjoy your “Havana” 
at all hours of the day.

Magnificent Iron Bridges span the Mississippi 
and Missouri rivers at all points crossed by this 
line, and transfers areavoided at Council Bluffs, 
Kansas City, Leavenworth and Atchison, con­
nections being made in Union Depots.
The principal R. R. connections of 

this great Through Line are as follows*
At Chicago, with ail diverging lines for the 

East and South.
At Enolkwood, with the M. & M.S,, andP., 

Ft. W. AC. R.Rtls.
At Washington Heights, with P., C. <6 St. 

L. R. R,
At La Sau* with TH. Cent. R. R. ' . „ ■
At Peoria, with P. P.*J.:P.D.&E.;LB.& 

W.; HI, MW.-, anil T. P. * W. Rds.
At Rock Island, with “Milwaukee anil Rock 

Island Short line,” anti Rock Isi’d * Peo. Rd*.
At davenport, with the Davenport Division

C.M.4St.P.RK. . _ . ’
At West Liberty, with the B. C. R. * N.E.R 
At Grinnell, with Central Iowa R. R.
At Deb Moines, with D. M. A F. D. R, R.
At Council Bluffs, with Union Pacific R.R. 
At OMAHA,'with B. A Mo. R. R.R. (in Neb.) 
At Columbus Junction, with B.C.R.A N.R.R 
At Ottumwa, with Central Iowa .R. R,: W„

St. L. A Pac., and U. R awl Q. R. Rds. ’ _ 
At KEOKUK, with Tol., Peo. A War.} Wab.,St.

Louis A Pac., and St. L., Keo. A N. W. IL Rus.
At CAMERON, With H.SL J. R. R,
At Atchison, wit h Atch,,Topeka A SantaFe;

Atch. A Neb., awl Cen, Br. V,RB.Rilt _
At Leavenworth, with Union Pac. and Kan. 

Cent R. Rds, „ .
At Kansas City, with all Unes for the West 

and Southwest

purpose* (and the immense passenger business 
of this line warranting ft), wearepieasedtoan- 
nounco that this Company runs Fullman Paines ------------------- ----- ------ _ ..„

PULLMAN PAUACE CARS are run through to PEOEIA. »E8 MOINES,COUNCIL. BLUF®, KANSAS CITV. ATCHISON, *n<l*LEAVENWOBTH. ’
Tickets via thia tine, known m the ‘Great Rook Island Route," axe soH by 

all Ticket Agon ta in th* Uni ted State* and Canada.
Fer information no* obtainable at your home office, address, „

‘ XU XU CABLE, 23. ST. JOltN,
Vk*liMH<*taMGM«nlM»l*(<r> ®a*U7fcto»»4I**«gw^j^
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“Scarcely a eating would pas* without 
some manifeo .ttion of thelspnitual gift#; 
sometimes by prophecy given in an un­
known tongue, i &, unkaoww the person 
through whose powers of sp&ob-it wm 
uttered; when another one through the 
gift of tne spirit would interpret the same 
to the understanding of those present. 
Sometimes an afflicted brother or sister 
would call for the ministration of theElders 
by the laying on of hands, while one of the 
number would voice the united prayer of 
all present for the healing of the afflicted 
one, commanding in the name of Jesus 
Christ, the disease to depart, when lo it 
wm even so, and the afflicted one would be 
there made whole. Not only in meetings 
were these things done,but in innumerable 
instances in the home family circle; the 
blind were made to see, the deaf to hear, 
the lame to leap for joy, etc. Thus was 
fulfilled before our eyes the promise of the 
Elders; for verily did “these signs follow 
those who believe?"

^What wonder we shouted Eureka! Was 
not here enough to confirm and enable us to 
say, verily Goa hath ordained and sent us 
a prophet to open up a new dispensation, by 
the restoration of the unadulterated gospel 
of Jesus?

“Such were my feelings, and doubtless 
were those of hundreds of others, who, 
though honestat heart and willing to be­
come as children, that they might enter 
into the kingdom of heaven, could not just- 
lv be classed with the foolish or illiterate. 
You will bear in mind that this was sever­
al years before the tiny raps at Hydesville 
announced to a sleeping world the approach 
of a glorious era m the world’s history, 
when we should hold. sweet converaewith 
dear ones gone before!

“The conclusion arrived at, at that time 
must seem legitimate and inevitable to a 
candid . and inquiring mind. You, my 
friend, may well believe me when I tell you 
that from the first dawn of the spiritual 
light at the little village of Hydesville, I 
became deeply interested and watched with 
eager interest the rapid spread and increas­
ing brightness thereof; and ere long I dis­
covered that ‘these signs’ followed also 
the believers in angel communications, 
though not within the narrow limits of 
the Mormon church. The leaders of the 
church also saw this, and that something 
must of necessity be done to preserve their 
exclusive claims from the world at large, 
or their influence would soon be lost, and 
the church as a body would cease to exist. 
They felt compelled to admit the truth of 
spiritual communication, and the accom­
panying gifts and powers, among those out­
side the pale of the church; for to do other- 
wise in the face of indisputable evidence, 
would have been madness, and they chose 
the wiser part, of declaring all such to be 
the work of Satan, who now, as ever before, 
seeks to counterfeit the works of God and 
his chosen servants, that he may deceive 
the very elect, draw them from the fold of 
Christ and lead them down to perdition. 
Solemn warnings were often uttered and 
reiterated, ‘beware of Spiritualism and its 
mediums as you value your soul’s salva­
tion? Time was only a few years ago, that 
a spirit medium would have been in great 
danger of personal injury, in exercising his 
gift in Utah; and I fear from some hints 
that I have heard, that some did get cut 
short. But thanks to an overruling Provi­
dence and Uncle Sam, that day is past 
Really, what a convenient fellow this devil 
is! He is as indispensable in the theologi­
cal world with its machinery, as is steam 
a motor to the engine.

“You may probably be ready to ask, what 
I think of Joseph Smith the founder of 
Mormonism, after the experience I have 
had and the means of observation at my 
command for many years.

“In brief, I will say, my conclusion is this: 
I believe him to have been a medium pos­
sessed of both clairvoyant and clairaudient 
powers; and by nomeans a wilful impostor, 
though with some traits of character which 
might justly be considered faults or fail­
ings. Ambition and egotism were promt 
nent among these. .

“That he had communication with spirits 
who appeared and talked with him, I have 
abundant reason to believe, and that they 
represented themselves tobe such as he de­
clared, I find no reason to doubt; though I 
do seriously doubt their having been really 
the personages they led him to believe they 
were. Such instances of false personation 
by spirits are by no' means uncommon, as 
you must be well aware. I doubt whether, 
Smith really comprehended the nature of 
his powers and strange experiences, but 
his ambition and egotism lea him to con­
clude that he was a specially chosen instru­
ment in the hands of God to reform the 
world; and he at once sought to become 
the nucleus bf a grand army off chosen peo­
ple, to whom, through him and him only, 
could the word of the Lord come.”

My own views of the case do not material­
ly differ from those of this letter. It is 
sufficiently clear to me that, in its origin, 
the Mormon faith came from the exercise 
of a mediumistic capacity, the action of 
which was but very imperfectly under­
stood. The vision of angels was a reality 
to Smith and not :a pretense. Of this, the 
honest simplicity of .■his narrative is in it­
self a strong proof; besides, the visions de- 
scribed, in almost all their features, har­
monize with those now so well known 
among Spiritualists.

But it is evident that pretense and fraud 
soon began to creep into the experiences 
of Smith and his coadjutors; how far 
these mingled with what is claimed in re­
gard to the discovery of the gold plates, 
their translation, and the final disposition 
of the same, 1 will not attempt to decide. 
It is quite possible, however, that the fraud 
was not wholly confined to, those in the 
mortal body, but that it may have been 
some of the “Diakka” of our genial and un­
ambitious seer, A. J. Davis, who stood at 
the invisible helm of affairs, not only then 
but through much of the subsequent his­
tory of the self-styled “saints.” At any 
rate, it is clear tsatthe simplicity and earn­
estness of the primitive prophet s, soon be­
gan to be obscured by schemes of ambition 
and arbitrary rule, whilst corruption of 
doctrine went on with rapid strides, until 
at length under the rule of Brigham Young 
in Utah,the system became largely a min- 
glingof arrogance and absurdity,as we shall 
presently see. But certainly, the primitive 
Mormonism described by my correspond­
ent, harmonizes much more perfectly with 
the primitive Christianity of Jesus and his 
apostles, than does the prevailing ortho 
doxy of the day; and the Mormon preach­
ers nave ever been ready to show that such 
is tho case, especially in debates with the 
ministers, though it has been but seldom 
that they could secure such an opponent in 
public.

The great secret of the early success of 
Mormonism undoubtedly finds ite most sat. 
isfactory explanation in the fact that, 
largely involved in-the movement, was a 
knowledge and use of some of tiie phenome­
nal facta and laws of modem Spiritualism,

OoottaMd fm Bi# h«.
ward from one stage to another of their 
journey. As spring opened they formed tem- 
nwary settlementa,putting in hasty crop# of 
Sain, that those who were to follow aught. 
be provided for. • i t

It wa# at about this time that what might 
be called a severe calamity befell them; it 
wm a requisition from government made 
upon them for 500 troops to go on through 
the wilderness and take part in the Mexican 
war then in progress. Thus wm taken from 
them the very flower and strength of the com­
pany, and at a time when these strong men 
were especially needed to provide for, and 
protect them against; the dangers of their 
perilous journey. . „ /

It was not until the 24th of'July, 1847, 
that the pioneers of this company entered 
the Salt Lake valley and at once fixed up­
on it m the future home of the “saints." 
Henceforth this was to be a Zion for the 
modern Israel, toward which the footsteps 
of the faithful from all parts of the world 
should tend. And here the great body of 
this people have dwelt to this day, enjoying, 
for the most part, a good degree of prosper- 
ityand happiness. .

From the very first, systematic land act­
ive missionary efforts have been put forth, 
extending to almost every part of the civi­
lized world and with a degree of success 
that may well astonish the thoughtful ob­
server. At the time of my sojourn in the 
valley (1863 4), probably not less than 100 
missionaries were employed in foreign 
parts and from 3,000 to 5,000 converts were 
being annually imported into Utah.

HOW TO SOLVE THE PROBLEM.
Honestly and justly I mean—this Is the 
great, the puzzling question; indeed it can­
not be rightly answered excepting by those 
who are cognizant of spiritual ideas and 
facts as they are being revealed by the Spir­
itualism of to day. I do not say, however, 
that even with this help such movements 
can be fully understood, but Spiritualists 
can certainly make a nearer approach to a 
rational solution than can others. Wishing 
in the present instance to obtain all possi­
ble aids to my efforts, I presented the es­
pecial point of inquiry by letter to a friend 
in Utah—once a Mormon Elder and foreign 
missionary, but now a come-outer,a reform­
er, and an out-spoken Spiritualist. His re­
ply was so satisfactory and exhaustive that 
I determined to give his letter nearly en­
tire, as being far more satisfactory than 
anything I myself could offer. It is as fol­
lows:

“Many times have I !heard persons ex­
press their minds like this: ‘I am surpris­
ed to find so many well educated and re­
fined persons who rank as Mormons! How 
in ths world such could embrace Mormon- 

. ism, is a mystery I cannot fathom.’ To 
such I reply: Mormonism in its original 
state, was not the Mormonism of to day. 
To me. it is no wonder that many, very 
many intelligent and noble-hearted men 
and women with their whole souls embrac­
ed it as the truth of heaven and drank 
freely of its spirit. -

“What was it, but the unadulterated doc­
trine of Christ and his apostles? That, and 
that only. Faith, repentance and baptism 
for tne remission of sins, followed by the 
laying on of hands, for the reception of the 
Ho’y Ghost, which the candidates were 
assured should give them a knowledge of 
the truth, and they should no longer be 
groping their way in the darkness of doubt 
and uncertainty. They were also assured 
that the gifts and powers pertaining to the 
gospel, as exemplified In the lives and min­
istration ol Christ and hi* apostles, among 
which was the power to heal the sick by 
the laying on of hands, should be made 
manifest in these last days among true be­
lievers as a witness that the gospel was 
truly restored to earth in its pristine purity.

“While the Christian world, with few ex­
ceptions, laid no claim to such powers, de­
claring that those things usually styled 
miracles, were only permitted In the days 
of early Christianity, for the purpose of es­
tablishing its divinity, since which they 
were not permitted to be; here came the 
Mormon Elder with the Bible in his hand 
or at his tongues end, quoting the words of 
Christ: ‘Go ye into all the world and preach 
the gospel to every creature; he that be- 
lieveth and is baptized shall be saved, and 
he that believeth not shall be damned. And 
these signs shall follow those that believe,’ 
etc.

‘“Now,’ says he, ‘which is right? ’The 
religious teachers tell you these things 
were only for the early believers, and have 
no place, nor must they be looked for in 
this our day, while Christ distinctly and 
emphatically said they were to follow .all 
believers throughout the world.

‘“The truth is here; the so-called Chris­
tian sects have all gone astray—apostatized 
from the truth as it is in Jesus—have be­
come lifted up in the pride of their hearts, 

. and while they worship in costly churches 
and array themselves in gay apparel, they 
are .those of whom the. Scriptures speak, 
‘having a form of godliness, but'denying 
the power thereof.’

“‘Rut know ye that God hath seen fit to 
restore the pure gospel in these last days; 
and in answer to the fervent prayers of an 
humble and illiterate youth, whose mind 
was not cramped by the creeds and dogmas 
of the times, hath caused his servants Peter, 
James and John to appear to him, to lay 
hands on and ordain him as His chosen 
servant, to open a new dispensation and 
restore the gospel to earth in all its original 
purity. That young man was Joseph Smith. 
Having been chosen and ordained under 
his hands, I stand, here and ask you to be­
lieve on the Lord Jesus Christ, to repent 
and be baptized for the remission of your 
sins; have hands laid upon your heads by 

. those ordained under this new dispensa­
tion. for the gift of the Holy Ghost, which 
shall bring past things toyour remembrance, 
and show you things to come; and I prom­
ise you in the name of the Lord, whose 
servant I am, that the spirit shall bear you. 
witness and you shall know for yourselves 
the truth whereof I speak.’

“Now I ask what fairer terms could be 
offered, what more simple means devised 
by which to test the truth, and lift the veil 
of doubt and darkness, which had so long 
hung like a pall over the theological world 
resulting in little short of chaos ?

“What wonder that many listened with 
deep interest, and gladly embraced such an 
opportunity to test the truth, that perad­
venture they might bask in the sunshine 
of knowledge, concerning heaven and im­
mortality?

“Nothing seems rpore natural; and many 
like myself accepted the invitation, with 
what results, it must be my purpose briefly 
here to make known to you. Remember in 
those days the believers loved truth for 
truth’s sake, their hearts beat in unison, 
and their love for one another was pure 
and heavenly. When they met to worship 
there wm unity of spirit, and when as one 
they knelt in worship there wm a fervency 
ifi their prayers, which seemed to lift earth 
to heaven, or draw heaven down to earth.

especially that of the gift of healing by 
will-force and the laying on of hands. It 
was not then understood that this is by the 
action of general law; so it was quite 
natural that both the Elders themselves 
and the people whom they addressed, should 
have regarded this as a proof of super­
natural power and of especial authority to 
declare new revelations of the truth.

As a result of my large opportunities for 
observing, I am satisfied that a large pro­
portion of the Mormon preacbershavebeen 
persons more or less largely endowed with 
what we now call medium power—however 
imperfectly understood and unwisely used 
—and that thi# fact accounts largely for 
the extended success of their efforts. It is 
a far better explanation than that which 
attributes the growth mainly to an extra­
ordinary prevalence of ignorance and stu­
pidity among the people; for I can assert 
with confidence, that the Mormons as a 
whole, though many of them sadly deficient 
in a right education of their faculties, are 
yet in point of general good sense and na­
tive capacity, fully up to the average of the 
middle and laboring classes to which most 
of them belong.

From what has thus been said, it will 
readily be seen why it is that the Mormon 
leaders, though perfectly willing and glad 
to cope with the popular orthodoxy, are yet 
exceedingly shy of the growing Spiritual­
ism. It comes too near them—in its phe­
nomenal ‘facts I mean—and threatens to 
tear down their walls of exclusiveness in 
this respect. There is but one short ea;- 
cathedra way of escape, a method thus ex­
pressed in the oft repeated language of 
Brigham Young himself; “The Lord never 
ordains any important work, but, the devil 
gets up an imitation; the ‘Latter Pay Saints’ 
works are wonders of the Loid; those of the 
spiritual mediums are the devil’s imita­
tions.” >

The Mormon leaders are doubtless right 
in dreading an intelligent Spiritualism in 
their midst, for it is that which even now, 
under the name of a Reform Party is sap­
ping the very foundations of- their power. 
As a significant fact bearing upon this 
point, I will state that during my six 
months sojourn in Utah, not even the 
slightest intimation was given that it 
would be agreeable to "the Saints’’ to hear 
from me in public, although my ministerial 
profession, as well as my Spiritualism, was 
well understood. And yet it was something 
like an established custom that any passing 
Christian minister should be invited to oc­
cupy the platform of the Tabernacle, the 
Mormon Elders being careful to retain an 
opportunity of replying to what might be 
said. An occurrence of this kind happened 
when I was present in the congregation, 
the incited preacher being a Presbyterian 
D. D-nin his way East from California. I 
can assure the reader that it was a pretty 
close investigation that followed this man’s 
sermon, though quite good naturedly done.

As to myself,all theopportunity of preach­
ing I enjoyed was in private conversation, 
mainly because of my Spiritualism as I 
have reason to think.

AN EXPOSURE

Two Dishonest Mediums Caught at their 
Tricks.

THEY ABE ARRESTED, PLEAD aTOMT, AND 
ABE FINED.'

That notorious character and most con­
summate humbug, Mrs.Elsie "Crindle," hM 
again been exposed in her efforts to impose 
fraudulent materializations upon Spiritual­
ists; this time at Clyde, Ohio, the home of 
A. B. French, the distinguished spiritual 
lecturer. She had been there previously, 
and even then her stances were not by any 
means.satisfactory, being regarded by the 
prominent Spiritualists of Clyde, as the 
basest impositions. After this exposure, 
what can fraud-defenders say in her behalf ? 
The Clyde (OMoJl^stffprte/of Nov. 3rd., 
says:
Considerable space is given on our local page 
to an account of an exposure of pretended 
spiritualistic mediums, made in this village 
last Saturday night The matter is one in 
which our people have felt a large amount 
of interest, hence the pains taken to get as 
complete an account as was possible. One 
feature of the matter should be distinctly 
understood, and proper credit given for it. 
namely, that the entire investigation and 
exposure was made by parties who are 
themselves believers in the spiritualistic 
doctrine. The effect of the exposure will 
be to bring more or less popular ridicule on 
this form of belief, hence the greater 
amount of credit due those who have made 
it, regardless of this consequence to them­
selves. In doing what they have, their 
own honesty has been demonstrated, and 
their good will toward people of other be­
liefs. From an orthodox standpoint, we 
desire to put on record this conviction of 
the sincerity of those Spiritualists of Clyde 
who were concerned in the exposure, and 
of the obligation their fellow citizens are 
under to them for having been thus con­
cerned.

It was fortunate chat the affair occurred 
at the home of people so utterly beyond 
and above all suspicion of collusion with 
the professed mediums, as are Mr. and.Mra. 
Dennis Drown.

' The following, taken from the local col­
umns of the Enterprise, gives a plain and 
concise statement of the whole exposure:

Saturday evening a very small circle 
gathered, as none of the local Spiritualists 
would make any effort to induce other peo­
ple to attend what they themselves believ­
ed to be.a fraud and swindle. The opening 
act was the performance^ the young man, 
Harry Crindle, of some of his manifesta­
tions. For this purpose a curtain had been 
drawn, previous to the assembling of the 
circle, across a corner of the audience room, 
reaching perhaps half-way to the ceiling. 
In front of this curtain, when the stance 
opened, the young man seated himself with 
Mr. Geo. E. Sweetland close at hi# side. 
The manifestations consisted in the throw­
ing of bells, horns, tambourine, and other 
things over the top of the curtain from be­
hind into the circle, these throwings being 
the alleged work of spirits.

The house of Mr. Drown has along porch 
on tiie east front, from which windows 
open into the rooms used. Through one of 
these windows Messrs. Chester and Wm. A. 
Hunter, who had stationed themselves out­
side for the purpose, saw hands reach from 
the circle-room through an aperture in the 
curtain, take the things bom off a table 
{ilaced there, and throw them upward and 
orward into the room, thus performing 

the trick# for which the spirits were getting 
credit. Mr. Hunter is confident that he 
saw both aright and a left hand used in 
tMs way. Thus were these manifestations 
accounted for.

Presently the materializing began, tbe 
same rooms being used, with everything 
prepared as above described for Friday 
evening. Messrs. Hunter now took, their 
stations at a window on the north side of 
house, which gave them a view into the 
room used m acabinet The light from the 
circle-room shone through the transom 
above the door, and also through apertures 
in and at the sides of the curtain. Them­
selves standing in the darkness outside, by 
this light they could see every move made 
by the medium. They saw her dress and un- 
drew, change masks and costumes for the 
different characters, and appear at the ap­
erture in the curtain representingone ma­
terialized spirit after another. The proof 
was positive and convincing, there could be 
no doubt about it—the whole performance 
was deception and a fraud. Leaving his 
brother to keep up the watch on the out­
side. Mr. Wm. A. Hunter quietly entered 
the room, and with an apology for his late­
ness joined the circle. As the manifesta­
tions progressed, he professed deep interest 
and absorption. When the actress of the 
previous evening. Julia Dean Hayne, ap­
peared, she came clear out of the cabinet, 
walked to the head of the circle, caressed 
oneor two persons there, then returned be­
hind the table, beckoned first young Grindle 
and then Mr. Hunter to her, and began 
gently stroking the latter’s head. This was 
hts opportunity. He seized the spiritual­
ized actress by the arm, found it a good 
healthy arm of flesh and blood and held on 
to keep her in view of the remainder of the 
circle. At this moment young Crindle, who 
was sitting in charge of the light as on the 
Srevious evening, sprang forward, struck 

Er. Hunter a blow in the neck, and by 
keeping up a struggle compelled him to let 
go his hold of the woman, who quickly 
got back into the cabinet room,shutting and 
fastening or holding the door. By this 
time the disenchantment was complete, the 
stance was broken up, and the whole mat­
ter speedily made known to those present.

Mr. Hunter then started up town to pro­
cure a warrant for the arrest of Mrs. Crin­
dle and her son. In his absence of an 
hour they got out of the house. It was now 
ten o’clock, and a watch was kept on the 
10:15 train west, but they did not get off on 
that. Circumstances led the officers, Con­
stable Hamden and night watchman Gan- 
ter, to think they might be in the house of 
Mr. Geo. Sweetland, corner of Forest and 
Main. Thither they went, and learned 
from Mrs. Sweetland that neither Mrs. 
Crindle nor her son were there, but that 
the paraphernalia they had used was in the 
house. This was reported by the officers 
to Mr. Hunter, who was waiting outside. 
The three then entered the house and asked 
to see the things. Mr. Sweetland produced 
them, with the remark that her husband 
had said “not to let Mr. Hunter know they 
were there, but let the poor devils go.” Mr. 
Hunter directed the officers to take charge 
of the things and carry them to the Mayor’s 
office, which was done. The lot consisted 
of seven masks or false faces, a flexible 
rubber tube about five feet long, a lot of 
white gauze, and a silk and satin vesture 
with a string of cheap imitation diamonds 
attached—the same worn by Mrs. Crindle 
in personating the spirit of Julia Dean 
Hayne at the moment of being arrested in 
her career of deception. The large tin 
horn, a music box, tamborine, two bells, 
two' wigs, and some other things were 
brought into the Mayor’s office Sunday and 
Monday.

Sunday the parties were arrested in Fre­
mont, whither they bad walked, by Marshal 
Hocke on a telegram from Marshal Nune- 
viiler, and about dark Sunday evening the 
latter brought them back to Clyde. The 
young man was lodged that night In the 
calaboose, and Mrs. Crindle securely locked 
in an upper room of the Nichols House. 
Monday morning they were arraigned be- 
fore Mayor Bush, on a charge of seeking 
to obtain money under false pretenses. E. 
B. Williams, Esq., of Fremont, appeared as 
their counsel, and by his advice they 
pleaded guilty, and were fined S5 each and 
costs, about $23 in all. They did not have 
money to pay the fine, but Mrs. Crindle 
pledged a gold watch as security, which 
with their “working tools’’ yet remains in 
possession of the Mayor.

The woman Crindle is an adroit, bold op­
erator, with* an assurance that nothing can 
abash. She is a splendid singer, and it is 
manifest that she possesses great powers 
of ventriloquism. Her son, if he be her son, 
promises to become an adept equal to her­
self. unless he shall take to some more hon­
est and honorable way of earning a living. 
Their trunks were left at Fremont when 
they came here, which in connection with 
other things, makes it plain that the masks, 
wigs, and clothing used by her in dressing 
for the various characters were all carried 
concealed about her person. It is not prob­
able that any exposure would or could have 
been made except through the efforts of the 
Spiritualists themselves. The Messrs. Hun­
ter, both of whom as Is well known are 
pronounced Spiritualists, were warmly en­
dorsed and encouraged in their action by all 
the Spiritualists of the village. Whatever 
may be the effect of the exposure, the cred­
it belongs to those people who have thus 
demonstrated the sincerity of their own be-' 
lief in Spiritualism, and an honest desire 
to protect themselves and others from im­
position.

When the matter became noised through 
the village, which was pretty thoroughly 
done on Sunday, much interest and some 
excitement were manifested. People were 
flocking to the Mayor’s office Sunday after­
noon and evening, and all day Monday, to 
have a look at the captured implements of 
deception, and to talk the matter over. The 
J prisoners were brought In Monday morning 
or examination an hour before the appoint­

ed time, and the proceedings were very 
brief, so that a great crowd at that time 
was avoided. As a topic of conversation 
and comment, the matter has been kept 
lively all the week, and appears likely to 
be some time longer.

A CARD TO THE PUBLIC.
. The undersigned, citizens of Clyde, who 
were conversant with the circumstances 
attending the late exposure of the fraudu­
lent performances of. Elsie and Harry 
Grindle, professed Spiritualist mediums, 
have read the account of the exposure print­
ed in the Clyde Enterprise of this date. We 
beheve this account to be substantially cor­
rect, in all particulars, and endorse It as an 
expression of our knowledge and senti­
ments in regard to Elsie and Harry Grindle, 
and of their operations here.

J. B. Bnsb, Mayor: Z. Perin, Ex-Mayor; 
Mrs. F. A. Perfo, Postmistress; Chester 
Hunter, Wm. A. Hunter, Mr. andMrs.Den- 
nis Drown, J. W. Wolcott, a A. Bell, Mrs. 
John McGrew, T. Nuneviller, Marshal; N. 
R. Ganter, Hight Police.
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Frank Lodeke, of Trenton, Ill., struck 

William Woerners a playful blow on the 
side of the head with his open hand, which 
broke his neck, and he died instantly.

NEURALGIA,
Nervous Irritability. Sciatica and all painful Nervous Dis­
eases.—A treatise by a well known physician, a specialist on 
these subjects, concludes as follows: “Neuralgia Is one of the 
most painful of diseases, and is attended with more or less 
nervous irritation. Sciatica is also a form of neuralgia, and 
all painful nervous diseases come under that name. Neu­
ralgia means net va ache, rad therefore you can suffer with 
neuralgia in ray part of the body, aa the nerves are sup­
plied to every part.
I have for many years closely studied the cause of neu­

ralgia, and We nature of We nervous system, with the many 
diseases Wat It Is subject to. and havefound by actual experi­
ence Wat the true and primary cause of neuralgia Is poverty 
of We ne rvous fluid—it becomes Impoverished and poor, and 
in some cases starved, not because We patient does not eat, 
but because what Is eaten Is not appropriated to the nervous 
system: there are many causes for this, but Dr. C. W. Ben­
son’s Celery and Chamomile Bills have in my hands proved a 
perfect remedy for this condition rad these diseases.

Sold by all druggists. Brice, 50 cents a box. Depot, 136 
North Eutaw St. Baltimore. Md. By mail, two boxes for 
*1. or six boxes for #8 60. to ray address.
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DR. C. W. BENSON’S

SKIN CURE
Is Warranted to Cure 

ECZEMA, TETTERS, HUMORS, 
INFLAMMATION, MILK CRUST, 

ALL ROUCH SCALY ERUPTIONS,

&
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a

DISEASES OF HAIR AND SCALP, IS 
SCROFULA ULCERS, PIMPLES and

TENDER ITCHINGSona’lpartaof tho ]"*
body. 14 makes tho skin -white, soft and smooth: 
removes tan ar.d freckles, and is ths BEST toilet 
dressing in THE WORLD. Elegantly put up, two 
bottles in ono package, oonsiating of both internal 
■nd external treatment.
JUlflrstclssadruggiatahnvoit. Prioegl.nerurakag..

MRS. LYDIA E. PINKHAM. OF LYNN, MASS.
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LYDIA E. PINKHAM’S
VEGETABLE COMTOOT).

. Is a Positive Cure
for all thoae Painful CMUfhlat: an# WtataiMI 

■oconttaoa to our heat feaala population.
Itwill cure entirely the worst form otFemale Com. 

plaint*, all ovarian troubles,Inflammation and Ulcer* 
tion, Falling rad Displacements, and the consequent 
Spinal Weakness, rad is particularly adapted to the 
Change ot Ute. ■

Itwill dissolve rad expel tumors from the uterneln 
an early stage of development. Bis tendency tocan- 
coroushuniorstlierelechecked very speedily by Ite use.

It removes faintness, flatulency, deatroysall craving 
for stimulants, rad relleveeweakneaa ot the stomach. 
It cures Bloating, Headaches, Nervous Prostration, 
General Debility, Sleeplessness, Depression rad Indi- 
Beetion. j

That feeling ot bearing down, causing pain, weight 
rad backache, is always permanently cured by Us use.

It will at all times and under all circumstances act in 
harmony with thelaws that govern the female system. 
. For th e cure of Kidney Complaints ot either Sts this 

Compound Is unsurpassed.
LYDIA E. PINKHAM’S VEGETABLE COM- 

POUND is prepared at-233 and 235 Western Avenue, 
Lynn,Mas*. Price#!. Stxbottlesfor#5, Santbyinali 
in the form ot pill*, also in tho form of lorenges, on 
reocipt-of price, $1 per box for either. Mra Pinkham 
freely answers all letters of inquiry. Send for pusph. 
let. Address as above. Mention thin Paper.

No family shoWM bo without LYDIA E, PINKHAM'* 
LIFER PILLS. They cure" constipation, biliousness, 
•and torpidity of tho liver. 25 cento per box.

*3-Sold by all Druggists. ~G*
614 33

DOCTOR YOURSELF.
With Nature’# Element*. The greateat invention yet. 
Magnetized Electric Capsicum Plasters. Four 
In one. Will positively euro weaker lamebocke. Skmmak 
ttem,Seuraiaia.Se'i<t, Liver anti Sliney trouble!. era 
be used a* Electric Seii without sticking. Thousands sold, 
rad not one failure resorted. Price, ny mail. #1 per Mir. 
Dr 8. J. DAMON, Lowell. Mass. A book,True ■ Guide to Health, sent tree. -  81 4 1«B

mrs. m. c. friesner,
VITAL ELECTRO-MAGNETIC HEALER,

SI N. BHELDOS STREET, CHICAGO.
OFFICE HOURS: 9 to 12 A.M., 8 to5 P.M.

81711
K A Chromo, Shells. Comte, Boses, Scrolls. &c., cards 
vv name on Incase 10c. Potter & Co., Montowese, CL 

818 812 - ’

KHASE
PIANOFORTES. 

UNEQUALLED in 

Toie, ToncL lortat, ail Durability. 
WILLIAM KNABE & CO.

Nos. 904 snd 206 West Baltimore Street,Baltimore. 
No. 113 Fifth Avenue, New York.

■ ■ THE
PH1UISOPHY OF CREATION,

Unfolding tiie Laws of the Progressive Develop 
ment of Nature, and Embracing the rniloso- 

■ phy of Man, Spirit, and the Spirit-world.
Br THOMAS PAINE, ____ „

TOOTH THZ HUIB or HOJUOX «. WOOD, MOXO*

Tills la a very valuable UtUework, which has bad a large cir­
culation, and u deserving ot many thus* as large.

Price, in cloth, 60 centa^porta^^Hceata; paper, J5 cents, 
.".For sale, wbolewSerad’reuS, by theKaueto-Paix*- 

aopmeinFcsMataMoHouaz, Chicago.




